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COLLECTION SUMMARY  
 
This collection features the correspondence of the families of Giles Richards, pioneer textile 
manufacturer, and Colonel Alfred West Gilbert, a citizen and public official of the city of 
Cincinnati. It includes a series of Civil War letters written by Colonel Gilbert to his wife during 
his period of service in the Union army as an officer of the 39th Ohio Volunteer Infantry.  These 
letters led to a correspondence with Adolph Gilbert, a son of Colonel Gilbert.   
 
 
PROVENANCE OF THE COLLECTION 
 
This collection of manuscripts was discovered in the attic of Elland, the Richards farmhouse on 
the Great Miami River near Venice, Ohio.  The house had been built in 1832 by Giles Richards 
and had been occupied by succeeding generations of the Richards family for almost one 
hundred years.    Miami University Libraries acquired the papers from the Moore family, a 
subsequent owner of Elland. 
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BIOGRAPHICAL INFORMATION 
 
Giles Richards (1792-1876) 
 
Giles Richards was one of ten children born to Giles and Sarah Richards, but only six lived to 
maturity – Sarah, Giles, Amos Adams, Charles, George Thomas and Mary Elizabeth.  His father 
manufactured cotton and wool cards in Cambridge, Massachusetts and was a friend and 
associate of many prominent Boston citizens.   
 
During the War of 1812, Giles and his brother, Amos Adams Richards, worked in Rhode Island, 
manufacturing buttons and saddlery ornaments for the army.  By 1816, they had settled in 
Cincinnati, where they worked as agents for the New York Card Manufacturing Company until 
1822.  Most of the business was in connection with the river trade, working with Ohio firms, 
eastern manufacturers, and New Orleans and Louisville traders.   
 
Richards’ work introduced him to many prominent citizens of Cincinnati, including Nicholas 
Longworth.  He married Eleanor Hankinson Lloyd (born March 2, 1799) on November 1, 1820.  
Their first child, Elizabeth Adams Richards, was born August 2, 1821.  Three other children 
followed: Ellen, Henry, and George. 
 
From 1822 to 1835, Richards operated the Colerain Flouring Mill, the Colerain Cotton Mill, the 
Fulling and Carding Mill, the Giles Richards Store Concern, a Dye House, a Tavern House, and a 
Saw Mill in Colerain, a small village near the northwest corner of Colerain Township on the bank 
of the Great Miami River, about sixteen miles northwest of Cincinnati.  He retired from active 
business in 1835. 
 
In May 1828, Richards bought about 150 acres on the Great Miami River, which was known as 
the “Stone Mill” farm.  He built a home there, which he named “Elland,” in honor of his wife 
and daughter.   
 
Richards was a trustee of both the Farmers’ and the Ohio Female College at College Hill in 
Hamilton County.  He also was a member of the syndicate which laid out the village of Dunlap.  
He promoted the railroad, was a real estate syndicator, belonged to a number of scientific and 
artistic societies in Cincinnati, was an active member of the New Jerusalem Church, was a 
trustee of several charitable organizations in Cincinnati, and was a successful winemaker and 
grower of grapes.  He also served as treasurer and president of the Venice Bridge Company, 
which involved him in the construction and operation of the Colerain, Oxford & Brookville 
Turnpike.   
 
After the Civil War, Richards ceased his active community involvement.  He died in 1876. 
 



Gilbert-Richards Papers 
Page 3 

 

Alfred West Gilbert (1816-1900) 
 
Alfred West Gilbert was born in Philadelphia on February 9, 1816.  He was the grandson of 
Robert and Mary Gilbert, who came to America circa 1799 and settled in Philadelphia, and the 
second son of Joseph and Sarah Crocker Gilbert.   
 
Joseph and Sarah Gilbert had five sons (Thomas, Alfred, Henry, Joseph, and Charles) and one 
daughter, Lucy Gilbert McGonegil, who survived to adulthood.  Another daughter, Sarah, died 
at about two years of age.  The last years of Joseph’s life were spent on his fruit farm, Westland, 
in Sycamore Township, near Reading, Ohio, until his death circa 1851.   
 
The Gilberts were members of the Society of Friends, or Quakers.  Joseph established the first 
umbrella manufactory in Philadelphia.  In 1826, the Gilberts moved to Cincinnati, where after a 
time Joseph found employment with Nicholas Longworth in his grounds on Pike Street.  For a 
time, the Gilberts lived in Robert Owen’s community in New Harmony, Indiana, but returned to 
Cincinnati. 
 
As a young man in the late 1830s, Alfred Gilbert worked as a surveyor and was active in local 
political and religious matters.  In 1840, he met Elizabeth Richards, the daughter of Giles 
Richards, the president of the Colerain Oxford & Brookville Turnpike.   They were married on 
May 17, 1848.  
 
In 1841, Gilbert traveled West to Iowa.  When he returned, he began working in the office of 
S.P. Chase of the law firm of Chase & Ball and attending the law school of Cincinnati College.  
After being admitted to the bar in 1844-1845, he opened an office and practiced law.  During 
this time, he made and published a sectional map of Hamilton County, showing every farm with 
the names of the owners and number of acres, all roads and streams, schoolhouses, and towns 
in the county.  It was the first map of its kind ever published in Hamilton County.   
 
Chase suggested that Gilbert create a map that showed the title to each tract of land from the 
original owner, John Cleves Symmes, who bought all the lands included in Hamilton County 
from the government.  While making the map, Gilbert slipped into his old career as a surveyor 
and civil engineer.  In 1846, he surveyed and superintended the construction of the Bank Lick 
Turnpike in Kentucky from Covington towards the county seat, Independence.  In 1847, he 
surveyed and superintended the building of the Dover and Minerva Turnpike in Mason County, 
Kentucky, and other roads in that area.   
 
On February 21, 1849, Gilbert was elected as city surveyor by the Cincinnati City Council.  Later 
that year, he became the city’s civil engineer.  In this role, he prepared plans for all public work 
of the city.  During his term as city engineer, many large projects were initiated, including the 
establishment of a new system of water works and a general sewer system for the city. 
 
In July 1861, Gilbert was one of a group to raise the 39th Ohio Volunteer Regiment.  Entering St. 
Louis, the regiment was the first Ohio regiment to ever enter Missouri. Gilbert served as an 
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officer of the 39th Ohio Volunteer Infantry until he was seriously injured in the second battle of 
Corinth (October 4, 1862).   
 
After serving the city of Cincinnati for more than 20 years, Gilbert gave up public life in 1873, 
retiring to the old Richards homestead, which he had bought.  The couple retired to Elland; 
Elizabeth Richards Gilbert passed away in Kansas City, Missouri on October 31, 1884.  Gilbert 
continued to supervise the farm at Elland until his death in Cincinnati on October 24, 1900.  
Gilbert Avenue in Cincinnati was named for him. 
 
Alfred West and Elizabeth Richards Gilbert had four children:  

 Warren Gilbert (1849-1866) 

 Mary Adan Gilbert (1850-1920), who married Edwin J. Carpenter (1850-1926) in 1874 

 Adolph West Gilbert (1852-1939), who married Sarah M. Nelson (1859-1922) in 1880.  
They had one child, Edwin Carpenter Gilbert, who was born in 1881. 

 Eleanor Holmes Gilbert (1855-1951), who married Clemmons T. Allcutt (1855-1921) in 
1879.  They had five children: Isabella Elizabeth “Daisy” (1880-1969); Mary Adan Temple 
(1882-1976); Eleanor May (born 1886); Rowena (born 1888); and Clementine Colledge 
(1895-1958). 

 
SCOPE AND CONTENTS OF THE COLLECTION 
 
Letters, diaries, account books, corporation records, early surveys of Cincinnati, and ephemera 
can be found in the collection.   
 
Correspondence 
 
Letters in the collection contain information about the river trade in the early 19th century, the 
early textile manufacturing, southern Ohio, home and community life from 1830 to 1862, social 
and economic conditions in New Orleans and the new countries of Illinois and Iowa in the 1830s 
and 1840s, Cincinnati social life during the 1840s, and life at the Ohio Female College in the 
1850s. 
 
Correspondence between members of the Richards and Gilbert families first documents Clem 
and Nellie Gilbert Allcutt’s move to Australia in 1896 and Clem’s business interests, such as 
investing money in a Kansas town and remodeling and improving a packing house.   
 
The collection includes correspondence to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert from several of her 
friends, including Elizabeth Mary Conclin, Caroline Cathcart Day, Martha Holmes and Mary 
Hinman.  
 
A significant portion of the collection documents the relationship between Alfred W. Gilbert 
and his son, Adolph.   Financial difficulties permeate their correspondence, from Adolph’s trying 
to keep his expenses down while in school to his efforts to work in Texas and later in Kansas.  
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The letters provide information about Adolph’s troubled experiences in the banking and utilities 
industries, and Alfred’s continued efforts to offer advice and financial support.   
 
In an October 21, 1892 letter, Adolph writes his father, “…after the useful life you have led & all 
the good you have done for us all, particularly me & you are alone, the longer I live the more I 
appreciate how well you brought us all up & educated & provided for us.  We always had a 
pleasant home, all the comforts & many of the luxuries of life, a horse & carriage, plenty of 
company & friends, with whom we exchanged visits, a good education for all of us children, & 
how little we appreciated it apparently, & you earned the money for it all by hard every day 
work.”   
 
While serving as an officer in the 39th Ohio Volunteer Infantry during the Civil War, Alfred 
Gilbert faithfully wrote to his wife, providing details of his regiment’s activities in Missouri, his 
hopes for a Christmas furlough, and his plans to have his wife and her sister, Ellen, visit him at 
the regiment’s headquarters at Syracuse, Missouri.  A letter dated December 23, 1861 provides 
an illustrative sketch of the regiment’s Syracuse, Missouri headquarters as Gilbert’s Christmas 
present to his family.  Later, on March 6, 1863, Gilbert writes a letter to his children from 
Washington, D.C., where he provides a description of the city on letterhead bearing the image 
of the United States Capitol.   
 
Several letters of Gilbert’s from this period also provide suggestions and advice to his wife 
about Elland farming matters and reflections about their life together.  Details about Gilbert’s 
Civil War service can also be found in a number of invoices and documents submitted to Gilbert 
that detail the regiment’s supply needs.  Gilbert’s resignation as colonel of the 39th Regiment, 
his application for the Military Order of the Loyal Legion of the United States, and his efforts to 
obtain a pension for his Civil War service are also housed here. 
 
The collection includes several letters of recommendation and congratulations for Gilbert as he 
advanced in his engineering career.  Gilbert’s accomplishments in developing a sewer system 
for the city of Cincinnati are documented in the collection.  Reports about sewer systems in St. 
Louis, Brooklyn, Chicago and Philadelphia provide historical context about this urban planning 
effort.  Other letters outline details of inspecting roads, bridges, tunnels, drains, culverts, street 
pavement and grades, ordinances changing street locations, tax assessments to provide 
condition reports; the placement of 50 street lamps in Cincinnati; a meteorological register of 
the heaviest rain experienced in Cincinnati as of 1852; and topographical surveys.  Several 
documents provide information on the construction of the Findlay Market House in Cincinnati 
in 1853 and 1854.   
 
Banking-related correspondence documents Gilbert’s involvement in the First National Bank of 
Minneapolis, Kansas.  Letters describe interest coupons, mortgages and stock certificates for a 
variety of matters.  Others probe advice about the bank’s going into voluntary liquidation if 
consolidation fails and how to proceed with notices of meetings of the bank’s board of 
directors.  Still more provide reports on an examination of the bank.   
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Gilbert’s business-related correspondence outlines requests for information about proper 
wages for farmhands; selling cattle, corn, hogs and other farm-related items; church 
contributions; purchasing land on Bank Lick Creek; property sales; and views on the 
practicability of establishing a railway down the valley of the Great Miami River from Hamilton, 
Ohio to Aurora, Indiana.   
 
Other correspondence outlines Gilbert’s farming activities at Elland.  For example, 
advertisements and orders for Dungan’s White Prolific Seed Corn date from 1893. 
In the section of the collection devoted to the correspondence of Elizabeth Richards Gilbert, 
two letters from J.R. Adan to Elizabeth Richards provide thoughts about her upcoming marriage 
to Alfred Gilbert.  In a letter dated December 16, 1847, she inquires whether Gilbert is a 
member of the New Church; if he is “gentle, kind-hearted, easily pleased, & industrious,” he will 
have no fears about her happiness or his professional success.  The letter continues with a 
lengthy account of her views about a husband’s duties.  On February 11, 1848, Adan continues 
her thoughts about Elizabeth’s marriage and how busy she must be in getting a house in order 
for a new start in life.   She also reminds her of the importance of having the wisdom to 
appreciate and practice rules for “making the best of everything and expecting little from 
others.”   
 
Another section of the collection provides details about the Gilbert family’s involvement in the 
estate of Alice Royston during the 1820s and 1830s.  Letters inquire about Joseph Gilbert’s 
relation to Mrs. Royston, the possible poisoning of her food and the treatment of insane 
persons, the identity of her legal guardians, particulars of her marriage, her health and financial 
well-being, and other estate matters.   
 
Correspondence pertaining to Giles Richards documents related activities at Elland, such as 
selling land, corn, onions and hogs; purchasing sheep (together with a sample of their wool); 
replacing fences on the property; and how to handle trespassers.  Several letters offer advice to 
Richards on growing grapes and making wine, including some written by Nicholas Longworth, a 
respected Cincinnati businessman and grape-grower.  Other correspondence of Giles Richards 
includes a petition from a nun on behalf of the Orphan Asylum of Cincinnati to pass free of toll 
on the Cincinnati, Oxford and Brookville Turnpike, together with details of giving Alfred Gilbert 
power of attorney for the care of Richards’ property.   
 
Letters pertaining to the Great Western Sanitary Fair, held December 21, 1863 through January 
4, 1864 by the Cincinnati Branch of the U.S. Sanitary Commission to raise money to help sick 
and wounded soldiers during the Civil War, can also be found in the collection.  Still more 
correspondence outlines Richards’ involvement in the Cincinnati Western Railway.  These 
letters provide information on an examination of the valley of Bank Lick Creek to determine the 
practicability of constructing a railroad along it, reports of railroads in Indiana, and the official 
election returns for a vote on the railroad in 1850, copies of estimates of the cost of surveyed 
lines.  Still more describe the commencement and progress of work on the railroad.  A 
November 12, 1850 letter from Alfred Gilbert provides details of corresponding with Indiana 
citizens to survey a route for a proposed railway to Connersville, Indiana; a provision in the 



Gilbert-Richards Papers 
Page 7 

 

charter authorizing the extension of the road to Connersville; the relocation of the line to 
Rushville to save a mile in distance; and planting osage orange hedges along the railroad track.  
Other letters document a resolution of City Council requesting members of the [Ohio] General 
Assembly to pass a bill incorporating the Cincinnati Western Railroad Company; opposition in 
Columbus against the railroad charter; and connection with the Hamilton & Dayton [Railroad] 
Company. 
 
Richards’ involvement with both the Ohio Female College and Farmers’ College are also 
documented through letters and manuscript items in the collection.  Correspondence provides 
details of college financial and business matters, together with notices of meetings of their 
boards of trustees.  Other documents in the collection describe a report to the Cincinnati 
Horticultural Society about establishing state agricultural colleges; an act to establish 
professorships in the Farmers’ College; and a report on instruction at the Farmers’ College.   
 
The collection includes several of the original letters that Henry Richards wrote to his family 
from Tennessee and Georgia while serving in the 93rd Ohio Volunteer Infantry during the Civil 
War.  The letters eventually were published in Letters of Captain Henry Richards of the Ninety-
Third Ohio Infantry (1883); a copy of the publication can also be found in the collection.   
 
When Ophia D. Smith pursues writing about the Gilbert and Richards families, Adolph Gilbert 
corresponds with her, providing information on family histories, his father’s work on the 
Cincinnati sewer system, his father’s Civil War service, and his parents’ relationship.   
 
Manuscripts 
 
Petitions of citizens of Hamilton, Ohio for an act to incorporate the Western Railroad can be 
found in the manuscript portion of the collection devoted to the Cincinnati Western Railway.  
This section of the papers also includes a notice for Giles Richards to appear at Common Pleas 
Court regarding the survey and location of the railroad from Cincinnati to College Corner.  A 
draft of the charter to incorporate the Cincinnati Western Railroad Company, together with 
amendments to it, can also be found here. 
 
Other manuscript items in the collection document the settlement of the estate of Giles and 
Eleanor Richards.  A plat map of Elmont, a copy of Richards’ last will and testament, and power 
of attorney documents provide further information about this matter. 
 
Colerain Cotton Mill activities are outlined by an account of yarn spun, information on funds to 
fix damages to its machinery and buildings, purchasing a napping machine, figures for carding 
and fulling, and the estimated cost of machinery sufficient to turn off 100 yards of satinnett per 
day.   
 
Documents pertaining to Gilbert’s work in the Cincinnati Civil Engineers Office include the 
certificate of his election as City Surveyor and as City Civil Engineer; reports of examinations of 
culverts and rights of way through individuals’ estates; charges for stonework on the Congress 
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Street bridge; specifications for McAdamizing a portion of the Cincinnati and Warsaw Turnpike 
Road; water works calculations; patterns for brick for culverts; and specifications for a lake 
tunnel.  Information on a bill to provide for sewerage and drainage in cities of the first class 
having a population exceeding 100,000 can also be found here. 
 
Other manuscript documents include Joseph Gilbert’s diary of his travels in England in 1823; an 
appraisal of Joseph Gilbert’s farm; agreements between Alfred and Joseph Gilbert regarding 
their father’s will; an inventory of books and instruments in the City Civil Engineer’s Office; a list 
of grapes consigned by Giles Richards; Gilbert’s appointment as Lieutenant Colonel of the 39th 
Ohio Volunteer Infantry; various Civil War reminiscences of Alfred Gilbert; and Gilbert’s draft of 
his obituary.   
 
Gilbert’s November 1847 prospectus for publishing a map of Hamilton County, Ohio can be 
found in the collection.  The map was designed to exhibit townships, ranges and sections, the 
shape and relative size of every farm, together with towns, post offices, roads, canals, streams, 
school houses and other features throughout the county.  The owner’s name was to be marked 
within the boundaries of each farm, together with the number of acres in the tract; the number 
of acres was provided for each subdivisions.  Ground observations, surveys, and county records 
provided information for the map.  According to the prospectus, the map was designed to be 
ready for delivery by March 1848, and the copper plate engraving was offered to subscribers at 
$5.00 per copy.   
 
Diaries 
 
The collection includes Gilbert’s diary, which includes descriptions of the towns and rural 
sections of Missouri, the attitude of people toward Ohio troops, and suspicion between the 
citizens of Missouri during the first years of the war.  It includes details of the daily routine of 
private soldiers and officers, their reaction to the “Jim Lane policy” in Missouri, and the removal 
of General Fremont.    
 
In 1888, Alfred Gilbert wrote “A Sketch,” an autobiographical sketch up to the Civil War that 
describes the development of Cincinnati, Gilbert’s trading expeditions to Georgia and New 
Orleans in the 1830s, a trip to Iowa Territory in 1841, and his life as a boy in Robert Owen’s 
community at New Harmony, Indiana.   
 
The collection includes an account of a lecture on the genius and writings of Shakespeare, 
delivered by Mr. Hudson in June 1844 in Cincinnati. 
 
A diary of events at Elland Farm from June 8, 1868 to January 8, 1871 also includes a prospectus 
and subscription list for Gilbert’s map of Hamilton County.  Contained the diary is a newspaper 
clipping advertising the sale of the farm, listing the number of rooms in the house and the 
contents of the farm.  It also includes a Union Republican ticket listing Robert C. Schenck for 
Congress and the candidates for other Ohio state offices, as well as a national Union Republican 
ticket listing the Grant-Colfax presidential candidates, Senatorial electors, and district electors. 
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During this period, Gilbert runs for City Engineer, is involved with plans for building an 
abutment to the Bank Lick bridge in Butler County, and is chosen as engineer of the Sewerage 
Commission of the City of Cincinnati. 
 
The diary includes information about farming conditions and how crops fared, Gilbert’s often 
difficult dealings with those whom he hired to help him with the farm, finding the right horse 
for farm work, his experiences in selling his corn crop to local distilleries and in harvesting 
grapes to make wine.  He also records his differences with his father-in-law over paying off his 
mortgage on the Elmont property which Richards held, as well as Gilbert’s determination to get 
out of debt.  
 
As Gilbert wrote on January 1, 1869, Richards “reproved me & wife with ingratitude & bad 
treatment.  I…replied to him in much haste & believe I did so too in an unbecoming spirit & said 
things which sh[ould] not have been said.  He told me amongst other things that if I sold the 
farm & did not allow him an hundred dollars for the wine press I would have trouble.  I was 
astonished at this as I always thought the press was part of the realty & was conveyed with the 
farm & this was the first intimation I had that he soon intended charging for the press.  I told 
him that … could only be settled without dispute by a lawyer.  Why this matter has not been 
brought up before, or why some reservation has not been made I can’t imagine.  He seems 
possessed with a evil spirit about the place since he has left it.” 
 
Later, on February 22, 1869, Gilbert writes, “It is a sad thing to see how this old man clings to 
property & manages.  He … accuses his daughter & myself of many things which it is unpleasant 
to write.   He seems very suspicious of all, & determined to rule or ruin.  It is sad to contemplate 
one who has heretofore appeared so amiable & just in all his intercourse, so utterly under the 
control of vicious spirits & influence.  What under his own life & others near him is  miserable – 
I would not like to write all I think or feel in regard to him – a species of insanity appears to 
possess him when speaking upon mother’s writings to our business & the affairs of our 
household....” 
 
Gilbert’s diary from October 30, 1888 to December 19, 1889 continues to chronicle his farming 
activities at Elland, such as planting peach trees, hauling corn, selling his cows and potatoes, 
and reshingling the house. 
 
He also writes of casting his ballot for Benjamin Harrison and Levi Morton in the 1888 
Presidential election.  “This victory of the ballot is more far reaching than any election since 
Lincoln was chosen, and the 6th day of November 1888 will mark an era in the history of 
American politics of almost unprecedented moment,” Gilbert writes.  He also notes the day the 
President set for the opening of the land offices for sale of land in Oklahoma.  “Thousands of 
people have gone there to locate,” Gilbert writes on April 22, 1889.  “Well, I am glad I am not 
one of them.” 
 
Gilbert also records activities during his visits to Kansas City, including a celebration of George 
Washington’s birthday in which children recited selections about Washington’s life and 



Gilbert-Richards Papers 
Page 10 

 

character.  “Also they were requested to bring an offering of a penny or more as a contribution 
to a fund to be raised throughout the state by the schoolchildren for repairing the Homestead 
Mansion at Mt. Vernon which has been bought and is controlled by a number of ladies,” Gilbert 
writes.   
 
His last entry in this diary, written December 19, 1889, finds his getting ready to leave Elland 
once more.  “I am loth to go too, as usual, but fate seems to keep me on the move. I often think 
of a little incident which occurred before my marriage when wife & I were looking over a book 
of questions each numbered & some for gentlemen & some for ladies & we were to choose as 
to what our character & fortune should be, my fortune came “Ye build & ye build but you enter 
not in,” & I have thought with that remnant of superstition we how all have.  How time a 
prophecy it has seemed, & neither some Fate did not pick that out for me.  So many hopes 
wrecked & so many castles built into which I have failed to gain entrance, but then this couplet 
has come to be as well and I have tried to apply myself vigorously to obey its injunctions.  
[Instead of sitting down idly to mourn over dead hopes, apply yourself vigorously to the nearest 
duty.]  Ah, well, “Vade.” 
 
Gilbert’s diary spanning January 1, 1890 through July 16, 1891 includes financial information for 
a bank in which he and his son, Adolph, were involved.  He also describes details of pie socials, 
banquets of the Atlantean Club, and a Methodist conference he attended in Kansas.  
Information about leasing the Foster Hill property and farming endeavors at Elland is also 
included in the diary.  He also records the deaths of several old acquaintances and the 28th 
anniversary of the Battle of Corinth.   
 
Gilbert also reflects on his 42nd wedding anniversary and notes in several entries about his 
status as a widower.  On August 24, 1890, he writes, “I feel sad & lonely tonight.  I don’t know 
hardly what to do.  I must make some change from the monotonous life I have been living the 
past five years.  It seems as if I had no real interest in life.  I don’t seem to be identified with 
anybody as any particular interest, in fact.  I ought to have a wife & the responsibilities, cares, & 
pleasures that flow from such a union of man & woman.  A lone man has no ties – no real hold 
on the community, or, in short only half a man – the woman forms a very important part of his 
life & I feel it more & more.” 
 
On November 9, 1890, Gilbert writes of receiving a troubling letter from his son, Adolph, in 
which he says that he is hopelessly in debt and that his father will probably lose all or the 
greater part of his earnings and savings.  “I have just read the letter once but it is enough to 
show that he is ruined & in all probability I am too,” Gilbert writes.  “I have trusted everything 
to his honor & integrity.”    
 
The diary Gilbert kept from November 17, 1890 to October 4, 1891 records his son Adolph’s 
financial difficulties and his efforts to help his son recover.  Writing on November 19, 1890, 
Gilbert says, “It is a sore trial, money that I have been many, many years earning & now in my 
old age to lose & jeopardize my income but Fathers all over the world are doing every day just 
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that thing, tho I fondly believed I would be an exception.  How little we know what is in store 
for us….I hardly know how to turn.”  
 
Later entries reveal that Gilbert has substantially reduced his own income and investigating the 
possibility of the family declaring bankruptcy.  As he writes on Christmas Day 1890, in the past 
50 years, he has had many sad experiences, but none as sad as this.  “Then, as now, I was 
looking forward & wondering where, & what, I should be.  Now, I am only looking for a quiet 
place to age and die, & my thoughts are fixed on returning to my Elland home, there to pass the 
rest of my days & will be only too glad if I can retain enough of this world’s goods to pass it 
quietly & in peace.”   
 
Marking his 75th birthday, Gilbert reveals that the previous year, his income was over $3000 per 
annum, but this year expects that the amount will be $500.  “Adolph’s wonderful course excites 
continually my astonishment,” he writes.  How he could allow himself to become so hopelessly 
in debt I can’t conceive.  From the best calculation I can make now I should lose by his 
indiscretions something over $26,000, something I could never have dreamed of.  I had seen so 
many, or I termed them, foolish fathers brought to financial ruin through going security & 
paying the debts of their sons that I could never have believed, I too, would become a victim.”  
 
Later, the diary finds Gilbert back at Elland, continuing to farm his land and sell his harvests in 
Hamilton.  Several other entries in this diary document the deaths of many of Gilbert’s old 
Cincinnati acquaintances, including Rufus King, M.W. Stone, J.P. Williams and Townsend 
Williams. 
 
Gilbert’s diary recording the period from October 5, 1891 through October 31, 1892 continues 
to document farming at Elland, local social engagements, the wedding of George Richards and 
Fannie Boyd, as well as various deaths of Gilbert’s acquaintances, including Benjamin W. 
Chidlaw.  This period also sees the departure of Gilbert’s daughter, Nellie, and her family for 
Queensland, Australia.   
 
Writing on February 9, 1891, Gilbert observes on the occasion of his 76th birthday, “I feel as well 
as a person of my age can feel I presume, not an ache nor a pain in my system & a fair appetite 
and if I did not have this bank business and my son’s affairs on my mind I believe I could be as 
happy as a man can well be in this world, with of course my wants & desires not supplied but 
that is what we must expect in any walk or condition of life, but this bank uncertainty and the 
great pecuniary loss I have by the very questionable conduct of my only son, is a constant 
source of uneasiness and regret & causes a great weight to be continually on my mind.” 
 
In this diary, Gilbert also records the nomination of Benjamin Harrison for the presidency of the 
United States and his choosing Whitelaw Reid for his running mate.  Gilbert approves of 
Harrison as “he has showed such decided ability – true statesmanship” (June 2, 1892), although 
he believes that “Harrison has been too conscientious a man to be re-elected….The good 
citizens of the country don’t amount to much in a political campaign & I think from all I can see 
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Harrison’s defeat is assured and the great results of the wise legislation of the Republican party 
will be almost lost to the country” (June 23, 1892). 
 
During the period from November 1, 1892 to January 31, 1894, Gilbert voted in his 14th 
presidential election, noting the defeat of President Benjamin Harrison for re-election.   
He also observed the death of former President Rutherford B. Hayes, with whom he was 
acquainted when Gilbert was civil engineer and Hayes the city solicitor of Cincinnati, noting that 
Hayes “was one of the most thorough Republicans yet in all his various contests with his 
political opponents he never I believe made a political enemy.”   
 
Gilbert also wrote of attending the dedication of the new City Hall in Cincinnati on May 13, 
1893.  The building was designed by architect Samuel Hannaford and cost $360,000 to 
construction, exclusive of the lot, Richards noted.  “A great concourse of citizens thronged the 
streets to witness the parade & at night the building was densely packed with an admiring & 
good natured crowd of both sexes,” he wrote. 
 
By July 1893, Gilbert observed bank failures and other financial difficulties across the country, 
such as the closing of ore mines and Eastern manufactories.  To Gilbert, this was “the result of 
putting the so-called democratic party into the possession of the government of the country.”  
“A widespread feeling of alarm & consternation is apparent in every kind of business & an 
unsettled state of feeling among all classes of enterprises,” Gilbert wrote on July 19, 1893.  
“Just what had been foretold by hundreds of republican papers & speakers would occur in that 
event.” 
 
Socially, Gilbert attends the reunion of the 39th Ohio Volunteer Infantry, giving the welcoming 
address in his capacity as president of the association.  He also attends the World’s Columbian 
Exposition in Chicago for a few days.  “Saw beautiful things & architecture galore,” he wrote on 
October 23, 1893.  “It is certainly a wonderful triumph of genius, industry, brains, pluck & 
indomitable courage.” 
 
Gilbert receives letters from his daughter, Nellie, and her family in Australia which describe a 
flood in Brisbane and an accident in which his son-in-law was involved.  In January 1894, he 
writes to inquire whether they intended to make their permanent home in Australia and what 
they thought of him coming there. 
 
In Gilbert’s diary covering the period from February 1, 1894 through October 7, 1894, he writes 
of the selection of Republican delegates to a convention nominating a member to fill a vacancy 
in Congress.  After the election, Gilbert observes on March 3, 1894, “Well, the agony is over & 
the Republican banner – the old flag – floats high this morning & the Eagle is triumphant again. 
Nearly every contested precinct in the state has spoken in Republican tones & Ohio stands 
redeemed!!” 
 
In his 1894 book, If Christ Came to Chicago, British journalist William T. Stead called the public’s 
attention to the corrupt practices of many of Chicago’s political and economic leaders.   After 
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reading the book, Gilbert reflected on May 11, 1894, “It is a terrible arraignment of that 
wonderful city and her people.  It is almost sickening to read and yet it is all so true.  Verily 
Christianity seems to have small hold on our people.  The publication of these details will 
certainly have an effect to strengthen the feeling now so prevalent of antipathy of the working 
classes toward the rich and successful in life….These statements may eventually have a 
beneficial effect upon our people and the politicians of the country and upon the religiously 
inclined, bringing them to a realizing sense of the necessity of a more brotherly feeling to the 
poor and unsuccessful in life.” 
 
Gilbert comments on the overthrow of Tammany Hall in his diary covering the period from 
October 8, 1894 to October 14, 1895.  Writing on November 10, 1894, Gilbert thinks that it “is a 
wonderful exhibition of what can be done when the better class of people take the matter in 
their hands, without regard to this old party proclivities, and desire to reform corruption in 
politics.” 
  
In this diary, Gilbert also provides details of the construction and dedication of the new bridge 
in his neighborhood. He records contributing one dollar for a $2000 project to plant trees on 
either side of Gilbert Avenue in Cincinnati.  Furthermore, he writes a letter on July 13, 1895 to 
the directors of the Colerain, Oxford & Brookville Turnpike, suggesting that they designate 
someone to take charge of and care for the Elland Cemetery in accordance with the 
communication of Giles Richards; they acted on it and passed a resolution covering the case. He 
also writes of the birth of a new grandchild, belonging to his daughter, Nellie, in Australia.  
 
Still farming and living at Elland, Gilbert observed on April 5, 1895, “After a visit to the city 
everything out here seems so take & it takes some time to get into the quiet ways of this dull 
neighborhood.  It seems to me I must make a change, somehow!”  Writing on September 16, 
1895, he expresses his frustration at his daughter Ada not visiting him at Elland.  “I guess she 
don’t care to leave her nice surroundings up there & not much to interest her here,” he says.  
“She realizes my loneliness, children don’t think much of their parents really – they don’t begin 
to interest them like their husbands.  And it’s quite natural she’d be so.  Poor parents they are 
always thinking of their children.” 
 
Gilbert’s diary spanning from October 18, 1895 to April 1, 1897 provides some interesting 
glimpses of life during this period.  For example, on February 9, 1896, on lighting his new “New 
Juno” lamp, Gilbert writes, “it gives abundant light & I presume I will never more be contented 
with my old lamps for reading.”  The Edwardian-style lamp was manufactured by the Edward 
Miller & Company of Connecticut.  He also documents “lively discussions” on Free Silver, an 
important political issue during the 1896 presidential election that pitted the established 
financial centers of the Northeast against more rural areas of the country.  Gilbert also writes of 
the nomination of William McKinley for president.  As he observes on June 19, 1896, “I hope to 
vote for him & see him elected, but a wonderful craze has come over well meaning & intelligent 
citizens who are advocating the free coinage of silver at the ratio of 16 to 1, when silver is at 
such a price as 57 c*en+ts!” 
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On November 2, 1896, Gilbert marched with fellow veterans of the 39th Ohio Volunteer Infantry 
in a parade honoring McKinley in Cincinnati.  “An immense concourse of people lined the 
sidewalk & horses 5 times as many as men in the procession,” Gilbert writes.  “It was 
considered a fair estimate at 3000 so that there must have been 15,000 people big & 
little….The day was perfect and all seemed enthusiastic.”  Observing that the Free Silver issue 
was a momentous one that promised to change the issues and institutions of the country, 
Gilbert writes happily of victory “for sound money and sound sense” two days later.  “The 
election returns are just glorious, & the old flag will float over a people who know how to 
govern themselves.  The victory is overwhelming.” 
 
Entries documenting work performed on Elland farm and various neighborhood improvements 
continue in this diary.  On July 17, 1896, Gilbert writes of threshing wheat with a new machine 
called the “Columbine Victory.” Using the patented self-feeder and measurer manufactured in 
Minneapolis, Minnesota, Gilbert was able to harvest “587 bushels of excellent wheat, the best, 
‘tis said in the neighborhood.” On June 6, 1896, Gilbert meets with Fairfield Township Trustees, 
requesting that they furnish drain tile for the improvements being made to a road near his 
property.  Later diary entries record the progress of the project.   
 
As usual, the diary includes several obituaries of Cincinnati citizens, including Alexander 
McGuffey, brother of William Holmes McGuffey (June 6, 1896).  He also writes of his daughter, 
Nellie, visiting from Australia with her children.   
 
In his diary from April 1, 1897 through February 28, 1899, Gilbert continues to record details of 
life at Elland, from farming endeavors, home maintenance improvements, and social 
engagements with friends and neighbors.  For example, Gilbert writes of attending a 
“missionary tea” and a temperance convention, participating in the annual Decoration Day 
festivities, and purchasing a new “Jim Dandy” buggy. 
 
Gilbert also records details of current events, including the burning of a charity bazaar in Paris, 
France in May 1897, in which over 100 ladies died, and the election of Asa Bushnell as governor 
of Ohio, which he sees as “a sad thing for the republican party of Ohio.”In March 1897, Gilbert 
begins writing of an imminent war with Spain, observing in the following months about news on 
the matter, including America’s victory in Cuba and the ratification of a treaty with Spain in 
February 1899.   
 
A diary Gilbert kept between July 30, 1860 and June 6, 1868 records details of his engineering 
work in Cincinnati, including supervising a project to build sewers on Vine and Sycamore Streets 
and inspecting work done on culverts in the city.  He also describes the progress of outfitting 
the interior of the Cincinnati City Hall, including purchasing flags and chandeliers.  Other 
projects include repaving sidewalks on 5th Street, grading Mount Auburn Street, building sewers 
in the 5th District, and the difficulties encountered in getting workmen to use a better grade of 
brick and make cement mortar correctly.   Gilbert also mentions working with contractors on 
the construction of the Colerain bridge abutment near his home. 
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Family news mentioned in this diary includes the wedding of George Richards to Josephine 
Johnson and travels to Urbana, Ohio to see daughter Nellie in school.  On September 23, 1867, 
Richards reflects on the one-year anniversary of the death of his son, Warrie.  After George 
Richards presses his grapes on Gilbert’s press, Gilbert writes on October 22, 1897, “George 
seems to have a streak of insanity in his organization.  I told him as pleasantly as I could that I 
wished him to clean up the press & vats & put them up after he had done with them & he got in 
a furious rage declaring if I required him to do that he would be eternally damned if he would 
ever enter my house again.  Fearing he was really suffering under some sort of insanity I 
avoided any reply to such language as much as I well could hoping after a time he might in the 
folly of his course.  It is certainly only right & proper that those using the press & vats should 
keep them clear.” 
 
The diary also records work done on the family farm, including selling produce in Hamilton and 
making cider and wine.  After an altercation between two of Gilbert’s hired hands, Heurich and 
Augustus, on November 21, 1897, Heurich poisons himself by taking arsenic and passes away 
later that day. 
 
Account Books 
 
Account books in the collection provide financial information about family expenses and costs 
incurred in the running of Elland Farm.  Household ledgers offer lists of wedding presents 
received by Ada, Nellie and Adolph Gilbert, corn delivered by Elland Farm tenants, purchasing 
of surveying instruments, and the cost of putting on a new roof at Elland.  Other books collect 
receipts for the Great Miami Turnpike Company and tolls taken on the Colerain, Oxford, and 
Brookville Turnpike. 
 
Printed Material 
 
Printed material in the collection includes catalogues of the Ohio Female College in College Hill, 
Ohio (1852-1854, 1861); a catalogue for the American Female College in Glendale, Ohio (1855); 
a commencement program for Glendale Female College (1857); and catalogues for Farmers’ 
College (1854; 1877-1878).  A copy of Dignity of Labor: An Address, Delivered Before the 
Philomathian Society of Farmers’ College, Hamilton County, Ohio, March 24, 1847 (Cincinnati: 
William H. Moore & Co., 1847), by Charles B. Boynton, together with A Plea for the Farmers’ 
College of Hamilton County, Ohio, and for Reformation in Collegiate Instruction; Being a Report 
to That Institution, Made July 17, 1850 (Cincinnati: Ben Franklin Printing House, 1850), a report 
made by Giles Richards, can also be found in the collection. 
 
Circulars provide details about contributions of articles for sale at the Great Western Sanitary 
Fair for the benefit of the Cincinnati Branch of the U.S. Sanitary Commission and its Committee 
on War Memorials, Relics, and Curiosities.  Others offer information about New Church 
activities, from Christmas exercises to conventions.  A notice of sale of Gilbert’s Ohio Avenue 
property can also be found in this portion of the collection.   
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ORGANIZATION OF THE COLLECTION 
 
Organization of the collection reflects a previous arrangement of the collection that occurred 
before it was inventoried.  Correspondence subseries have been arranged by names of 
correspondents (most often family members), in alphabetical order by name of author (last 
name, first name).  Some subseries reflect a previous arrangement by the subject of the 
correspondence. 
 

Series I: Correspondence 
 

Subseries I: Clem Allcutt to Nellie Gilbert Allcutt 
Subseries II: Clem Allcutt to Alfred W. Gilbert 
Subseries III: Miscellaneous Correspondence of Clem Allcutt 
Subseries IV: Nellie Gilbert Allcutt to Rachel 
Subseries V: Ada Gilbert Carpenter to Alfred W. Gilbert 
Subseries VI: Ada Gilbert Carpenter to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries VII: Ada Gilbert Carpenter to Warren Gilbert 
Subseries VIII: Edwin J. Carpenter to Alfred W. Gilbert  
Subseries IX: Mary Conclin to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries X: Caroline Cathcart Day to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries XI: Adolph Gilbert to Alfred W. Gilbert 
Subseries XII: Adolph Gilbert to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries XIII: Adolph Gilbert to Ophia D. Smith 
Subseries XIV: Alfred W. Gilbert to Clem Allcutt 
Subseries XV: Alfred W. Gilbert to Nellie Gilbert Allcutt 
Subseries XVI: Alfred W. Gilbert to Edwin J. Carpenter 
Subseries XVII: Alfred W. Gilbert to Adolph Gilbert 
Subseries XVIII: Alfred W. Gilbert to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries XIX: Alfred W. Gilbert’s Civil War Invoices and Army Documents 
Subseries XX: Alfred W. Gilbert’s Pension for Civil War Service 
Subseries XXI: Correspondence about Alfred W. Gilbert 
Subseries XXII: Miscellaneous Correspondence to Alfred W. Gilbert 
Subseries XXIII: Miscellaneous Correspondence from Alfred W. Gilbert 
Subseries XXIV: Alfred W. Gilbert’s Cincinnati Civil Engineers Office Correspondence 
Subseries XXV: Alfred W. Gilbert’s Banking-Related Correspondence 
Subseries XXVI: Alfred W. Gilbert’s Business Correspondence 
Subseries XXVII: Elizabeth Richards Gilbert to Nellie Gilbert Allcutt 
Subseries XXVIII: Elizabeth Richards Gilbert to Ada Gilbert Carpenter 
Subseries XXIX: Elizabeth Richards Gilbert to Warren Gilbert 
Subseries XXX: Elizabeth Richards Gilbert to Eleanor Richards 
Subseries XXXI: Elizabeth Richards Gilbert to Ellen Richards 
Subseries XXXII: Elizabeth Richards Gilbert to Giles Richards 
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Subseries XXXIII: Correspondence to Joseph Gilbert Regarding the Estate of Alice 
Royston 
Subseries XXXIV: Joseph Gilbert to Alfred W. Gilbert 
Subseries XXXV: Miscellaneous Correspondence of Joseph Gilbert 
Subseries XXXVI: Martha Holmes to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries XXXVII: Amos Adams Richards to Giles Richards 
Subseries XXXVIII: Eleanor Richards to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries XXXIX: Eleanor Richards to Giles Richards 
Subseries XL: Ellen Richards to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries XLI: George Richards to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries XLII: George T. Richards to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries XLIII: Giles Richards to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries XLIV: Miscellaneous Correspondence from Giles Richards 
Subseries XLV: Miscellaneous Correspondence to Giles Richards 
Subseries XLVI: Correspondence to Giles Richards Regarding Great Western Sanitary Fair 
Subseries XLVII: Correspondence to Giles Richards Regarding Cincinnati Western Railway 
Subseries XLVIIII: Correspondence from Giles Richards Regarding Cincinnati Western 
Railway 
Subseries XLIX: Correspondence to Giles Richards Regarding Ohio Female College 
Subseries L: Correspondence from Giles Richards Regarding Land Holdings in Butler and 
Hamilton Counties, Ohio 
Subseries LI: Correspondence to Giles Richards Regarding Land Holdings in Butler and 
Hamilton Counties, Ohio 
Subseries LII: Correspondence Regarding Colerain-Oxford-Brookville Turnpike Company 
and Venice Bridge Company 
Subseries LIII: Henry Richards to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries LIV: Henry Richards to Giles Richards 
Subseries LV: L.E. Richards to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries LVI: Fannie Ross to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries LVII: Mary Ross Waldo to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
Subseries LVIII: Miscellaneous Correspondence 

 
Series II: Manuscripts 
 

Subseries I: Colerain, Oxford and Brookville Turnpike 
Subseries II: Giles Richards’ Papers Regarding Farmers’ College 
Subseries III: Cincinnati Western Railway 
Subseries IV: Estate of Giles and Eleanor Richards 
Subseries V: Colerain Cotton Mill 
Subseries VI: Alfred W. Gilbert’s Documents Regarding Cincinnati Civil Engineers Office  
Subseries VII: Miscellaneous Documents 
Subseries VIII: Drawings of Land Plats 
Subseries IX: Drawings and Photographs 
Subseries X: Diaries of Alfred W. Gilbert 
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Subseries XI: Account Books 
 
Series III: Printed Material 
 
RELATED MATERIALS 
 
Smith, Ophia D.  The Life and Times of Giles Richards (1820-1860).  Columbus, Ohio: The Ohio 
State Archaeological and Historical Society, 1936. (Spec F486 .O526 v.6) 
 
Smith, William E. and Smith, Ophia D., eds.  Colonel A.W. Gilbert: Citizen-Soldier of Cincinnati.  
Cincinnati, Ohio: Historical and Philosophical Society of Ohio, 1934. (Southwest Ohio Regional 
Depository F499.C653 G55 1934) 
 
The collection file pertaining to the Gilbert-Richards Papers includes printouts of scanned 
images shared by Tod Sutton in March 2007.  The images include scans of a Bible given to 
Elizabeth Richards and Alfred W. Gilbert by Giles Richards on January 1, 1859.  Other images 
were scanned from photographs in a card album passed down to Mr. Sutton by Betsey Sutton.  
According to Mr. Sutton, most photographs date from 1881 to 1893 and were taken by Edwin J. 
Carpenter around the Elland farm; others were taken in Kansas City and Bay St. Louis, Michigan.  
While few individuals are identified in any captions, Mr. Sutton believes the photographs to be 
of Alfred W. Gilbert, Elizabeth Gilbert, and their children.   
 
ADMINISTRATIVE INFORMATION 
 
Access: This collection is open under the rules and regulations of the Walter 

Havighurst Special Collections, Miami University Libraries. 
  
Preferred Citation: Researchers are requested to cite the Gilbert-Richards Papers and The 

Walter Havighurst Special Collections, Miami University Libraries in all 
footnote and bibliographic references. 

  
Provenance: Miami University Libraries acquired the papers from the Moore family, a 

subsequent owner of Elland. 
  
Processed By: Betsy Butler, May-October 2009 
  
Property Rights: The Walter Havighurst Special Collections, Miami University Libraries, 

owns the property rights to this collection.   
  
Copyrights: Reproduction of materials in the collection is subject to the 

restrictions of copyright law. To use any materials not yet in the 
public domain, the researcher must obtain permission from the 
copyright holder. 
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DETAILED DESCRIPTION OF THE COLLECTION 
Note to Researchers: To request materials, please note both the box and folder numbers shown 
below. 
 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries I: Clem Allcutt to Nellie Gilbert Allcutt  
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

1 1 Arrived in Brisbane, Australia; leaves for St. Lawrence 
the next morning; description of journey; news of 
friends 

January 17, 1896 

1 2 Written on Criterion Hotel letterhead from 
Rockhampton; description of business trip; effect of 
the wet weather on the mail; reasons for losses of 
cattle there; requirements of practicing dentistry 
there 

February 25, 1896 

1 3 Description of journey from Rockhampton to St. 
Lawrence 

March 2, 1896 

1 4 Arrival of refrigerator later that month; she is to 
receive a bank draft; will get house that was built for 
the manager fixed up; includes rough sketch of it 

May 1, 1896 

1 5 Difficulty in getting the mail; plans to forward money 
to her; progress on buildings; description of the meat 
business; news of acquaintances and activities in St. 
Lawrence 

May 7, 1896 

1 6 Boat brought some fittings for and the engineer of 
the ice machine; progress on cooler; plans to go to 
Brisbane to complete equipment; plans to send mail 
via Vancouver and Queensland 

June 1, 1896 

1 7 Her plans to go to Elland; thoughts about Adaline’s 
treatment of her; news of friends; narrowly missed a 
twenty-pound iron weight falling from overhead 

June 5, 1896 

1 8 Arrived in St. Lawrence safely and found Colledges all 
right  

May 21, 1898 

1 9 Written on letterhead of Criterion Hotel in 
Rockhampton; rented a house, so she can begin to 
get things ready 

May 30, 1898 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries II: Clem Allcutt to Alfred W. Gilbert  
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

1 10 At Cincinnati on his way to Philadelphia, New York, May 22, 1892 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

and Boston in the interest of the Cooperative Packing 
Co. of St. Joseph to see about placing stock of 
company among butchers and provision dealers 
there; is to take charge of their business, having 
made plans for improvement of their plant; directions 
on where to reach him 

1 11 Arrived at Boston, Massachusetts; slow business of 
placing stock among dealers; news of “old timers” in 
business there 

June 4, 1892 

1 12 Expects to pass through Cincinnati next Tuesday on 
way home from New York; wishes for him to join him 
and go on to Kansas City with him 

September 24, 1892 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries III: Miscellaneous Correspondence of Clem Allcutt  
 

Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

1 13 Elizabeth 
Richards Gilbert 

Clem Allcutt Receipt of 
check; 
description of 
family activities; 
purchase of 
herd of cattle 

August 12, 1883 

1 14 Clem Allcutt C.C. Olney Wish to invest 
money in some 
small town in 
central Kansas; 
description of 
what kind of lot 
he wants; 
proposes 
visiting the 
Solomon Valley 

January 14, 1885 

1 15 Clem Allcutt Adolph Gilbert Made 
arrangements 
to take charge 
of the packing 
house at St. 
Joseph; plans to 
remodel house 
to handle hogs 
and cattle; 

May 19, 1892 
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Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

business plans; 
plans to leave 
for 
Philadelphia, 
New York and 
Boston to place 
preferred stock 
with meat and 
provision 
dealers; thinks 
it will beat 
Australia deal 

1 16 Anna Allcutt Clem Allcutt News of family August 3, 1893 

1 17 Clem Allcutt Allcutt Children Hopes they 
have recovered 
from the 
measles; recent 
activities; 
holiday for the 
races of the 
Broadsound 
Jockey Club 

May 7, 1896 

1 18 John H. Williams, 
Urbana 
University 

Clem Allcutt Checks to be 
applied on 
Rowena’s 
account at 
Urbana 
University 

October 14, 1901 

1 19 John H. Williams, 
Urbana 
University 

Clem Allcutt Check for 
Rowena’s 
account at 
Urbana 
University 

January 5, 1902 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries IV:  Nellie Gilbert Allcutt to Rachel  
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

1 20 Regrets she will not be with them at Christmas; news 
of family 

December 25, 1873 

1 21 News of family March 31, 1875 

1 22 News of family and friends Undated 
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Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries V:  Ada Gilbert Carpenter to Alfred W. Gilbert  
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

1 23 No bellows from Mr. McNeeley; where else he can 
find one; news of family 

May 20, 1892 

1 24 Ride down the Ohio River; new address near Marietta  June 26, 1893 
 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries VI:  Ada Gilbert Carpenter to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert  
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

1 25 End-of-school-year activities; last day of Sunday 
School; news of school friends 

June 25, 1865 

1 26 News of family; plans to spend some time away from 
Elland; suitability of Florida 

January 5, 1875 

1 27 Nellie’s recent visit; news of family July 1, 1875 

1 28 News of family; travel from Pittsburgh to the Oswego 
island; description of activities on the island 

August 17, 1879 

1 29 Planting garden; news of friends and family Undated 

1 30 Laurie’s visit; news of family; recent activities Undated 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries VII:  Ada Gilbert Carpenter to Warren Gilbert  
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

1 31 Description of activities with school friends March 17, 1866 
 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries VIII:  Edwin J. Carpenter to Alfred W. Gilbert  
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

1 32 Report of what kind of mittens he found at 
Burkhardts, Pogues and Rendigs-Davaillon; weather 

January 16, 1893 

1 33 Clem’s progress with camera; hail storm and repairs 
resulting from it; work in Pittsburgh  

May 23, 1893 
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Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries IX:  Mary Conclin to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

1 34 Spending vacation in Hamilton and with her at the 
Richards home 

July 14, 1836 

1 35 News of head of boarding establishment in New 
Haven 

June 11, 1838 

1 36 Recent news of acquaintances April 17, 1839 

1 37 News of acquaintances; Mr. Burnham’s sermons September 25, 1840 

1 38 News of acquaintances; attendance at singing school; 
recent religious services 

April 30, 1841 

1 39 News of acquaintances; her not coming to 
Convention; recent weddings; attendance at 
teachers’ meeting 

June 4, 1841 

1 40 News of acquaintances; attendance at religious 
events 

July 29, 1842 

1 41 News of acquaintances March 20, 1843 

1 42 News of acquaintances; Elizabeth’s visit to Dayton 
and Lebanon 

November 7, 1843 

1 43 News of acquaintances; activities during recent 
holiday season; arrival of music teacher from Troy 
Seminary 

January 14, 1844 

1 44 News of acquaintances; recent activities April 14, 1844 

1 45 News of acquaintances; visit of Eleanor and Ellen 
Richards 

August 13, 1844 

1 46 News of acquaintances; recent activities June 15, 1845 

1 47 News of acquaintances; recent activities June 30, 1845 

1 48 News of acquaintances; recent activities July 13, 1845 

1 49 News of acquaintances; recent activities in Dayton August 2, 1845 

1 50 News of acquaintances; recent activities  August 17, 1845 

1 51 News of acquaintances; recent activities; illness and 
death of aunt Sarah 

June 28, 1846 

1 52 News of acquaintances; recent activities December 29, 1846 

1 53 News of acquaintances; recent activities; Elizabeth’s 
engagement 

March 30, 1847 

1 54 News of acquaintances; recent activities December 14, 1848 

1 55 News of acquaintances; recent activities February 19 

1 56 News of acquaintances; recent activities; plans for a 
visit 

March 25 

1 57 News of acquaintances; recent activities; recent 
opera performance  

Undated 

1 58 News of acquaintances; recent activities; death of Undated 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

Elizabeth’s grandmother 

1 59 News of acquaintances; recent activities Undated 

1 60 News of acquaintances; recent activities Undated 

1 61 News of acquaintances; recent activities Undated 

1 62 News of acquaintances; recent activities Undated 

1 63 News of acquaintances; recent activities Undated 

1 64 News of acquaintances; recent activities Undated 

1 65 News of acquaintances; recent activities Undated 

1 66 News of acquaintances; recent activities Undated 

1 67 News of acquaintances; recent activities Undated 

1 68 News of acquaintances; recent activities Undated 

1 69 News of acquaintances; recent activities Undated 

1 70 News of acquaintances; recent activities in Boston; 
health 

Undated 

1 71 News of acquaintances; recent activities in Kentucky Undated 

1 72 News of acquaintances; recent activities; recent visit Undated 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries X:  Caroline Cathcart Day to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

1 73 News of acquaintances; recent activities; copy of the 
Psalm of Life 

June 23, 1843 

1 74 News of acquaintances; recent activities September 12, 1843 

1 75 News of acquaintances; recent activities; thoughts on 
friendship 

March 16, 1844 

1 76 News of acquaintances; recent activities; plans to 
attend convention; teaching endeavors 

May 19, 1844 

1 77 News of acquaintances; recent activities October 8, 1844 

1 78 News of acquaintances; recent activities; death of 
Elizabeth’s brother 

June 23, 1845 

1 79 News of acquaintances; recent activities and books 
read; hopes for a visit 

August 11, 1845 

1 80 News of acquaintances; recent activities; wishes to be 
together at Thanksgiving 

November 20, 1845 

1 81 News of acquaintances; recent activities March 2, 1846 

1 82 News of acquaintances; recent activities August 27, [1846] 

1 83 News of acquaintances; recent activities; Elizabeth’s 
marriage and future; teaching endeavors 

October 1, 1847 

1 84 News of acquaintances; recent activities; thoughts 
about life 

March 5, 1848 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

1 84A Recent activities; news of acquaintances January 5, 1852 

1 85 Request for recipe; housekeeping; spring weather; 
“Lectures and Essays by Giles”; news of 
acquaintances 

April 22, 1852 

1 86 Washing recipe; lack of news; description of activities; 
news of acquaintances 

June 1852 

1 87 Disappointment in her not coming for a visit; wish for 
a letter 

July 19, 1852 

1 88 Filling in for a teacher; description of Urbana, Ohio; 
recent activities; news of acquaintances 

September 9, 1852 

1 89 How much she enjoyed her recent letter; plans to go 
home for Christmas; plans for social function given by 
New Church ladies; news of acquaintances 

December 16, 1852 

1 90 Receiving letters; news of acquaintances; 
improvements to character 

February 17, 1853 

1 91 Thoughts about recent letter; news of acquaintances May 16, 1853 

1 92 Free from teaching; was offered and declined 
principalship of the Urbana Seminary; description of 
activities in Urbana and Dayton 

July 17, 1853 

1 93 Living conditions; description of activities in Urbana; 
news of acquaintances; description of a circus in town 

July 5, 1854 

1 94 Recent activities; father’s fall; news of acquaintances November 24, 1854 

1 95 Interest in hearing about her children; news of 
acquaintances; wedding plans 

April 13, 1855 

1 96 Recent wedding; interest in hearing about her 
children 

May 31, 1855 

1 97 Recent activities; impending birth of child and hopes 
to live through it 

September 14, 1855 

1 98 Sickness of herself and child; recent activities May 28, 1856 

1 99 Recent activities; news of children August 1858 

1 100 Recent activities April 18, 1866 

1 101 Thoughts about her children; glad she is going to live 
at Elland 

May 6, 1866 

1 102 Thanks for her words of sympathy; recent activities 
since death 

January 19, 1867 

1 103 Recovering from severe illness; recommendation for 
tomato face poultice; pleasure with servant; 
description of Baltimore 

June 8, 1868 

1 104 Recent activities; news of acquaintances January 22 

1 105 Recent activities June 17 

1 106 Recent activities in Dayton; interest in what she is 
reading; thoughts about Nicholas Nickleby 

July 31 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

1 107 Recent activities; experiences teaching at seminary in 
Dayton 

Undated 

1 108 News of acquaintances; recent activities; what she is 
reading 

Undated 

1 109 Plans to come to her wedding Undated 

1 110 Description of future husband, Willard G. Day, and 
her desire for Willard to call on Elizabeth and Alfred 
Gilbert and become their friend 

Undated 

1 111 News of acquaintances; recent activities Undated 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XI: Adolph Gilbert to Alfred W. Gilbert  
 

Box Folder Subject  Date 

1 112 Sending accounts; efforts to keep expenses down; 
weather; recent school activities and upcoming 
examinations 

November 29, 1871 

1 113 Chance to become a superintendent of several locks; 
experiences in Texas; their desire for him to come 
home; plans to return either to Cincinnati, Chicago or 
Elland; hopes to secure a position 

May 18, 1877 

1 114 Whether he received new folders and $5.00 bills that 
he sent him some time ago; broke ground for new 
bank 

September 3, 1885 

1 115 Request to write to him at Minneapolis, Kansas with 
when he will be in New York and when he will stop at 
Boston 

September 4, 1885 

1 116 Cannot drop his plans; trying to make a loan from 
Bank of Bennington 

January 1, 1892 

1 117 Has done nothing about the horse; traded colts for 
mare; financial activities at the Minneapolis National 
Bank; financial settlement 

March 11, 1892 

1 118 Sending statements; plans for selling and 
consolidation 

March 15, 1892 

1 119 Request to send a copy of the paper regarding stock 
and the $2500 note; bank filed suit against 
Merryfield; plans for case; bank examiner’s report 

April, 6, 1892 

1 120 Mare hurt; would not like the Allcutts going to 
Australia; reason they do not want to go into his 
proposition; proceedings of quarterly meeting of 
directors 

April 7, 1892 

1 121 Agreement regarding $2500; good prospects April 13, 1892 
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Box Folder Subject  Date 

1 122 Trouble about the Nelson note and bank’s desire to 
have the note renewed with a new one or paid; 
hopes to let him do as he thinks best 

April 15, 1892 

1 123 Has not heard from Clem Allcutt; recent activities  May 2, 1892 

1 124 Recent weather; paper filed in the suit; financial 
matters; looking at gas and electric light plant for sale 

May 10, 1892 

1 125 Weather difficulties and result on crop May 23, 1892 

1 126 Returned home after a four-week absence to Kansas 
City, Chicago and Minneapolis to attend convention 
to which he was an alternate from his Congressional 
district and make arrangements to handle the 
Eldorado Kansas gas and electric light plant; disposal 
of bonds in the Eldorado plant; description of trip; 
future financial plans 

June 19, 1892 

1 127 Dealings with bank examiner and assessment; 
financial matters 

June 25, 1892 

1 128 Handling property; financial matters June 27, 1892 

1 129 Interview with bank examiner; future plans regarding 
financial matters 

July 6, 1892 

1 130 Correspondence with bank examiner; financial plans July 9, 1892 

1 131 Nelson note to be paid; financial matters July 23, 1892 

1 132 Talk with bank examiner; not to worry about 
assessment and his share of it 

August 22, 1892 

1 133 Talk with bank examiner; figures for “charge-offs”; 
financial matters; Allcutts’ move to Australia 

August 29, 1892 

1 134 Jackman making money and paying off old debts; 
financial matters 

September 5, 1892 

1 135 Paying assessment; financial matters September 6, 1892 

1 136 Meeting Ada in Kansas City; financial matters; wish to 
have him visit 

September 15, 1892 

1 137 Financial matters September 23, 1892 

1 138 Financial matters; electric light plan in operation; 
getting papers for mortgage and bonds on the plant 
and conferring with parties regarding sale of same; 
thoughts about his financial difficulties and how well 
his father provided for his family 

October 21, 1892 

1 139 Sending prospectus and hopes it will find buyers for 
the bonds; financial matters 

November 2, 1892 

1 140 Trial in suit of Bank v. Merryfield; winter weather; 
settled in El Dorado; invitation for him to stay with 
them 

December 19, 1892 

1 141 Lawsuit; news of Allcutts in Australia; progress of December 28, 1892 
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Box Folder Subject  Date 

plant 

1 142 Enjoyed and are returning letters; winter weather; 
progress on manufacturing gas and condition of pipes 

January 14, 1893 

1 143 Kansas wheat crop; description of surroundings; 
current events 

May 28, 1893 

1 144 Financial assistance; business matters November 13, 1893 

1 145 Assistance from others Undated fragment 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XII: Adolph Gilbert to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert  
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

1 146 Coming home to study until examination for high 
school; recent windy weather; suffering from 
symptoms of diptheria 

March 22, 1868 

1 147 Written on Cornell University letterhead; recent 
correspondence; plans to get weighed soon; 
description of school activities; weather; false fire 
alarm 

October 1, 1871 

1 148 Financial matters at school; description of school 
activities; receiving correspondence 

October 21, 1871 

1 149 Health concerns; Thanksgiving celebration; recent 
activities 

November 29, 1874 

1 150 Financial difficulties; future plans; recent family 
activities 

December 11, 1875 

1 151 Recent activities  December 19, 1875 

1 152 Christmas celebrations December 23, 1875 

1 153 Need for money preventing him from returning 
home; business matters 

November 1, 1876 

1 154 Returning home; financial difficulties; future business 
prospects 

November 29, 1876 

1 155 Leaving for Evanston; Thanksgiving activities December 2, 1876 

1 156 Prospects of spring trade; business matters; returning 
to Elland 

January 7, 1877 

1 157 Description of place at Austin; future plans  February 25, 1877 

1 158 News of family and acquaintances; description of 
activities in Texas 

March 4, 1877 

1 159 News of family; description of activities in Texas March 11, 1877 

1 160 Description of activities in Austin; future plans; recent 
sickness 

March 18, 1877 

1 161 Recent activities in Austin March 25, 1877 

1 162 News of family and acquaintances; matter of keeping March 30, 1877 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

Nellie’s horse; disagreement with father’s ways 

1 163 Recent activities in Austin April 1, 1877 

1 164 Recent activities in Austin April 8, 1877 

1 165 Business matters April 10, 1877 

1 166 Safe arrival in Menardille May 5, [1877] 

1 167 Recent activities in New Orleans; description of travel 
there 

May 21, 1877 

1 168 Recent activities April 20, 1878 

1 169 Fire and plans for future; financial matters; recent 
activities 

December 4 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XIII: Adolph Gilbert to Ophia D. Smith 
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

1 169A Family history; Alfred Gilbert’s work on Cincinnati 
sewers; development of engineering problems in 
Cincinnati; Gilbert’s Civil War service; contraband 
negroes; Nellie Allcutt’s children 

 

1 170 Recent activities; visit to the San Diego Exposition; 
news of acquaintances; Elland attic contents; family 
papers; other family matters 

June 30, 1932 

1 171 Richards and Gilbert families and traditions; interest 
in same 

July 31, 1932 

1 172 Books on Col. Gilbert and Elland; financial value of the 
Elland collection and Miami University’s interest in 
same 

December 22, 1934 

1 173 Recovery from influenza; seeing Elland March 13, 1935 

1 174 Upcoming visit August 23, 1935 

1 175 Editing the Elland book; information about courtship 
and marriage of parents 

February 20, 1936 

1 176 Delay in issuing the Richards book; family information February 6, 1937 

1 177 Information about Clara Dick, a friend in Hamilton, 
Ohio, and details she recalls about early Butler 
County, Ohio history 

April 27, 1937 

1 178 Recent activities June 7, 1937 

1 179 Miscellaneous envelopes from Adolph Gilbert to 
Ophia Smith 

Undated 
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Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XIV: Alfred W. Gilbert to Clem Allcutt  
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

2 1 Enclosing check for amount of bills paid by him; 
status of roofing project 

November 25, 1884 

2 2 Enclosing check to pay Thomson for the photo; 
disposed of CH&D stock shares; weather 

March 21, 1885 

2 3 Since heirs are not disposed to sell house, 
recommends he purchase his interest and the 
property would be his to manage and care for until he 
dies; financial matters 

September 5, 1885 

2 4 Sending check; hoped he would purchase his interest 
in managing property 

September 16, 1885 

2 5 Allcutt Packing Company plans; plans for price of 
house 

November 17, 1885 

2 6 Adolph’s plans to travel to Fargo Springs to help 
organize the new bank starting there; wishes he 
would send a draft for his portion of the house 

April 22, 1886 

2 7 Shares of stock in National Bank of Kansas City; state 
of the First National Bank in Minneapolis, Kansas; 
financial matters 

January 8, 1891 

2 8 Failure of the American National of Kansas City; fate 
of the National Bank of Kansas City 

January 19, 1891 

2 9 Financial matters January 29, 1891 

2 10 How he is doing in Australia January 15, 1894 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XV: Alfred W. Gilbert to Nellie Gilbert Allcutt  
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

2 11 Transfer of lots 62 & 63 from Elizabeth Richards 
Gilbert to her 

November 21, 1887 

2 12 Thanks for 75th birthday gift February 9, 1891 

2 13 Recent activities  December 17, 1898 

2 14 Recent activities; activities in Australia and plans to 
return home; news of acquaintances 

September 27, 1899 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XVI:  Alfred W. Gilbert to Edwin J. Carpenter 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

2 15 Thanks for assistance in financial matters December 9, 1890 
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Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XVII: Alfred W. Gilbert to Adolph Gilbert  
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

2 16 Financial matters February 9, 1882 

2 17 Encloses check; mortgage terms; financial matters; 
family news 

February 21, 1882 

2 18 Sheep farming; advice on financial matters March 1, 1882 

2 19 Financial matters March 5, 1882 

2 20 Rush matter; other financial matters March 16, 1882 

2 21 Family matters; financial matters regarding the Bank 
of Minneapolis 

March 26, 1882 

2 22 Draft on American Exchange National Bank of New 
York; plans for visit 

April 18, 1882 

2 23 Results of visit; family matters; his business prospects 
and advice regarding same 

July 19, 1882 

2 24 Investment they have been contemplating; preferred 
arrangement for same; Campbell and Fairfield 
purchases 

October 28, 1882 

2 25 Kansas investments November 9, 1882 

2 26 Investing in Kansas lands November 9, 1882 

2 27 Campbell tract; prospects in Minneapolis; advice 
regarding same 

November 22, 1882 

2 28 Fairfield and Campbell matter; family news December 5, 1882 

2 29 Tract of land; thoughts of business matters December 10, 1882 

2 30 Christmas presents December 15, 1882 

2 31 Campbell matter; business matters January 16, 1883 

2 32 Leaving Bennington for Minneapolis; advice regarding 
business prospects; financial matters 

March 4, 1883 

2 33 Purchase of farm March 12, 1883 

2 34 Unable to help him; topographical map showing the 
position of stone in 1855-1856 

March 13, 1883 

2 35 Interest coupon; sowing oats and clover; Campbell 
matter 

March 29, 1883 

2 36 Unable to come to Kansas; Campbell mortgage April 28, 1883 

2 37 Payment of note; new note; Christmas gift and 
activities 

December 28, 1883 

2 38 Plans to go into the banking business; financial 
matters 

January 29, 1884 

2 39 Banking business; merging notes; financial matters February 5, 1884 

2 40 Financial matters; mortgage and note June 25, 1884 

2 41 Check; mortgage statement; disposal of bonds June 17, 1884 



Gilbert-Richards Papers 
Page 32 

 

Box Folder Subject Date 

2 42 Coupon for note; financial matters July  15, 1887 

2 43 Sale of Cormack’s abstract books; advice regarding 
same 

July 19, 1884 

2 44 Financial matters August 7, 1884 

2 45 Financial matters August 20, 1887 

2 46 Interest coupon and check; death of brother Thomas August 29, 1884 

2 47 Interest coupons  October 22, 1884 

2 48 Financial matters November 12, 1884 

2 49 Sending Anderson note; travel to Nellie’s in Kansas 
City 

December 16, 1884 

2 50 Travel to Kansas City; financial matters December 31, 1887 

2 51 Mortgage note; financial matters February 19, 1885 

2 52 Check and interest coupon; financial matters March 23, 1885 

2 53 Notes and mortgages; difficulty with eyes; plans to 
sell corn and hogs 

April 21, 1885 

2 54 Financial matters; advice on farming; travel plans September 8, 1885 

2 55 Check; rheumatism; travel plans September 12, 1885 

2 56 Financial matters December 3, 1885 

2 57 Financial matters January 4, 1886 

2 58 Travel plans; financial matters January 8, 1886 

2 59 Financial matters March 16, 1886 

2 60 Bank at Fargo; financial matters March 19, 1886 

2 61 Plans to visit Kansas; friend’s interest in investing 
money in bank 

March 21, 1886 

2 62 Bank at Fargo March 24, 1886 

2 63 Schwartz  lot; payments for same August 9, 1886 

2 64 Schwartz lot; proposition regarding same August 10, 1886 

2 65 Schwartz lot; financial matters August 17, 1886 

2 66 Abstract books and their sale; financial matters; crop August 2, 1887 

2 67 Financial matters; purchasing real estate November 15, 1887 

2 68 Travel plans and weather conditions at home April 13, 1888 

2 69 Staying at home because of lumbago attack  April 22, 1888 

2 70 Campbell matter; weather’s effect on crops; Elland May 15, 1888 

2 71 Financial matters May 30, 1888 

2 72 Activities at Elland; financial matters  August 10, 1888 

2 73 Business prospects in Kansas; anticipated effects of 
Cleveland’s re-election  

September 17, 1888 

2 74 Financial matters June 3, 1889 

2 75 Financial matters and re-discounts June 12, 1889 

2 76 Financial matters; plans to come to Kansas July 3, 1890 

2 77 W.C. Buchanan’s death; purchase of Merryfield’s July 20, 1890 



Gilbert-Richards Papers 
Page 33 

 

Box Folder Subject Date 

stock 

2 78 Activities at Elland; Kansas farming July 27, 1890 

2 79 Advice on financial matters; news of acquaintances August 5, 1890 

2 80 Terms of certificate; Josie Richards’ death August 14, 1890 

2 81 Financial matters; Campbell note August 26, 1890 

2 82 Merryfield stock; financial matters October 22, 1890 

2 83 Resignation as president of the First National Bank of 
Minneapolis, Kansas  

July 8, 1891 

2 84 Financial matters August 10, 1891 

2 85 Paying rent of orchard addition to Mr. Jackman September 9, 1891 

2 86 Merryfield financial matters November 3, 1891 

2 87 Financial matters November 22, 1891 

2 88 Plans to come to Kansas; Merryfield matter December 30, 1891 

2 89 Financial matters January 3, 1892 

2 90 Purchase of horse; Allcutts going to Australia April 4, 1892 

2 91 Agreement by Binns regarding $2500 note; financial 
matters 

April 11, 1892 

2 92 Bank statement April 22, 1892 

2 93 Financial matters June 21, 1892 

2 94 Letter to Merryfield July 1, 1892 

2 95 Interest due on note; financial matters with Jackman August 31, 1892 

2 96 Financial matters September 2, 1892 

2 97 Financial matters September 8, 1892 

2 98 Sale of stock September 10, 1892 

2 99 Sale of stock; financial matters September 20, 1892 

2 100 Growth of Cincinnati; activities at Elland July 15, 1894 

2 101 Difficulty in obtaining money; poor crops; constant 
expenses; necessity of stopping financial assistance 

September 13, 1894 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XVIII: Alfred W. Gilbert to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

2 102 Meetings in Brooklyn; arrangements for her going to 
Chicago; activities in New York 

June 15, 1860 

2 103 Her attack of dysentery; news from home August 12, 1860 

2 104 Written from St. Charles, Missouri; traveling with 
artillery, cavalry and the 39th & 27th Ohio Infantry 
Regiments; sending African-Americans north to help 
on farms, if the government would provide them with  
transportation 

September 7, 1861 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

2 105 Written from Camp Fremont, Missouri; had picture 
taken; difficulty of receiving letters 

September 10, 1861 

2 106 Waiting for reinforcements in Kansas City, Missouri; 
disagrees with decisions made by military leaders; 
need for cavalry; description of Kansas City and its 
people; thoughts about Lincoln’s modification of 
Fremont’s proclamation  

September 29, 1861 

2 107 Still awaiting movement in Kansas City, Missouri; 
difficulty of receiving orders from Fremont due to 
Secessionist control of country  

October 6, 1861 

2 108 Will march the next day from Kansas City, Missouri; 
difficulty of military movements and of Fremont’s 
position; picture of sister Ellen  

October 10, 1861 

2 109 Difficulties of receiving mail in Kansas City, Missouri; 
need for educated military men to take charge of 
regiments; plans for next movement 

October 13, 1861 

2 110 Movement from Kansas City to Camp Nixon on Brush 
Creek, Missouri 

October 16, 1861 

2 111 Written from Camp Nixon near Westport, Missouri; 
description of travel to Harrisonville; Indians leading 
army through Kansas City 

October 17, 1861 

2 112 Difficulty of receiving mail at Kansas City, Missouri; 
reputation of Ohio troops; wish to have her see Dr. 
Nixon’s wife 

October 17, 1861 

2 113 Left Camp Nixon and traveled 14 miles to Camp No. 3 
at Pleasant Hill, Missouri; description of countryside 

October 19, 1861 

2 114 Rations; travel to Pleasant Hill; description of 
countryside near the camp on banks of the Osage 
River at Osceola, Missouri 

October 23, 1861 

2 115 Description of campsite at Camp Jim Lane on the 
other side of the Osage River; activities of troops; 
condition of Southern troops 

October 24, 1861 

2 116 Reached Camp No. 12 at Greenfield, Missouri after 
marching for two days; waiting for Gen. Pope; Gen. 
Seigel’s position; activities of troops 

October 28, 1861 

2 117 Written from camp on Wilson Creek near Springfield, 
Missouri; Fremont superceded; hoping that regiment 
is moved to Kentucky; forced march to Springfield 

November 2, 1861 

2 118 Current condition of regiment; plans to march from 
camp near Springfield, Missouri the next morning; 
possibility of forming a new Ohio brigade under one 
general 

November 8, 1861 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

2 119 Written from camp on the Pome de Terre River on 
way to St. Louis; plans for position in battle; hopes to 
come home for Christmas 

November 13, 1861 

2 120 Condition of regiment at camp at Vidalia, Missouri; 
going to St. Louis; request for flannel shirts 

November 16, 1861 

2 121 First death in regiment; condition of troops at camp 
22 near Sedalia; no signs of forward movement 

November 19, 1861 

2 122 Written from St. Louis, Missouri; need for clothing; 
hoping for furlough to come home for Christmas 

November 24, 1861 

2 123 Paying saddlery bill; anticipates being at Sedalia for 
some time 

November 24, 1861 

2 124 Pleasant nature of camp life at St. Louis, Missouri; 
hopes to be home for Christmas  

November 27, 1861 

2 125 Written from Syracuse, Missouri; receipt of clothing 
and enjoyment of other items sent; encouraging her 
not to be downhearted 

December 1861 

2 126 Received orders to move 14 miles east from Sedalia, 
Missouri to obtain a better camp ground and 
consolidate forces; supplies for troops and hospital; 
need for businessmen to manage the military 

December 3, 1861 

2 127 Disappointment in not obtaining a leave and in 
difficulty of mail delivery; wish to have her come to 
headquarters at Sedalia, Missouri 

December 7, 1861 

2 128 Difficulty of obtaining leaves of absence; requests 
new pair of overshoes; thoughts of coming home and 
obtaining a position in the Army; description of 
headquarters at Syracuse, Missouri; inspection of 
hospital 

December 15, 1861 

2 129 Sketch of headquarters at Syracuse, Missouri as 
Christmas present; difficulty in receiving packages; 
enjoyment of receiving box from sister Ellen 

December 23, 1861 

2 130 Thankfulness for their condition during the war; 
thoughts about the coming year and having sister 
Ellen visit Syracuse, Missouri 

December 31, 1861 

2 131 Written from Syracuse, Missouri; glad that Ellen did 
not visit because of troops’  impending movement; 
upcoming plans for regiment 

January 11, 1862 

2 132 Regiment’s new brass band performing for Mrs. 
Nixon; looking to fill two lieutenant vacancies; first 
death in their hospital at Syracuse, Missouri 

January 16, 1862 

2 133 Written from Syracuse, Missouri; her difficulty in 
finding help; giving Secessionists money for supplies 

January 22, 1862 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

2 134 Written from Syracuse, Missouri; thankfulness for 
their blessings; correcting her impression that he did 
not want a furlough and of his drinking habits 

January 26, 1862 

2 135 Received marching orders to go from Camp Church to 
Boonville to join Col. Groesbeck north of the Missouri 
River; need for overcoat and pants 

January 29, 1862 

2 136 Description of surroundings at Boonville, Missouri 
and march 

February 3, 1862 

2 137 Anxiousness to leave Missouri; how troops are 
adopting to their circumstances 

February 12, 1862 

2 138 Dreary desolateness of headquarters at St. Louis, 
Missouri and the situation in general 

March 2, 1862 

2 139 Arrived at Commerce, Missouri to find that all troops 
are gone with Gen. Pope; leaving with a small 
detachment of cavalry for New Madrid 

March 5, 1862 

2 140 Enemy burning houses in New Madrid; men bore 
themselves well in skirmishes, with compliment from 
Gen. Pope 

[March 8, 1862] 

2 141 Description of camp near Madrid, Missouri; advice on 
fixing up old carriage 

March 10, 1862 

2 142 Gun boats will leave Cairo in the next day; expect to 
clear out rebels soon; Dr. Nixon appointed medical 
director to all forces under Gen. Pope 

March 11, 1862 

2 143 Parting from Dr. Nixon; arriving at camp near Madrid, 
Missouri and ground selected for battle; placing 
battery there and taking forces by surprise; 
description of battle  

March 14, 1862 

2 144 Newspaper accounts of Gen. Pope’s planned 
movements 

March 18, 1862 

2 145 Thoughts about enjoying letters from home; situation 
of troops at camp near Madrid, Missouri 

March 23, 1862 

2 146 Evacuation of island and capture of 4000-5000 men; 
crossing the Mississippi  

April 9, 1862 

2 147 On board Steamer Admiral on Mississippi River, near 
1st Chickasaw Bluffs; divisions traveling to Memphis 

April 13, 1862 

2 148 Written from camp at Iuka Springs, Mississippi; 
thoughts about her safety in Cincinnati and that war 
is a miserable farce 

September 9, 1862 

2 149 Written from Cincinnati, Ohio; directions about what 
to do with corn crop and other home matters 

May 23, 1871 

2 150 Written from Cincinnati, Ohio; her advice on best 
plan of action on where to live 

September 19, 1872 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

2 151 Written from St. Louis, Michigan; farming instructions 
for Adolph; other home matters 

August 14, 1873 

2 152 Written from St. Louis, Michigan; travel plans; news 
of her trip 

August 18, 1873 

2 153 Written from St. Louis, Michigan; recovering from 
illness 

August 20, 1873 

2 154 Commands of Maj. King  and Gen. Sturgis; description 
of country near St. Charles; actions of people living in 
the area  

Undated fragment 

2 155 Reflections about their life together Undated fragment 

2 156 Uncertainty of how long he will be in current location Undated: Thursday 26  

2 157 Enjoyment of looking at family’s recent picture; 
spring operations and how they impact family plans 

Undated  

2 158 Expects to go to Commerce on the steamer Empress Undated  

2 159 Description of New Madrid; recent burial of another 
member of his regiment 

 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XIX: Alfred W. Gilbert’s Civil War Invoices and Army Documents 
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

2 160 Receipt from A. Jacobson for 27,000 rounds June 17, 1862 

2 161 Letter from A. Jacobson to Alfred W. Gilbert 
requesting rifled muskets 

July 24, 1862 

2 162 William H. Neuman’s receipt for rifles, bayonets, 
scabbards, frogs, cartridge boxes and belts, and cap 
pouches from Alfred W. Gilbert  

July 26, 1862 

2 163 Invoice of ordnance and ordnance stores turned over 
by Henry T. McDowell, Major 39th OVI, to Alfred W. 
Gilbert 

July 26, 1862 

2 164 Receipt from George W. Baker to Alfred W. Gilbert for 
55 Whitman rifles, swords, bayonets, scabbards, & 
frogs  

July 26, 1862 

2 165 Invoice of ordnance and ordnance stores from J. P. 
Harper 

July 28, 1862 

2 166 Receipt from A. Jacobson to Alfred W. Gilbert for 
guns, bayonets and cartridges 

July 31, 1862 

2 167 Letter from Alfred W. Gilbert to W.H. Lathrop 
regarding his resignation as colonel of the 39th 
Regiment, Ohio Volunteer Infantry 

August 11, 1862 

2 168 Invoices and receipts from Charles R. Thompson for 
ordnance and ordnance stores 

September 23, 1862 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

2 169 Invoice from Charles R. Thompson for ordnance and 
ordnance stores 

September 26, 1862 

2 170 Letter from Daniel Weber to Alfred W. Gilbert 
enclosing invoices and receipts of ordnance stores 

April 15, 1863 

2 171 Letter from Daniel Weber to Alfred W. Gilbert 
enclosing invoices and receipts of ordnance turned 
over by Henry T. McDowell in July 1862 

April 12, 1864 

2 172 Letter from Alfred W. Gilbert to Daniel Weber, Adjt. 
Gen. 39th Ohio Infantry, regarding receipt of invoices 
and receipts for Co. A 

April 18, 1864 

2 173 Letter from Henry A. Babbitt to Alfred W. Gilbert 
forwarding receipts, invoices, and other documents 
of ordnance stores 

April 22, 1864 

2 174 Alfred W. Gilbert’s application for the Military Order 
of the Loyal Legion of the United States 

Ca. 1890-1899 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XX: Alfred W. Gilbert’s Pension for Civil War Service 
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

2 175 Resignation of Alfred W. Gilbert as Colonel, 39th 
Regiment, Ohio Infantry Volunteers 

October 23, 1862 

2 176 Letter from L. Simpson to Alfred W. Gilbert regarding 
Simpson’s application for a pension 

July 23, 1888 

2 177 Letter from R. K. Shaw to Alfred W. Gilbert regarding 
entitlement to travel pay 

August 2, 1888 

2 178 Letter from Alfred W. Gilbert to R.K. Shaw regarding 
decision not to pursue action, but to help Nixon 

September 10, 1888 

2 179 Letter from Alfred W. Gilbert to R.K. Shaw sending 
completed certificate regarding Nixon 

November 14, 1888 

2 180 Letter from Alfred W. Gilbert to R.K. Shaw sending 
completed paper for pension 

November 23, 1888 

2 181 Letter from Alfred W. Gilbert to Gen. W.S. Rosencrans 
regarding applying for a pension 

November 23, 1888 

2 182 Letter from Alfred W. Gilbert to John A. Follett 
regarding applying for a pension 

November 23, 1888 

2 183 Letter from R.K. Shaw to Alfred W. Gilbert regarding 
pension papers 

November 26, 1888 

2 184 Letter from Alfred W. Gilbert to R.K. Shaw regarding 
corrected papers for family physician, Dr. Bradford 

December 17, 1888 

2 185 Letter from R. K. Shaw to Alfred W. Gilbert regarding 
order for him to be examined by and before the 

February 11, 1889 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

board at Hamilton, Ohio regarding his pension case 

2 186 Letter from Alfred W. Gilbert to Dr. Bradford 
regarding his testimony as physician for the purpose 
of filing it in his claim for pension 

February 12, 1889 

2 187 Letter from Alfred W. Gilbert to R.K. Shaw regarding 
sending papers to Dr. Bradford 

April 13, 1889 

2 188 Letter from Henry Phillips to Alfred W. Gilbert November 1, 1890 

2 189 Letter from R.K. Shaw to Alfred W. Gilbert regarding 
rate of pension 

November 5, 1890 

2 190 Notification of disallowance of Gilbert’s claim for pay February 5, 1897 

2 191 Edward Bowers’ letter to Rodney K. Shaw regarding 
suspension of action on Gilbert’s appeal 

July 7, 1897 

2 192 R.K. Shaw’s appeal of rejection of Gilbert’s claim for 
pay and travel pay 

July 21, 1897 

2 193 R.K. Shaw’s cover note sending paper for Gilbert to 
execute in travel pay case 

July 21, 1897 

2 194 Affidavit regarding Alfred W. Gilbert’s travel pay 1897 

2 195 Notification of allowance to Gilbert for travel pay 
from Corinth, Mississippi to Cincinnati, Ohio 

January 5, 1898 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXI: Correspondence about Alfred W. Gilbert  
 

Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

3 1 C. 
Donaldson 
& Co.  

Stetson 
Avery & Co. 

Letter of introduction 
for Alfred Gilbert  on his 
upcoming visit to New 
Orleans 

November 21, 1835 

3 2 D.S. Stanley Ohio 
Governor 
David Tod 

Recommendation letter 
for Alfred W. Gilbert to 
re-enter the service 

November 20, 1862 

3 3 D.S. Cauley Ohio 
Governor 
David Tod 

Recommending 
appointment of Alfred 
W. Gilbert for another 
commission 

March 28, 1863 

3 4 D.S. Stanley R.K. Shaw Cannot give a personal 
certificate as to Col. 
Gilbert’s injuries at the 
battle of Corinth 

February 5, 1889 
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Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXII: Miscellaneous Correspondence to Alfred W. Gilbert  
 

Box Folder Author Subject Date 

3 5 [Charles W. Gilbert] Presence of cholera near 
Westland Farm; interest in 
trading with Mr. Williamson for 
the farm 

August 4, 1849 

3 6 C.P. Buckingham Notification of his appointment 
as Lieutenant Colonel of the 30th 
Regiment of the Ohio Volunteer 
Infantry 

July 27, 1861 

3 7 [Charles Gilbert] Weather; Christmas activities; 
walk to Colerain for the mail; 
travel to Cincinnati regarding 
pork 

December 22, 1861 

3 8 N.B. Buford Sending copy of letter sent to 
Governor Tod recommending 
Gilbert’s appointment as a 
captain in some regiment 

March 10, 1863 

3 9 D.S. Stanley His interest in rejoining the 
service 

March 28, 1863 

3 10 John C. White Susan Malow’s mother is 
anxious to hear how she is 

April 14, 1863 

3 11 Samuel Nicolson Closing business between Mr. 
Kilgour and himself 

January 9, 1864 

3 12 C.H. Kilgour Business with Mr. Nicolson January 14, 1864 

3 13 Samuel Nicolson Deed for sale of patent for 
wooden pavement to Mr. 
Kilgour 

January 25, 1864 

3 14 Samuel Nicolson Deed in favor of Mr. Kilgour for 
the right to his patent for paving 
within a radius of ten miles 
around City Hall 

February 9, 1864 

3 15 C.H. Kilgour Saw Mr. Pugh and is sending 
fixed limits for deed containing 
same 

February 12, 1864 

3 16 W.H. Bradley Sewer connections August 11, 1873 

3 17 Strickland Kneall Sewer matters August 13, 1873 

3 18 William Wise Sewer system in St. Louis August 14, 1873 

3 19 J.W. Adams Sewer system in Brooklyn, New 
York 

August 15, 1873 

3 20 E.S. Cherbrough Sewer system in Chicago, Illinois August 15, 1873 
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3 21 Samuel L. Smedley Sewer system in Philadelphia, 
Pennsylvania 

January 23, 1874 

3 22 Samuel Nicolson Plan of proposed territory and 
deed for same 

February 17, 1864 

3 23 Samuel Nicolson Check from Mr. Kilgour  February 27, 1864 

3 24 Samuel B. Smith Discharge of Captain Henry 
Richards from the 93rd Regt. 
O.V.I. on December 27, 1864 

May 1, 1883 

3 25 Mayor Amor Smith, 
Jr. 

Kansas City forms of contract for 
paving streets 

May 25, 1885 

3 26 M.D. Ross Plans for a visit September 6, 1885 

3 27 Mayor Amor Smith, 
Jr. 

Honorary pall bearer’s ticket October 1886 

3 28 J. Gilbert Mortgage July 9, 1887 

3 29 J.S. Adair, City 
National Bank 

Thanks for remembrance January 1, 1892 

3 30 George Richards Ability to pay him and others he 
owes 

March 14, 1892 

3 31 G.O. Shields, The 
Pecos Irrigation and 
Improvement 
Company 

Enclosing statement written by 
Jay Gould about his recent visit 
in the Pecos Valley  

April 4, 1892 

3 32 Waldo O. Ross Sending volumes for his library  April 25, 1892 

3 33 Alfred M. Allen Hoffman’s delinquencies April 29, 1892 

3 34 Waldo O. Ross Sending box of books June 25, 1892 

3 35 A.E. Painter Rent of orchard November 8, 1892 

3 36 A.E. Painter Land deeded to a man  November 16, 1892 

3 37 H.E. Scudder, The 
Atlantic Monthly 

Course pursued by The Atlantic November 25, 1892 

3 38 Frank Bruner Printing roster of the 39th O.V.I. 
Association 

December 10, 1892 

3 39 Martin Pinney Thanks for invitation to visit; 
conversation with Paul A.T. 
Huston regarding lectures; 
organization of literary club 

January 2, 1893 

3 40 Russell Hinman Eclectic Physical Geography January 25, 1893 

3 41 Horace N. 
Woodward 

Thanks for Christmas gift; news 
of family 

January 30, 1893 

3 42 A.H. Cline, 
Investors Advisory 
Company 

Contribution to the Francisco 
fund 

March 16, 1893 

3 43 A.Hickenlooper Being given a place in the May 2, 1893 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

exercises due to his services to 
Cincinnati 

3 44 George Richards Thanks for entertainment at 
Elland Decoration Day 

June 6, 1893 

3 45 George Richards Written to commemorate his 
50th birthday  

August 23, 1893 

3 46 George Richards Recommendation for 
superintendent of the Ohio 
Humane Society 

September 10, 1893 

3 47 Frank Bruner Attending reunion on October 4 September 23, 1893 

3 48 H.E. Scudder, The 
Atlantic Monthly 

Subscription to The Atlantic; his 
writing of the Bradley books 

December 18, 1893 

3 49 A.Hickenlooper Thoughts about the past; update 
on recent activities 

December 19, 1893 

3 50 William Cornelia Clipping regarding the deposit of 
G.W. Gilbert in the First National 
Bank of Newport, Kentucky 

February 5, 1897 

3 51 Caroline Cathcart 
Day 

Recent activities; religious 
matters; Elland; news of family  

March 26, 1897 

3 52 Jacob Bettman, 
Nathan Plaut & Co. 

Poem, “The Frost,” by Hannah F. 
Gould, in the Tribune  

December 21, 1899 

3 53 Mrs. D.M. Wilson Location of poem, “The Frost,” 
by Hannah F. Gould 

December 23, 1899 

3 54 C.E.C. Invitation to dinner October 24 

3 55 D.S. Stanley Sacrifices of going into service December 11, 
[1863] 

3 56 Eleanor B. Kinmont Location of poem, “The Frost,” 
by Hannah F. Gould 

December 20 

3 57 C.V. Answering his curiosity on a 
particular matter 

Undated 

3 58 C.V. His illness; news of 
acquaintances 

Undated 

3 59 C.V. Change in plans Undated 

3 60 K.V. Contest Undated 

3 61 Ada H. Hewlett Fragment of letter Undated 

3 62 Ada H. Hewlett Financial matters; working at 
upcoming conference; Kansas 
depression 

Undated 

3 63 R.R. Stetson Recovery from illness Undated 

3 64 R.R. Stetson Thoughts about his fate Undated 

3 65 R.R. Stetson Taking the buggy out again Undated 

3 66 R.R. Stetson Thoughts about his condition Undated 
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3 67 The Misses Cornelia Invitation to spend tomorrow 
evening with them 

Undated 

3 68 W.M. Gholson Governance of contract in 
correcting mistake 

Undated 

3 69 Terrence 
Daughtery 

Bid for brick culvert Undated 

3 70 W.G. Halprin Bill for recording surveys made 
inside corporate limits for the 
last two years 

Undated 

3 71 George H. 
Pendleton 

Change of grade of Hunt Street 
east of Pendleton Street 

Undated 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXIII: Miscellaneous Correspondence from Alfred W. Gilbert  
 

Box Folder Recipient Subject Date 

3 72 Giles Richards Difference of opinion regarding 
business matters 

December 28, 1847 

3 73 Giles Richards Advertisement offering the 
Cooper place for sale; selling the 
bridge stock; advertising house 
and lot soon 

February 9, 1856 

3 74 Giles Richards Sending power of attorney for 
conveying the bridge stock 

March 17, 1856 

3 75 Giles Richards Payment of bridge stock April 11, 1856 

3 76 C.P. Buckingham, 
Adjutant General’s 
Office 

Accepts appointment as 
Lieutenant Colonel of the 30th 
Regiment of the Ohio Volunteer 
Infantry 

July 30, 1861 

3 77 C.P. Buckingham, 
Adjutant General’s 
Office 

Accepts appointment as 
Lieutenant Colonel of the 30th 
Regiment of the Ohio Volunteer 
Infantry 

July 30, 1861 

3 78 Children Written on United States Capitol 
letterhead; description of 
Washington, D.C., including the 
Capitol building, streets, sweet 
sweepers, White House grounds 

March 6, 1863 

3 79 S.F. Cary Selling land and house in 
Colerain 

December 10, 1863 

3 80 S. Nicolson Rail for streets January 21, 1864 

3 81 S. Nicolson Deed conveying patent right February 13, 1864 
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explicit in defining exact 
boundaries 

3 82 S. Hickson Payment by Mr. Kilgour on deed 
of patent right for street 
precinct 

February 24, 1864 

3 83 S. Nicolson Kilgour destroyed two deeds 
first sent; compensation 

February 25, 1864 

3 84 Niece Thanksgiving activities; family 
update 

December 5, 1882 

3 85 Niece Family activities December 31, 1882 

3 86 [Charles Gilbert] Notice of Elizabeth Richards 
Gilbert’s death  

November 16, 1884 

3 87 Charles Gilbert Giving up housekeeping; plans 
for visit and engineering career 
prospects 

November 26, 1884 

3 88 Charles Gilbert Changed plans for a visit November 26, 1884 

3 89 Charles Gilbert Visiting him in Louisville; 
financial matters 

July 1, 1887 

3 90 Niece Congratulations on wedding; 
family activities  

July 26, 1887 

3 91 C. Buchanan Visiting New York and Boston on 
business; plans to get together  

September 16, 1888 

3 92 Unknown Republican victory; Cincinnati 
exposition 

November 8, 1888 

3 93 H.L. Morey Invoked pension; need of money March 15, 1890 

3 94 John Sherman Suffering of people in South 
Dakota; request to urge upon 
capitalists of large means the 
necessity of setting aside a 
portion of their worth for aiding 
and sustaining the unfortunate 

March 24, 1890 

3 95 John Sherman Obtaining aid for the suffering in 
Dakota 

March 31, 1890 

3 96 Seth Hunt Subscribers to stock in “Food 
Home & Garden”; relation to 
man from Cincinnati in New 
Orleans 

April 7, 1890 

3 97 Seth Hunt Relation to man from New 
Orleans 

April 14, 1890 

3 98 J.S. Adair Thanks for souvenir January 2, 1891 

3 99 Editor, Ohio Farmer Advertisement of F.C. 
Huntington of Indianapolis, 

April 25, 1893 
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Indiana offering “Dungan’s 
White Prolific Seed Corn” 

3 100 Editor, Ohio Farmer Sending for several more ears of 
“Dungan’s White Prolific Seed 
Corn”; wish to withdraw 
manuscript previously sent 

April 28, 1893 

3 101 Editor, Ohio Farmer “Dungan’s White Prolific Seed 
Corn”; request for address for 
same 

May 1, 1893 

3 102 Andy City Hall matter May 6, 1893 

3 103 Frank Bruner Attending reunion September 27, 1893 

3 104 Andy Thoughts about working 
together in the engineer’s office 
in the city building 

December 15, 1893 

3 105 Andy Plans for a visit December 27, 1893 

3 106 Postmaster, 
Alexandria, 
Kentucky 

Whereabouts of the heirs of his 
brother, Thomas Gilbert 

February 8, 1897 

3 107 Andy Entrusting a matter to him Undated 

3 108 John Wanamaker, 
Post Master 
General 

William Conclin’s application for 
postmaster of Newport, 
Kentucky 

Undated 

3 109 L. First What retrenchment can be 
made in the expense of his 
department regarding 
topographical survey  

Undated 

3 110 Mr. Scudder Appreciation of the excellence 
of the account of the “Hayes 
Tilden Electoral Commission” 

Undated 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXIV: Alfred W. Gilbert’s Cincinnati Civil Engineers Office Correspondence  
 

Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

4 1 N.B. Buford A.W. Gilbert Request to inspect 
road and bridges of 
the contract of 
tunnel and prepare 
a report of their 
condition 

October 2, 1838 

4 2 N.B. Buford Mr. Shoemaker Recommendation of 
Alfred W. Gilbert 

March 23, 1839 
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Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

due to his work as a 
rodman and 
assistant engineer 

4 3 James 
Cooper 

James Stewart Recommendation of 
Alfred W. Gilbert  

February 6, 1849 

4 4 L.L. Strong James Stewart Advertisement for 
paving materials  

March 26, 1849 

4 5 W.G. 
Halprin 

A.W. Gilbert Letter of 
introduction for 
William Mulvey, 
contractor on a line 
of Turnpike Road 

May 7, 1849 

4 6 A.W. Gilbert N. Wade Forwarding petitions 
regarding course of 
action  

January 22, 1851 

4 7 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Smith Passing resolution 
excepting the 
railroad action of 
council 

January 22, 1851 

4 8 W.G. 
Halprin 

A.W. Gilbert Low cost of levelling, 
profiles, plats of 
surveys and setting 
stakes  

August 19, 1851 

4 9 W.R. Bond A.W. Gilbert Request to call and 
inspect the work of 
pavement recently 
made there 

August 19, 185[1] 

4 10 N. 
Longworth 

A.W. Gilbert Width of Kemble 
and Richmond; 
information 
regarding deviation 

August 20, 1851 

4 11 John W. 
Erwin 

A.W. Gilbert Stone bridge below 
head of upper lock 
in Cincinnati  

September 10, 1851 

4 12 W.Y. 
Gholson 

Chairman of 
Grade 
Committee 

Lines of Longworth 
Street where it 
passes through the 
subdivision of A. 
Miles and H.H. 
Goodman 

October 23, 1851 

4 13 M. Fels City Council of 
Cincinnati 

Lowness of wooden 
bridge across 

October 29, 1851 
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Miami’s Erie Canal is 
an obstruction to 
navigation of the 
canal; request to 
have it raised to 
proper height within 
ten days 

4 14 M. 
Greenwood 

A.W. Gilbert Prepared to comply 
with his contract 
with the city  

November 1851 

4 15 W.S. 
Caldwell 

A.W. Gilbert Ordinance required 
for erection of 50 
lamps and to see if 
any parts of the city 
were lighted 

November 3, 1851 

4 16 N. 
Longworth 

Grade 
Committee of 
City Council 

Line of Court Street; 
removal of 
obstructions to 
avoid statute of 
limitations 

November 10, 1851 

4 17 J.R. Gibson City Council Mistake in copy by 
which the ordinance 
was passed for the 
grade for Celestial 
Street 

November 10, 1851 

4 18 E. 
Underwood 

A.W. Gilbert Request to open 
bids and ask for 
report on all grade 
committees 
business  

November 26, 1851 

4 19 Samuel 
Burdsal 

City Civil 
Engineers of 
Cincinnati 

Contract for paving 
west sidewalks of 
Spring Street 
between Woodward 
and Liberty Streets 

November 29, 1851 

4 20 E. 
Underwood 

A.W. Gilbert Property holders at 
Broadway and 
Harrison streets 
desirous of having a  
lamp  placed on the 
southeast corner are 
willing to pay for 

December 5, 1851 
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same 

4 21 N.T. 
Caldwell 

A.W. Gilbert Amount assessed on 
each lamp post for 
the first year 

December 12, 1851 

4 22 N. 
Longworth 

A.W. Gilbert Strangeness of his 
throwing down lines 
and cutting stakes; 
will hold him 
responsible for 
same 

February 5, 1852 

4 23 N. 
Longworth 

A.W. Gilbert Misunderstanding of 
tenants of bad 
treatment by his 
men 

February 9, 1852 

4 24 George 
Graham 

A.W. Gilbert Letter of 
introduction for 
William Bourne, 
engineer and 
draftsman from 
England 

February 25, 1852 

4 25 Joseph Ray A.W. Gilbert Meteorological 
register of heaviest 
rain experienced in 
Cincinnati 

April 15, 1852 

4 26 N. 
Longworth 

A.W. Gilbert No discovery of 
testimony proving 
the timber was 
brought into his 
culvert 

April 17, 1852 

4 27 M. French Mr. Hoke Will be gone from 
Cincinnati for a few 
days; requests his 
speedy action in 
grade of Auburn 
Street 

June 9, 1852 

4 28 Gas Office A.W. Gilbert Lamps on Columbia 
from Ludlow to 
Walnut were lighted 
June 15, 1852 

June 16, 1852 

4 29 W.S. 
Caldwell 

A.W. Gilbert Statement of 
expense on each 
lamp erected and 

June 17, 1852 
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ready for gas 

4 30 A.W. Gilbert Charles Fox Building a wall at 
the southeast end of 
Congress Street 
Bridge  

October 11, 1852 

4 31 Williams 
Adams & 
Co. 

A.W. Gilbert Building of Findlay 
Market House 

October 13, 1852 

4 32 J.T. Hogan A.W. Gilbert Impressions of a 
conversation 
between Mr. 
McClure and Gilbert 

October 16, 1852 

4 33 John Bates City Engineer Boulder pavement 
put down on Taylor 
Creek Road, near 
Western Avenue 
House, not done 
correctly  

October 25, 1852 

4 34 William G. 
Halprin 

A.W. Gilbert Grade of the north 
curb of Lower 
Market Street 
between Main and 
Sycamore Streets 

December 3, 1852 

4 35 A.W. Gilbert B.&M. Simon Co. Measurements of 
curb line for the 
curb of the north 
side of Lower 
Market Street 

December 4, 1852 

4 36 A.W. Gilbert P. McGrooty Opinion regarding 
assessments for gas  

January 15, 1853 

4 37 L. French A.W. Gilbert What 
retrenchments can 
be made without 
destroying its 
efficiency 

January 21, 1853 

4 38 E. Gest A.W. Gilbert Railroad 
measurements for 
south side of Neff 
lot north of old 
corporation line 

March 10, 1853 

4 39 Lewis 
Warden 

A.W. Gilbert Table of the 
comparative levels 

April 22, 1853 
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at the intersections 
of various streets 
with water works 

4 40 Theodore R. 
Scowden 

A.W. Gilbert Catalogue of 
reports, papers and 
information on 
sewerage in Europe  

April 22, 1853 

4 41 Cyrus 
Davenport 

A.W. Gilbert Amount necessary 
to defray expenses 
of office for next 
succeeding month 

May 18, 1853 

4 42 Cyrus 
Davenport 

A.W. Gilbert Estimate of amount 
of money necessary 
to defray expense of 
department for July 
1853 

June 22, 1853 

4 43 A.W. Gilbert William Adams Guttering and gutter 
columns of Findlay 
Market House 

July 1, 1853 

4 44 A.W. Gilbert William Adams Terms of contract 
for work on Findlay 
Market House 

August 15, 1853 

4 45 A.W. Gilbert William Adams Progression of work 
on Findlay Market 
House 

September 1, 1853 

4 46 A.W. Gilbert P. McGrooty Location of Hunt 
Street under several 
ordinances 
dedicating the same 

September 26, 1853 

4 47 A.W. Gilbert P. McGrooty Location of Hunt 
Street under several 
ordinances 
dedicating the same 

September 26, 1853 

4 48 A.W. Gilbert George H. 
Pendleton 

Passage of 
ordinance changing 
the location of Hunt 
Street east of 
Pendleton Street  

September 28, 1853 

4 49 George H. 
Pendleton 

A.W. Gilbert Pavement of Hunt 
Street without doing 
damage to lessees 
of property on 

October 1, 1853 
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South side; 
ordinance for same 

4 50 P. McGrooty A.W. Gilbert Needing authorities 
regarding fixed 
monuments 
governing course 
and distance 

October 3, 1853 

4 51 A.W. Gilbert Williams & 
Adams 

Request for 
immediate 
prosecution of the 
work on Findlay 
Market House 

October 10, 1853 

4 52 Williams & 
Adams 

A.W. Gilbert Findlay Market 
House will be 
completed in two 
weeks 

October 12, 1853 

4 53 A.W. Gilbert Williams & 
Adams 

Proceed with 
contract and 
complete work on 
Findlay Market 
House 

December 21, 1853 

4 54 A.W. Gilbert Hunnewell Hill & 
Co. 

Grading of North 
Elm Street 

December 30, 1853 

4 55 A.W. Gilbert P. McGrooty Opinion regarding 
assessments for gas 

January 15, 1854 

4 56 P. McGrooty A.W. Gilbert How a gas 
assessment shall be 
issued, as to the tax 
per foot, upon 
corner posts 

January 18, 1854 

4 57 A.W. Gilbert C. Davenport Amount of money 
needed for office for 
February 1854 

January 20, 1854 

4 58 City 
Commission
ers 

A.W. Gilbert Needs original draft 
and plan of the 
Findlay Market 
House to institute 
investigation into 
affairs of its building  

February 1854 

4 59 A.W. Gilbert C. Davenport Amount of funds 
needed for 
department for 

February 16, 1854 
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March 1854 

4 60 A.W. Gilbert C. Davenport Amount needed for 
department for 
March 1854 

February 17, 1854 

4 61 A.W. Gilbert P. McGrooty Opinion on 
assessment of tax 
for lighting a public 
lamp for the past 
year be collected in 
the absence of any 
contract between 
the city and the gas 
company 

February 22, 1854 

4 62 E.A. 
Ferguson 

J.H. Walker Opinion on changing 
a grade for a street 
after it has been 
established 

March 15, 1854 

4 63 A.W. Gilbert C. Davenport Amount of funds 
needed for office for 
April 1854 

March 21, 1854 

4 64 W.H. Bristol A.W. Gilbert Necessity of 
constructing drain in 
extending track in 
Front Street across 
Wood Street to 
depot grounds on 
east side of Wood 
Street 

March 21, 1854 

4 65 A.W. Gilbert Miles 
Greenwood 

Request for his 
opinion on the plan 
of construction, 
stability and 
workmanship of 
Findlay Market 
House 

March 29, 1854 

4 66 Miles 
Greenwood  

A.W. Gilbert Plan for Findlay 
Market House was 
good enough had it 
been properly 
carried out 

April 7, 1854 

4 67 A.W. Gilbert A.N. Craven Cost and practical 
working of the plan 

April 12, 1854 
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recently adopted in 
New York for 
sweeping streets 

4 68 A.W. Gilbert C. Davenport Amount needed for 
department for May 
1854 

April 27, 1854 

4 69 A.W. Gilbert C. Davenport Estimate of costs 
and expenses of Civil 
Engineer’s 
department for one 
year from March 1, 
1855 

April 27, 1854 

4 70 A.W. Gilbert R.C. Phillips Taking charge of and 
proceeding with 
topographical 
survey making of 
the city commencing 
at the east  line of 
Section 13 and 
working westward 

May 10, 1854 

4 71 A.W. Gilbert A. Taft Request for opinion 
on ordering a 
grading for a street 
after it has been 
established  

May 15, 1854 

4 72 Edward 
Woodruff 

A.W. Gilbert Opinion on city 
improvements and 
changing street 
grades 

May 15, 1854 

4 73 A.W. Gilbert C. Davenport Amount of money 
needed for 
department for June 
1854 

May 26, 1854 

4 74 George E. 
Sellers 

A.W. Gilbert Opinion about detail 
and workmanship of 
the plan of the 
Findlay Market 
Building’s roof  

May 29, 1854 

4 75 A.W. Gilbert B.F. Marsh Opinion on plan of 
construction, 
stability and 
workmanship of the 

June 1, 1854 
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Findlay Market 
House 

4 76 B.F. Marsh A.W. Gilbert Opinion of the plan 
of construction, 
stability and 
workmanship of 
Findlay Market 
House 

June 3, 1854 

4 77 A.W. Gilbert W.H. Clements Opinion of the 
construction, 
stability and 
workmanship of 
Findlay Market 
House 

June 10, 1854 

4 78 W.H. 
Clements 

A.W. Gilbert Opinion of the plan 
and condition of the 
Findlay Street 
Market 

June 13, 1854 

4 79 A.W. Gilbert P. McGrooty Opinion on the force 
and effect of liens 
taken on Findlay 
Market House by 
the subcontractors 

June 30, 1854 

4 80 A.W. Gilbert O.M. Mitchel Opinion on the plan 
of construction, 
stability and 
workmanship of 
Findlay Market 
House 

July 1, 1854 

4 81 O.M. 
Mitchel 

A.W. Gilbert Opinion on the plan 
of construction, 
stability and 
workmanship of 
Findlay Market 
House 

July 12, 1854 

4 82 D.C. 
Michael 

A.W. Gilbert Request to make a 
survey and plat of 
narrow portion of 
Front Street below 
5th Street 

July 15, 1854 

4 83 A.W. Gilbert D.C. Michael Whether he wants 
him to make any 

July 15, 1854 



Gilbert-Richards Papers 
Page 55 

 

Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

surveys of that part 
of West Front Street 
proposed to be 
occupied by the 
Ohio & Mississippi 
Railroad 

4 84 A.P. Ransom A.W. Gilbert Survey of West 
Front Street from 
Freeman Street to 
Mill Creek 

July 19, 1854 

4 85 A.P. Rickoff A.W. Gilbert Digging drain for 
cellar under wing of 
Refuge  

June 21, 1854 

4 86 A.W. Gilbert C. Davenport Amount needed for 
department in 
August 1854 

July 21, 1854 

4 87 S.B. Hulse A.W. Gilbert Whose duty it was 
to prepare the 
ordinance to light 
the streets of the 
city 

August 18, 1854 

4 88 A.W. Gilbert C. Davenport Amount needed for 
department in 
September 1854 

August 25, 1854 

4 89 A.W. Gilbert C. Davenport Amount needed for 
department in 
October 1854 

September 23, 1854 

4 90 A.W. Gilbert City Council Police force on the 
market space 
arresting people 
excavating and 
taking away the land 
below the line 
designated in the 
contract with those 
who purchased the 
land 

October 12, 1854 

4 91 John 
McLean 

A.W. Gilbert Measurement of 
ravine washed out 
by the water thrown 
on Hopkins Street 
below Freeman 

October 16, 1854 
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4 92 A.W. Gilbert C. Davenport Amount needed for 
department during 
November 1854 

October 21, 1854 

4 93 A.W. Gilbert James C. Hall Meeting Mr. S.S. 
Post for instructions 
on laying piece of 
track on road  

October 30, 1854 

4 94 W.H. Bristol A.W. Gilbert Laying piece of track 
in Front Street east 
of Hanick Street 

November 3, 1854 

4 95 A.W. Gilbert P. McGrooty Opinion on contract 
related to ordinance 
ordering a street to 
be graded  

November 28, 1854 

4 96 E. Harwood A.W. Gilbert Number of feet 
agreed upon as 
grade on Brown 
Street 

January 25, 1855 

4 97 A.W. Gilbert City Council Dismissal and 
resignation of R.C. 
Phillips 

March 13, 1855 

4 98 D.P. 
Ransom 

A.W. Gilbert Examination of 
various lines in 
Section 13 3 F.R.2 of 
topographical map 
and measurement 
of distances to 
various stone 
monuments placed 
for the intersections 
of the east, west, 
north and south 
lines 

March 24, 1855 

4 99 A.W. Gilbert City Council Statement of official 
doings and a 
commentary of 
various books, maps 
and instruments in 
the office upon his 
retirement from 
position of City Civil 
Engineer 

April 6, 1855 
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4 100 A.W. Gilbert City Council Preparing a plan of 
specifications for a 
system of sewers for 
Walnut, Vine, Elm 
and Plum Streets 

July 11, 1859 

4 101 A.W. Gilbert Board of Public 
Works 

Eggleston sewer August 24, 1863 

4 102 A.W. Gilbert S. Archson Services on patent 
deed to C.H. Kilgour 

March 3, 1864 

4 103 A.W. Gilbert H.S. Babbitt Congratulations on 
success; completing 
transaction 

April 22, 1864 

4 104 W.P. 
Wiltsee  

A.W. Gilbert Election as engineer 
of sewers 

May 23, 1870 

4 105 A.W. Gilbert Editor, 
Commercial 
Gazette 

Best wishes for 
prosperity and 
success 

March 5, 1883 

4 106 A.W. Gilbert Miss Kirkland Speech in 
opposition to the 
doctrines of the 
Democratic party 

October 29, 1886 

4 107 A.W. Gilbert Charles B. Wilby Using influence to 
obtain services of 
water works 
engineer for 
construction of 
works 

July 16, 1890 

4 108 A.W. Gilbert Charles B. Wilby Water works matter July 22, 1890 

4 109 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Gourner Interview in 
Commercial Gazette 
about doing 
something to make 
and have good 
roads in Ohio 

January 6, 1893 

4 110 W.P. 
Wiltsee 

A.W. Gilbert Attending meeting 
regarding 
improvements in 
Cincinnati 

January 21, 1893 

4 111 W.M. 
Rournd 

William Burch Intends to stay in 
Roseland; 
description of 
activities there 

October 27, 1893 
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4 112 A.W. Gilbert Mrs. Kibler Account of the old 
church on Race 
Street in the 
Commercial Gazette 

December 20, 1893 

4 113 A.W. Gilbert Board of 
Improvements 

Changing the grade 
of Hamilton Road 
from Mohawk 
Bridge to Brighton 
House 

Undated 

4 114 A.W. Gilbert City Council McAdamizing 
portion of Hunt 
Street opposite the 
property of the 
Dayton & Cincinnati 
Short Line Railway 
east of Pendleton 
Street 

Undated 

4 115 A.W. Gilbert City Council Paper signed by the 
city commissioners 
regarding Culvert 
being built under 
Hopkins Street 

Undated 

 
Series I: Correspondence 
Subseries XXV: Alfred W. Gilbert’s Banking-Related Correspondence  
 

Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

5 1 Johnston & 
Truman 

A.W. Gilbert Receipt for 
mortgage and notes 

May 20, 1881 

5 2 A.W. Gilbert Cashier, National 
Lafayette Bank 

Miscellaneous 
coupons for interest 
on notes due at the 
bank and 
instructions for 
notification 
regarding same 

April 15, 1882-
November 2, 1886 

5 3 A.W. Gilbert Corbin Banking 
Co. 

Miscellaneous 
coupons for interest 
on notes due at the 
bank and 
instructions for 
notification 

May 24, 1882-
January 21, 1886 
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regarding same 

5 4 A.W. Gilbert D. Bedinger Impending damage 
due to Bank Lick 
creek mediating 
inroads on bottom 
lands 

June 21, 1882 

5 5 A.W. Gilbert Cashier, Ottawa 
Co. Bank 

Miscellaneous 
coupons for interest 
on notes due at the 
bank and 
instructions for 
notification 
regarding same 

December 9, 1882-
April 25, 1884 

5 6 A.W. Gilbert Jacob Campbell Note for mortage April 13, 1883 

5 7 A.W. Gilbert Joseph Symmes Credit for amount of 
corn delivered 

September 6, 1883 

5 8 A.W. Gilbert T.V. Guthrie Received notice of 
protest for check 
drawn in his favor 

December 6, 1883 

5 9 A.W. Gilbert Ottawa County 
Bank 

Miscellaneous 
coupons for interest 
on notes due at the 
bank and 
instructions for 
notification 
regarding same 

January 1884-
September 1884 

5 10 A.W. Gilbert Adolph Gilbert Notes to dispose of May 30, 1884 

5 11 A.W. Gilbert Adolph Gilbert Miscellaneous 
coupons for interest 
on notes due at the 
bank and 
instructions for 
notification 
regarding same 

September-
December 1884 

5 12 A.W. Gilbert F.M. Sexton, 
Cashier 

Miscellaneous 
coupons for interest 
on notes due at the 
bank and 
instructions for 
notification 
regarding same 

October 26, 1884-
November 7, 1884 

5 13 A.W. Gilbert J.B. Watkins Co. Miscellaneous December 1885 
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coupons for interest 
on notes due at the 
bank and 
instructions for 
notification 
regarding same 

5 14 A.W. Gilbert J.S. Adair, 
Cashier, First 
National Bank 

Payment of 
installments for 
shares of stock of 
First National Bank 
of Minneapolis 

July 14, 1885-May 1, 
1888 

5 15 A.W. Gilbert Cashier, First 
National Bank of 
Minneapolis, 
Kansas 

Placing check to his 
credit in bank 

August 17, 1885 

5 16 A.W. Gilbert Cashier, First 
National Bank of 
Hamilton 

Placing checks to his 
credit in bank 

December 11, 1885 

5 17 A.W. Gilbert William Beckett Survey for proposed 
railway from 
Hamilton down the 
Miami through 
Venice and his lands 

June 29, 1886 

5 18 A.W. Gilbert Israel Williams Survey for proposed 
railway from 
Hamilton down the 
Miami through 
Venice and his lands 

June 29, 1886 

5 19 A.W. Gilbert Israel Williams How far the 
company had 
progressed in 
building the road 
and line surveyed  

July 7, 1886 

5 20 A.W. Gilbert David Binns, 
Cashier 

Placing funds on 
notes and at what 
interest rate 

August 9, 1887-
February 12, 1891 

5 21 A.W. Gilbert A.C. Jackmon First class mortgages August 29, 1887 

5 22 A.W. Gilbert David Binns Miscellaneous 
coupons for interest 
on notes due at the 
bank and 
instructions for 

December 22, 1887 
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notification 
regarding same 

5 23 A.W. Gilbert David Binns Placing check on 
deposit in bank 

December 27, 1887 

5 24 A.W. Gilbert Unknown Authorization and 
appointment of 
unknown person to 
vote his stock in the 
First National Bank 
of Minneapolis, 
Kansas at election of 
directors on January 
10, 1888 

December 31, 1887 

5 25 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackmon Paying amount due April 18, 1888 

5 26 A.W. Gilbert Adolph Gilbert Deposits have run 
down; selling 
railroad bonds  

March 9, 1888 

5 27 A.W. Gilbert Adolph Gilbert Taking a reduced 
number of shares of 
stock because of 
unexpected 
expenses 

May 1, 1888 

5 28 A.W. Gilbert Adolph Gilbert Paying for stock May 16, 1888 

5 29 A.W. Gilbert Martin Pickens Paying for Lot 38 February 3, 1890 

5 30 A.W. Gilbert Seth Hunt Healthy practices May 1, 1890 

5 31 A.W. Gilbert Adolph Gilbert Financial matters July 27, 1890 

5 32 A.W. Gilbert Adolph Gilbert Financial matters October 17, 1890 

5 33 A.W. Gilbert Ed Certificates for 10 
shares stock in the 
First National Bank 
of Minneapolis, 
Kansas 

February 9, 1891 

5 34 A.W. Gilbert Comptroller of 
Currency 

Steps the directors 
of a national bank 
should take if they 
desire to go into 
voluntary 
liquidation; notice of 
stockholders 
meeting regarding 
same 

February 26, 1891-
May 27, 1891 

5 35 A.W. Gilbert Vice Resignation as July 8, 1891 
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President/Direct
ors, First 
National Bank 

president and 
director of the First 
National Bank of 
Minneapolis, Kansas 

5 36 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Painter Financial matters January 26, 1892 

5 37 A.W. Gilbert S.K. Walters How December 
interest might help 
Mr. Hewlett in his 
efforts to keep 
property 

February 3, 1892 

5 38 A.W. Gilbert A.E. Painter Changing lots off in 
the orchard 
addition; wishes to 
purchase some of 
his lots; inquiries 
about price of same 

February 8, 1892 

5 39 A.W. Gilbert Publisher, NC 
Messenger 

Payment for 
Messenger the 
previous year 

March 7, 1892 

5 40 F.M. Sexton Adolph Gilbert Consolidating the 
First National and 
the Ottawa County 
Banks 

March 22, 1892 

5 41 Adolph 
Gilbert 

A.W. Gilbert Bank examiner’s 
visit 

April 25, 1892 

5 42 C. Nelson A.W. Gilbert $2500 held by First 
National Bank 
against him has not 
been paid by him or 
anyone else 

May 18, 1892 

5 43 Adolph 
Gilbert 

A.W. Gilbert Letter from 
Bennington; 
financial matters 

May 25, 1892 

5 44 Chapman & 
Maltby 

A.W. Gilbert Deposition in the 
bank case 

June 9, 1892 

5 45 Samuel S. 
Church 

A.W. Gilbert Deposition in bank 
case 

June 15, 1892 

5 46 Samuel S. 
Church 

A.W. Gilbert Depositions June 17, 1892 

5 47 First 
National 
Bank 

A.W. Gilbert Assessment to make 
good the capital of 
the First National 

June 18, 1892 
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Bank of 
Minneapolis, Kansas 

5 48 C.G. 
Thurston 

A.W. Gilbert Whether his stock in 
First National Bank 
of Minneapolis, 
Kansas is for sale 

June 20, 1892 

5 49 A.W. Gilbert Adolph Gilbert Decision to sell stock 
for anything he can 
get for it 

June 24, 1892 

5 50 A.W. Gilbert C.G. Thurston Purchasing his stock June 24, 1892 

5 51 Adolph 
Gilbert 

A.W. Gilbert Books of bank June 26, 1892 

5 52 C.G. Hinston A.W. Gilbert Cannot raise bid for 
stock  

June 28, 1892 

5 53 Cherryvale 
National 
Bank 

Adolph Gilbert Assessment levied 
on bank and 
suggestions for 
same 

July 6, 1892 

5 54 A.W. Gilbert James Ketner Assessment on stock 
of bank 

July 10, 1892 

5 55 A.W. Gilbert Adolph Gilbert Reducing 
assessment  

July 11, 1892 

5 56 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Hurley Assessment on stock 
of bank 

July 20, 1892 

5 57 A.W. Gilbert Adolph Gilbert Delay in receiving 
answers to 
questions about 
assessment of stock 
of bank 

July 24, 1892 

5 58 S.T. Stull A.W. Gilbert Stockholders paying 
dividends 

July 30, 1892 

5 59 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Ketner Signing approval of 
loan 

August 3, 1892 

5 60 A.W. Gilbert J.S. Trew Closing out affairs of 
the First National 
Bank 

August 5, 1892 

5 61 James 
Ketner 

A.W. Gilbert Endorsing loan to 
Adolph Gilbert 

August 8, 1892 

5 62 F.S. Trew A.W. Gilbert Going into voluntary 
liquidation if 
consolidation efforts 
fail 

August 11, 1892 
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5 63 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackmon Note due in 
September 

August 19, 1892 

5 64 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Jackmon’s note for 
$1200 

August 30, 1892 

5 65 C.G. 
Thurston 

A.W. Gilbert Still willing to take 
First National Bank 
stock 

August 31, 1892 

5 66 F.S. Trew A.W. Gilbert Conference with 
Adolph about 
assessment 

September 1, 1892 

5 67 A.W. Gilbert J.E. Hurley Certificates for 
shares of stock in 
First National Bank 

September 10, 1892 

5 68 A.W. Gilbert C.G. Thurston Certificates of 
shares of stock 

September 10, 1892 

5 69 A.W. Gilbert George W. 
Hurley 

Jackman’s payment 
of note and interest 

September 12, 1892 

5 70 George W. 
Hurley   

A.W. Gilbert Jackman’s payment 
of note and interest 

September 13, 1892 

5 71 First 
National 
Bank 

A.W. Gilbert Ability to pay 
assessment on bank 
stock 

September 13, 1892 

5 72 J. Ketner A.W. Gilbert Draft for $3000 for 
stock 

September 15, 1892 

5 73 J. Ketner A.W. Gilbert Draft for $3000 
payment of stock 

September 15, 1892 

5 74 J. Ketner A.W. Gilbert Sending Bart 
Brennert receipt for 
$64 interest paid on 
mortgage  

October 5, 1892 

5 75 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Time likely to get 
mortgage closed; 
whether property is 
under rent; whether 
any funds in 
receiver’s hands 

October 7, 1892 

5 76 A.W. Gilbert J.E. Hurley How to proceed 
with notice of 
meeting of bank 
directors of First 
National Bank of 
Minneapolis, Kansas 

October 18, 1892 
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5 77 A.W. Gilbert George W. 
Hurley 

Kansas suffering 
from drought; bank 
matters 

October 21, 1892 

5 78 J. Ketner A.W. Gilbert Certificate of stock 
sold  

October 22, 1892 

5 79 A.W. Gilbert A.B. Hepburn Report of recent 
examination of the 
First National Bank 
of Minneapolis, 
Kansas’s affairs 

November 22, 1892 

5 80 A.W. Gilbert S.K. Wotlen Appointment as 
receiver for Hewlett 
property in 
Bennington 

December 15, 1892 

5 81 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Investing money in 
short and small 
notes 

December 19, 1892  

5 82 A.W. Gilbert A.C. Jackman Certificate of shares 
of stock 

December 31, 1892 

5 83 A.W. Gilbert George W. 
Hurley 

Appraisal of stock January 13, 1893 

5 84 A.W. Gilbert George W. 
Hurley 

Check for cost of 
Hewlett case 

February 6, 1893 

5 85 A.W. Gilbert George 
MacKenzie 

Check to pay dues 
on stock in 
Minneapolis 
Building & Loan 
Association 

February 9, 1893 

5 86 James 
Ketner 

A.W. Gilbert Name stricken from 
card in Messenger 

February 13, 1893 

5 87 James 
Ketner 

A.W. Gilbert Whether or not new 
owner will be 
prepared to pay 
note at maturity 

August 3, 1893 

5 88 A.W. Gilbert Bert Brennest Payment of amount 
of mortgage when 
due September 1, 
1893 

September 13, 1893 

5 89 A.W. Gilbert George 
MacKenzie 

Check to pay dues 
on shares of stock in 
the Minneapolis 
Building & Loan 

October 9, 1893 
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Association 

5 90 A.W. Gilbert George W. 
Hurley 

Interest on shares to 
date 

October 24, 1893 

5 91 A.W. Gilbert George W. 
Hurley 

Note for bank 
interest received 

November 13, 1893 

5 92 A.W. Gilbert George W. 
Hurley 

Decision not to 
make offer of $50 
for lots 

December 29, 1893 

5 93 A.W. Gilbert A.C. Jackmon Disposing of lots in 
Moose and Adair 
Orchard addition 

January 16, 1894 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXVI:  Alfred W. Gilbert’s Business Correspondence 
  

Box Folder Author  Recipient Subject Date 

5 94 A.W. Gilbert C.H. Kilgour Submitted deed of 
patent to A. Taft; 
his response to 
same 

February 6, 1864 

5 95 A.W. Gilbert Illegible Has not seen Mr. 
Kilgour since 
receiving deed; has 
submitted it to his 
attorney 

February 10, 1864 

5 96 A.W. Gilbert C.H. Kilgour Received new deed 
of patent from Mr. 
Nicolson  

February 20, 1864 

5 97 W.P. Wiltsee Colonel Proposition from 
Graphic to publish; 
sending papers 

April 15, 188_ 

5 98 A.W. Gilbert S.A. Walker Sending check to 
make the loan to 
Rush 

February 21, 1882 

5 99 A.W. Gilbert H. Peachey Sending draft to 
New York for 
collection 

March 6, 1882 

5 100 A.W. Gilbert H. Peachey Financial matters March 8, 1882 

5 101 A.W. Gilbert S.A. Walker Financial matters March 13, 1882 

5 102 A.W. Gilbert D.C. Chapman Mortgage and 
notes  

March 15, 1882 

5 103 A.W. Gilbert A.R. Bordsick Draft received by March 15, 1882 



Gilbert-Richards Papers 
Page 67 

 

Box Folder Author  Recipient Subject Date 

National LaFayette 
Bank 

5 104 A.W. Gilbert H. Peachey Procedure on notes March 15, 1882 

5 105 A.W. Gilbert S.A. Walker Mortgage and 
notes of Mitchell 
Rush 

March 18, 1882 

5 106 A.W. Gilbert H. Peachey Check and interest 
coupon 

July 5, 1882 

5 107 A.W. Gilbert Fuller & 
Warren Co. 

Castings for stove; 
request for damper 

July 21, 1882 

5 108 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Smith Request to 
postpone any 
action in regard to 
bridge over creek 

September 26, 1882 

5 109 A.W. Gilbert Butler County 
Treasurer 

Account with same December 4, 1882 

5 110 A.W. Gilbert Jacob 
Campbell 

Why coupon for 
interest on note 
not paid 

December 26, 1882 

5 111 A.W. Gilbert Q.B. Watkins 
Co. 

Notes of Hugh 
McQueen 

December 26, 1882 

5 112 A.W. Gilbert Q.B. Watkins 
Co. 

Correcting omission 
in note about notes 
and mortgage 

December 27, 1882 

5 113 A.W. Gilbert Albert Stubert Proposed leaving 
present place to 
come there; 
requests that he 
not do it 

December 31, 1882 

5 114 A.W. Gilbert Q.B. Watkins 
Co. 

Sending funds to 
pay note  

January 5, 1883 

5 115 A.W. Gilbert W.J. Dunlap Financial matters January 18, 1883 

5 116 A.W. Gilbert Q.B. Watkins 
Co. 

Sending notes and 
mortgage of Hugh 
McQueen 

January 23, 1883 

5 117 A.W. Gilbert J. P. 
Waterhouse 

Probability of 
having a railway  

March 12, 1883 

5 118 A.W. Gilbert D.D. Hunter Proposed railway 
from Greenville to 
Straits of Mackinaw 

March 12, 1883 

5 119 A.W. Gilbert J.N. Alexander Grade and width of 
right of way of the 

March 15, 1883 
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Westwood Narrow 
Gauge 

5 120 A.W. Gilbert Frank Finch Postage stamps 
requested by 
circular 

March 16, 1883 

5 121 A.W. Gilbert D.K. Beatty Information about 
buying an upright 
piano with a plain 
rosewood case 

April 9, 1883 

5 122 A.W. Gilbert Y.B. Coffin Request for 200 
pounds of 
granulated sugar 
and 25 pounds 
coffee  

April 27, 1883 

5 123 A.W. Gilbert W.R. Dunlap Trust Certificate 
Hamilton & Dayton 
Railroad 

June 28, 1883 

5 124 A.W. Gilbert W.R. Dunlap Statement of sale 
of trust certificate 
received 

July 18, 1883 

5 125 A.W. Gilbert Dan Ten head of cattle 
arrived on time 

August 11, 1883 

5 126 A.W. Gilbert Robert 
Wallace 

Request for views 
on wages for 
paying a man 
working at Elland 

August 12, 1883 

5 127 A.W. Gilbert Dan Weber Will receive 10 
head of cattle soon 

August 31, 1883 

5 128 A.W. Gilbert Dan Weber Sold cattle to a 
farmer in the 
neighborhood 
instead 

September 3, 1883 

5 129 A.W. Gilbert Daniel Check to pay for 20 
shoots 

December 4, 1883 

5 130 A.W. Gilbert Publisher of 
Century 

Check for 
magazines for 1884 

December 10, 1883 

5 131 A.W. Gilbert Frank H. Scott Observations about 
payment of 1884 
magazines 

December 17, 1883 

5 132 A.W. Gilbert Frank H. Scott Stamps for balance 
due him on copies 
of magazines 

December 21, 1883 
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5 133 A.W. Gilbert Frank H. Scott Subscription to 
Atlantic Monthly 

January 4, 1884 

5 134 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Royse Party making trip to 
New Orleans; 
thoughts about one 
seeing him about 
matter 

January 10, 1884 

5 135 A.W. Gilbert W.J. Dunlop & 
Co. 

Interest on bonds January 19, 1884 

5 136 A.W. Gilbert W.J. Dunlop & 
Co. 

Check for Hamilton 
Butler County Ohio 
Waterworks Bond 

January 22, 1884 

5 137 A.W. Gilbert W.J. Dunlop & 
Co. 

Hamilton Butler 
County Ohio 
Waterworks Bond 

January 24, 1884 

5 138 A.W. Gilbert W.J. Dunlop & 
Co. 

Hamilton Butler 
County Ohio 
Waterworks Bond 

January 29, 1884 

6 1 A.W. Gilbert Friend Thanks for birthday 
wishes 

February 12, 1884 

6 2 A.W. Gilbert Henri Invitation to visit July 4, 1884 

6 3 A.W. Gilbert H.E. Butine Plans for visit August 6, 1884 

6 4 A.W. Gilbert Dan Weber Sending eight head 
of cattle 

August 25, 1884 

6 5 A.W. Gilbert Mr. 
Montgomery 

Request for piles August 30, 1884 

6 6 A.W. Gilbert Jeanie 
Morehead 

Pony and carriage September 8, 1884 

6 7 A.W. Gilbert Cashier, First 
National Bank, 
Hamilton, Ohio 

Checks September 10, 1884 

6 8 A.W. Gilbert C.J. Brenner Sending three hogs September 17, 1884 

6 9 A.W. Gilbert P. Grogan Loads of corn September 22, 1884 

6 10 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Barndt Renting his place, 
furnished, and 
coming to Elland to 
live for the winter 

October 15, 1884 

6 11 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Allen Plans for visit; 
renting home 

October 28, 1884 

6 12 A.W. Gilbert C.C. Hoover Sending 
contribution to 
church 

November 7, 1884 
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6 13 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Barndt Arrangements 
regarding Elland 

November 18, 1884 

6 14 A.W. Gilbert Butler County 
Treasurer 

Check for payment 
of December Butler 
County tax bill 

December 6, 1884 

6 15 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Goddard Present status of 
funds the First 
Society at 
Cincinnati were 
making for church 
expenses 

December 8, 1887 

6 16 A.W. Gilbert George W. 
Dick 

Obtaining the book 
he loaned him, My 
School & My 
Schoolmates, by 
Hugh Miller 

December 17, 1884 

6 17 A.W. Gilbert J. Ducker Sending mortgage 
for John Gilbert to 
him  

December 18, 1884 

6 18 John S. 
Ducker 

A.W. Gilbert Instructions for 
sending mortgage 
and note to him 

December 20, 1884 

6 19 M.T. Broyles  John S. Ducker Note of John W. 
Gilbert and wife 

January 30, 1885 

6 20 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Denman Scarcity of old 
friends; description 
of Elland 

March 1, 1885 

6 21 A.W. Gilbert Mrs. Fitzgerald Cannot make 
change in terms of 
note 

March 7, 1885 

6 22 A.W. Gilbert W.J. Dunlop & 
Co. 

Whether they have 
transferred stock 
shares to him 

March 19, 1885 

6 23 A.W. Gilbert Caroline 
Cathcart Day 

Wife’s verbal 
bequest to her 

March 30, 1885 

6 24 A.W. Gilbert Mitchell Rush Payment of notes March 30, 1885 

6 25 A.W. Gilbert P. Dom Payment for bill for 
painting and 
repairing carriage 

April 20, 1885 

6 26 A.W. Gilbert Mortimer Check given by 
George Richards to 
send him for 

May 5, 1885 
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proceeds of sale of 
stock in Venice 
Building 
Association 

6 27 A.W. Gilbert Mrs. Warner Sending money by 
mail, not by going 
to Robert Clarke’s  

September 4, 1885 

6 28 A.W. Gilbert Pat Grogan Depositing check September 12, 1885 

6 29 A.W. Gilbert W.C. Buchanan Plans to leave 
changed because of 
lumbago 

September 19, 1885 

6 30 A.W. Gilbert W.C. Buchanan Plans to leave 
changed because of 
lumbago 

September 23, 1885 

6 31 A.W. Gilbert Friend Conversation with 
Charlie and Fred 
Taylor about the 
Duluth project 

November 11, 1885 

6 32 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Denman Change in plans November 11, 1885 

6 33 A.W. Gilbert J.B. Watkins & 
Co. 

Plans to visit 
Kansas and receive 
note then 

November 12, 1885 

6 34 A.W. Gilbert J.S. Adair Telegram November 28, 1885 

6 35 A.W. Gilbert Walters & 
Boulan 

Declines change in 
mortgage security 

December 1, 1885 

6 36 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Mitchel Telegram December 17, 1885 

6 37 A.W. Gilbert J.P. Cornell Congratulations on 
new quarters; 
account of new 
bank building 

January 22, 1886 

6 38 A.W. Gilbert A. Gast Co. Bill for herds and 
cords 

March 13, 1886 

6 39 A.W. Gilbert W.L. 
Merryfield 

Having a form of 
mortgage printed 

March 26, 1886 

6 40 A.W. Gilbert L.C. Murry Will give letter to 
the directors of the 
bank at Fargo 
Springs, Kansas 
when he is there in 
May 

April 5, 1886 

6 41 A.W. Gilbert Daniel 
Bedinger 

When likely to be in 
vicinity of Venice 

April 15, 1886 
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6 42 A.W. Gilbert Mr. & Mrs. 
Henlett 

Leaving Bennington April 16, 1886 

6 43 A.W. Gilbert J.E. Williams Views on 
practicability of 
getting a good line 
for a railway down 
the valley of the 
Great Miami River 
from Hamilton to 
Aurora, Indiana 

April 21, 1886 

6 44 A.W. Gilbert K.S. Davis Losing the Hewletts 
from church 

April 30, 1886 

6 45 A.W. Gilbert Friend Extending 
proposed visit  

May 9, 1886 

6 46 A.W. Gilbert J.E. Williams Whether any of the 
old canal can be 
occupied  

May 14, 1886 

6 47 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Taylor Proposed trip out 
West  

June 1, 1886 

6 48 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Hewlett Advice regarding 
mortgage 

August 7, 1886 

6 49 A.W. Gilbert W.L. 
Merryfield 

Bonds and 
mortgages 

August 13, 1886 

6 50 A.W. Gilbert K.S. Davis Payment; news of 
Hewletts 

September 27, 1886 

6 51 A.W. Gilbert J.S. Adair Financial matters October 11, 1886 

6 52 A.W. Gilbert “Topsy” Sketch of 
waterlilies 

October 12, 1886 

6 53 A.W. Gilbert J.S. Adair Financial matters October 17, 1886 

6 54 A.W. Gilbert S.P. Williams Placing securities 
on the market 

October 20, 1886 

6 55 A.W. Gilbert George W. 
Dick 

Interest in 
purchasing land on 
Bank Lick Creek 

November 1, 1886 

6 56 A.W. Gilbert George W. 
Dick 

Purchase of Hiram 
Ogden’s acreage  

November 6, 1886 

6 57 R. Joyce A.W. Gilbert Financial matters February 15, 1887 

6 58 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Abstract books of 
Carmack 

July 19, 1887 

6 59 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Abstract books August 1, 1887 

6 60 A.W. Gilbert J.S. Adair Financial matters August 1, 1887 

6 61 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Collecting Hewlett’s August 6, 1887 
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note 

6 62 A.W. Gilbert J.S. Adair Bad crop reports 
from Kansas; 
financial matters 

August 10, 1887 

6 63 A.C. Jackman A.W. Gilbert Financial matters August 14, 1887 

6 64 A.W. Gilbert Pat Grogan Paying for bushels 
of corn 

August 17, 1887 

6 65 A.W. Gilbert J.S. Adair Financial matters August 19, 1887 

6 66 A.W. Gilbert David Recommending 
notes and 
mortgages 

August 24, 1887 

6 67 A.W. Gilbert J.S. Adair Financial matters August 30, 1887 

6 68 A.W. Gilbert David Financial matters August 31, 1887 

6 69 A.W. Gilbert A.C. Jackman 
and W.L. 
Merryfield 

Financial matters September 1, 1887 

6 70 A.W. Gilbert E.P. White & 
Co. 

Photo and frame November 12, 1887 

6 71 A.W. Gilbert Sam Request for book of 
photos of Colorado 
mountain scenes 

December 13, 1887 

6 72 A.W. Gilbert J.S. Adair Thanks for gift December 27, 1887 

6 73 A.W. Gilbert David Taking more stock February 18, 1888 

6 74 A.W. Gilbert Friend Trip to Pacific 
Slope; financial 
matters 

March 15, 1888 

6 75 A.W. Gilbert L.D. Moore Dividing joint 
property 

March 18, 1888 

6 76 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Statement from 
Merryfield 
regarding payment 
of dues to Building 
Association on his 
stock 

March 23, 1888 

6 77 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Laurence Thanks for Life of 
Amos A. Lawrence 

March 29, 1888 

6 78 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Payments on 
building association 
stock 

April 10, 1888 

6 79 A.W. Gilbert W.L. 
Merryfield 

Interest coupon for 
note 

May 4, 1888 

6 80 A.W. Gilbert W. Peachey Disposing of bonds  May 8, 1888 
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6 81 A.W. Gilbert Hobart Financial matters May 15, 1888 

6 82 A.W. Gilbert A.E. Painter Not dividing 
property or willing 
to sell it 

May 18, 1888 

6 83 A.W. Gilbert Daniel 
Bedinger 

Putting up line 
fence 

May 29, 1888 

6 84 A.W. Gilbert C.C. Hoover Thanks for band 
organization’s 
conduct in 
attending 
Decoration Day  
ceremonies at 
Elland  

May 31, 1888 

6 85 A.W. Gilbert David Interest coupon June 11, 1888 

6 86 A.W. Gilbert Mr. McMillan Pastorship of 
church 

July 3, 1888 

6 87 A.W. Gilbert T.L. Simpson Diary might help 
him answer 
questions about 
Civil War service 

July 25, 1888 

6 88 A.W. Gilbert Dr. Nixon Recollections of 
Civil War service 

July 25, 1888 

6 89 Florence L. 
Simpson  

A.W. Gilbert Application for 
pension 

July 1888 

6 90 A.W. Gilbert Daniel 
Bedinger 

Putting up line 
fence 

August 20, 1888 

6 91 A.W. Gilbert Cashier, First 
National Bank, 
Hamilton 

Checks  September 11, 1888 

6 92 A.W. Gilbert Harry Storkin Note for property 
bought at George 
Richards’ sale 

September 12, 1888 

6 93 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Hewlett Bennington’s 
property 

October 6, 1888 

6 94 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Hewlett Presidential 
election victory 

November 12, 1888 

6 95 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Goddard Contribution to 
church 

November 17, 1888 

6 96 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Hewlett Property under 
rent to tenant; 
letting note and 
mortgage run on 

January 3, 1889 
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6 97 A.W. Gilbert George Lacey Trouble with calf January 14, 1889 

6 98 A.W. Gilbert J. Hansford Check  March 18, 1889 

6 99 A.W. Gilbert George Lacey Getting into the 
house 

March 22, 1889 

6 100 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Hewlett Financial matters April 13, 1889 

6 101 A.W. Gilbert John B. Cornell Deed to Robert 
Livingston 

April 24, 1889 

6 102 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Adair Note and interest 
on mortgage 

January 9, 1890 

6 103 A.W. Gilbert Paul Recent weather  
and activities 

January 28, 1890 

6 104 John Sherman A.W. Gilbert Securing an 
appropriation from 
Congress to aid 
farmers 

March 28, 1890 

6 105 A.W. Gilbert Alfred M. Allen Managing Foster 
Hill Trust 

April 2, 1890 

6 106 A.W. Gilbert General Buying out stock of 
cashier in First 
National Bank 

April 17, 1890 

6 107 A.W. Gilbert General Business matters April 24, 1890 

6 108 A.W. Gilbert A. Block Not prepared to 
purchase any stock 

April 24, 1890 

6 109 A.W. Gilbert Jacob Reisler Dairymen to take 
his corn 

April 30, 1890 

6 110 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Clark Business matters June 2, 1890 

6 111 A.W. Gilbert David Financial matters July 1, 1890 

6 112 A.W. Gilbert Nehemiah 
Wade 

Delivering lot of 
corn to Dodworth 
distillery 

August 28, 1890 

6 113 A.W. Gilbert E.F. Noyes Death of husband, 
Judge Noyes 

September 5, 1890 

6 114 A.W. Gilbert David Bennington 
business matters 

September 26, 1890 

6 115 A.W. Gilbert Denman Visit to Ohio September 30, 1890 

6 116 A.W. Gilbert E. Jacobs Advantages of his 
locality for 
suburban 
residences 

October 1, 1890 

6 117 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Hobson’s mortgage October 11, 1890 

6 118 A.W. Gilbert Martin O. 
Pickens 

Acres on Wood lot December 19, 1890 
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6 119 B.F. Newlett A.W. Gilbert Interest matters January 26, 1891 

6 120 A.W. Gilbert Martin Pickens Financial matters February 18, 1891 

6 121 A.W. Gilbert J.W. Griffiths Stops necessary for 
a national bank to 
take to go into 
liquidation 

February 25, 1891 

6 122 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Financial matters June 13, 1891 

6 123 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Goddard Thoughts on 
sermon 

June 21, 1891 

6 124 A.W. Gilbert Charles 
Anderson 

Business matters June 22, 1891 

6 125 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Spear M.D. Ross’s visit to 
Cincinnati 

September 30, 1891 

6 126 A.W. Gilbert Editor, Atlantic 
Monthly 

Thanks to writer 
Henry Stow for 
article on Gen. 
George H. Thomas 

October 6, 1891 

6 127 A.W. Gilbert F.L. Flint Not able to trade at 
present 

November 1, 1891 

6 128 A.W. Gilbert W.L. 
Merryfield 

Procedure of vice 
president 
performing duties 
of president in 
absence 

November 3, 1891 

6 129 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Money on Moore 
addition 

December 16, 1891 

6 130 A.W. Gilbert Mason Home 
Co. 

Paying taxes on 
Colerain Township 
property 

December 27, 1891 

6 131 Frank Bruner A.W. Gilbert Request to attend 
meeting of the 
officers of the 39th 
O.V.I. on January 
28 

January 25, 1892 

6 132 S.K. Walters A.W. Gilbert Drawing up 
another statement 

February 1, 1892 

6 133 A.W. Gilbert S.K. Walters Financial matters 
regarding Mr. 
Hewlett 

February 2, 1892 

6 134 A.W. Gilbert George 
Richards 

Sending statement 
of account 

March 10, 1892 

6 135 A.W. Gilbert C.H. Mann Request to send March 15, 1892 
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paper 

6 136 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Hewlett Mortgage March 18, 1892 

6 137 A.W. Gilbert S.K. Walters Deed for 
Bennington 
property 

March 18, 1892 

6 138 S.K. Walters A.W. Gilbert Statement for Mr. 
Hewlett 

March 28, 1892 

6 139 A.W. Gilbert S.T. Stull Mortgage on 
Bennington house 
and lot  

March 29, 1892 

6 140 A.W. Gilbert Aetna 
Insurance Co. 

Deed March 31, 1892 

6 141 A.W. Gilbert S.T. Stull Hewlett mortgage April 1, 1892 

6 142 Agnes 
Raybauld 

A.W. Gilbert Visit April 4, 1892 

6 143 S.T. Stull A.W. Gilbert Mortgage filed in 
foreclosure 

April 5, 1892 

6 144 A.W. Gilbert F.C. Bennett Addenda to policy April 5, 1892 

6 145 A.W. Gilbert B.F. Hewlett Contents and tone 
of letter 

April 12, 1892 

6 146 A.W. Gilbert B.F. Hewlett Interest matters April 14, 1892 

6 147 C.M. Taylor A.W. Gilbert Recent activities April 15, 1892 

6 148 Cashier, First 
National 
Bank, 
Minneapolis, 
Kansas 

A.W. Gilbert Condition of bank 
based on 
examination 

April 18, 1892 

6 149 A.W. Gilbert David Binns Papering church 
windows of 
Presbyterian 
Church like 
Methodist Church 

April 20, 1892 

6 150 A.P. Ridde A.W. Gilbert Financial matters April 22, 1892 

6 151 T.L. Wayne, 
Jr. 

A.W. Gilbert Foster School Fund April 25, 1892 

6 152 William 
Leithstrom 

A.W. Gilbert How the trustee 
ships for the Foster 
Hill property and 
funds in standing at 
this time 

April 25, 1892 

6 153 A.W. Gilbert William 
Leithstrom 

Foster Hill property April 27, 1892 
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6 154 William 
Leithstrom 

Alfred M. Aden Putting in another 
trustee 

April 27, 1892 

6 155 William 
Leithstrom 

Waldo O. Ross Helping schools in 
area 

May 7, 1892 

6 156 F.H. Clark A.W. Gilbert Thanks for books May 9, 1892 

6 157 John B.C. 
Moores 

A.W. Gilbert Who has papers 
connected with the 
trust, including 
deed from Judge 
Foster  

May 21, 1892 

6 158 A.W. Gilbert S.T. Stull Paying taxes June 10, 1892 

6 159 A.W. Gilbert Samuel S. 
Church 

Request to come to 
office to have 
deposition taken  

June 14, 1892 

6 160 S.W. 
Carpenter 

A.W. Gilbert Address on 
Decoration Day 

June 20, 1892 

6 161 A.W. Gilbert Prof. Clark Anticipating arrival 
of books  

June 21, 1892 

6 162 S.T. Stull A.W. Gilbert Taxes on lots June 22, 1892 

6 163 T.H. Clark A.W. Gilbert Arrival of books June 26, 1892 

6 164 A.W. Gilbert Prof. Clark List of books 
received from Mr. 
Ross 

June 30, 1892 

6 165 A.W. Gilbert C. Nelson Letters to Mr. 
Binns; payment of 
note 

June 1892 

6 166 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Suit on mortgage 
against Hewlett 

July 13, 1892 

6 167 A.W. Gilbert James Kelner Financial matters August 31, 1892 

6 168 A.W. Gilbert J.S. Trew Bank matter and 
liquidation on 
payment of the 
assessment 

September 1, 1892 

6 169 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Payment of note; 
filing of affidavit 

September 2, 1892 

6 170 A.W. Gilbert James Kelner Getting assessment 
paid 

September 2, 1892 

6 171 A.C. Jackman A.W. Gilbert Paying him off September 3, 1892 

6 172 A.W. Gilbert C.G. Thurston Stock in First 
National Bank of 
Minneapolis, 
Kansas 

September 5, 1892 
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6 173 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Note to Hurley to 
be deposited at 
First National Bank 

September 6, 1892 

6 174 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Payment of note September 6, 1892 

6 175 A.C. Jackman A.W. Gilbert Payment of interest 
on note 

September 9, 1892 

6 176 A.W. Gilbert President and 
Directors of 
the First 
National Bank 
of 
Minneapolis, 
Kansas 

Resignation as 
director of the First 
National Bank of 
Minneapolis, 
Kansas 

September 10, 1892 

6 177 S.W. 
Carpenter 

Colonel Relocation to 
Colorado; 
rheumatism; 
“David Grieve” 

September 10, 1892 

6 177 A.W. Gilbert George W. 
Hurley 

Deduction of 
amount from 
Jackman’s note and 
interest 

September 13, 1892 

6 178 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Financial matters September 16, 1892 

6 179 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Draft paying for 
Jackman’s note 

September 17, 1892 

6 180 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Financial matters September 21, 1892 

6 181 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Financial matters October 4, 1892 

6 182 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley  Case against 
Hewlett 

October 6, 1892 

6 183 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Financial matters October 10, 1892 

6 184 G.W. Hurley  A.W. Gilbert Financial matters October 17, 1892 

6 185 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Worth of building 
and loan 
association  

October 31, 1892 

6 186 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Book value of 
building and loan 
association stock 

November 3, 1892 

6 187 F.H. Clark A.W. Gilbert Gilbert’s article on 
“The Silver Dollar” 
in “The Venice 
Graphic” 

November 4, 1892 

6 188 H.E. Scudder A.W. Gilbert Author of The Two 
Programmes of 

November 5, 1892 
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1892 not the 
author of The 
Political Situation 

6 189 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Building and Loan 
Association dues 

November 15, 1892 

6 190 Josepha H. 
Houghton 

A.W. Gilbert Collection matter November 18, 1892 

6 191 W.A. Roberts A.W. Gilbert Tax amounts November 19, 1892 

6 192 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Tax receipt December 6, 1892 

6 193 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Receipts December 12, 1892 

6 194 George 
Mackenzie 

A.W. Gilbert Notice of annual 
election; request 
for proxy to vote 
for him at election 
of officers of the 
Minneapolis 
Building and Loan 
Association  

December 14, 1892 

6 195 A.C. Jackman A.W. Gilbert Placing of money 
there 

December 26, 1892 

6 196 L.E. Hurley  A.W. Gilbert Telegram stating 
money was sent on 
September 16 

1892 

7 1 A.C. Jackman A.W. Gilbert Significant portion 
illegible 

January 5, 1893 

7 2 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Purchase of B.T. 
Hewlett house and 
lot 

January 9, 1893 

7 3 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Certificates of 
capital stock of 
Solomon Valley 
Loan & Investment 
Company  

January 10, 1893 

7 4 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Financial matters January 20, 1893 

7 5 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Certificates of stock 
in the Solomon 
Valley Loan & 
Investment 
Company 

January 24, 1893 

7 6 Eliza Wade 
Chatfield 

A.W. Gilbert Acceptance of offer 
for money 

January 24, 1893 

7 7 A.W. Gilbert Colonel Financial matters January 24, 1893 
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7 8 A.C. Jackman A.W. Gilbert Sale of stock January 24, 1893 

7 9 David Binns A.W. Gilbert Hewlett property January 25, 1893 

7 10 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Hewlett property January 28, 1893 

7 11 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Financial matters January 30, 1893 

7 12 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Laralde Stock matters February 2, 1893 

7 13 E.N. Laralde A.W. Gilbert Cincinnati Hamilton 
& Dayton bonds 
and gas stock 

February 4, 1893 

7 14 A.W. Gilbert Cody Co. Portrait February 6, 1893 

7 15 A.W. Gilbert [illegible] Name still 
appearing in ad as 
one of the directors 
of the First National 
Bank 

February 7, 1893 

7 16 A.W. Gilbert Carlton Cragg Australia as a 
residence and 
country for 
developing a home 
for a young man 

February 9, 1893 

7 17 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Financial matters February 9, 1893 

7 18 A.W. Gilbert S.K. Walter Hewlett property February 16, 1893 

7 19 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Financial matters February 17, 1893 

7 20 S.K. Walters A.W. Gilbert Hewlett property February 22, 1893 

7 21 F.H. Clark A.W. Gilbert Sketch of compiler 
of book sent; 
recent activities 
teaching 

February 24, 1893 

7 22 S. K. Walters A.W. Gilbert Hewlett property March 18, 1893 

7 23 A.W. Gilbert S.K. Walters Hewlett property March 20, 1893 

7 24 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Renting pasture March 20, 1893 

7 25 A.W. Gilbert S.K. Walters  Selling property for 
cash 

March 21, 1893 

7 26 A.W. Gilbert S.K. Walters Withdrawing offer March 25, 1893 

7 27 A.W. Gilbert David Binns Hewlett property March 27, 1893 

7 28 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Hewlett property March 27, 1893 

7 29 A.W. Gilbert M.J. Scanlon Photographing  April 1, 1893 

7 30 A.W. Gilbert S.K. Walters Financial matters April 4, 1893 

7 31 A.W. Gilbert Messrs. 
Holmes & 
Hickox 

Financial matters April 6, 1893 

7 32 A.W. Gilbert David Binns Deed for Hewlett 
property 

April 10, 1893 
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7 33 A.W. Gilbert David Binns Deed for Hewlett 
property 

April 14, 1893 

7 34 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Unable to sell lots May 8, 1893 

7 35 A.W. Gilbert John B. Mosby Invitation to attend 
dedication of new 
city hall 

May 10, 1893 

7 36 A.W. Gilbert George 
Brownham 

Home Savings & 
Loan Association  

May 18. 1893 

7 37 F.C. 
Huntington 

A.W. Gilbert Not being fair 
about seeds 
advertised in the 
Ohio Farmer 

June 9, 1893 

7 38 A.W. Gilbert H.E. Scudder Atlantic Magazine June 9, 1893 

7 39 H.E. Scudder A.W. Gilbert Content and policy 
of Atlantic 
Magazine  

June 12, 1893 

7 40 A.W. Gilbert J.C. Huntington 
& Co. 

Dungan corn 
matter 

June 21, 1893 

7 41 A.W. Gilbert Ralph Marriage June 22, 1893 

7 42 R.L. Bower [A.W. Gilbert] Unable to visit 
Elland 

July 10, 1893 

7 43 A.W. Gilbert Frank Bruner Business matters August 7, 1893 

7 44 A.W. Gilbert H.E. Scudder Clipping  from the 
Atlantic on the 
political situation 

August 7, 1893 

7 45 A.W. Gilbert Frank Bruner Business matters August 7, 1893 

7 46 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Financial matters August 15, 1893 

7 47 A.W. Gilbert Joseph Ketner Bank matters August 16, 1893 

7 48 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Financial matters August 22, 1893 

7 49 A.W. Gilbert Agnes Interest in visiting August 23, 1893 

7 50 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Financial matters August 25, 1893 

7 51 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Financial matters August 31, 1893 

7 52 Bert Brunnert A.W. Gilbert Sale of south acres 
of farm and 
mortgage for same 

September 4, 1893 

7 53 A.W. Gilbert G.H. Hurley Value of property 
on which Chrisman 
mortgage is based 

September 5, 1893 

7 54 Bert Brunnert A.W. Gilbert Mortgage on place 
near Lamar 

September 7, 1893 

7 55 A.W. Gilbert Thomas 
Gibson 

George Richards’ 
application for 

September 12, 1893 
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position of 
superintendent of 
the Ohio Humane 
Society 

7 56 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Bert Brunnert’s 
ability to meet his 
payment 

September 13, 1893 

7 57 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Financial matters 
regarding Bert 
Brunnert 

September 16, 1893 

7 58 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Mortgage October 2, 1893 

7 59 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Brunnert matter October 3, 1893 

7 60 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Brunnert matter October 16, 1893 

7 61 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Brunnert matter November 2, 1893 

7 62 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Value of Building & 
Loan Association 
shares 

November 3, 1893 

7 63 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Brunnert matter November 8, 1893 

7 64 A.W. Gilbert H.E. Scudder Political situation of 
1892 

November 10, 1893 

7 65 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Financial matters November 22, 1893 

7 66 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Financial matters November 25, 1893 

7 67 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Building & Loan 
Association dues 

December 6, 1893 

7 68 A.W. Gilbert H.E. Scudder Renewing 
subscription to the 
Atlantic 

December 9, 1893 

7 69 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Business matters December 16, 1893 

7 70 G.W. Hurley A.W. Gilbert Town lots December 20, 1893 

7 71 A.W. Gilbert H.E. Scudder Atlantic Monthly 
subscription 

December 27, 1893 

7 72 J.S. Adair A.W. Gilbert Recent activities January 2, 1894 

7 73 A.W. Gilbert H.E. Scudder Business matters January 4, 1894 

7 74 A.W. Gilbert George 
Mackenzie 

Dues on stock 
shares 

February 12, 1894 

7 75 A.W. Gilbert G.W. Hurley Financial matters March 13, 1894 

7 76 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Cline Mortgages March 31, 1894 

7 77 A.W. Gilbert A.H. Cline Financial matters April 17, 1894 

7 78 A.W. Gilbert Morris Bowen Financial matters April 28, 1894 

7 79 A.W. Gilbert Cashier, 
Citizens 
National Bank 

Chrisman mortgage July 19, 1894 
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7 80 A.W. Gilbert Mr. Jackman Lots in Moore & 
Adairs addition 

July 20, 1894 

7 81 A.W. Gilbert Miss Hooper Brother’s illness  July 21, 1894 

7 82 A.W. Gilbert J.W. Smith Chrisman note  September 18, 1894 

  
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXVII:  Elizabeth Richards Gilbert to Nellie Gilbert Allcutt  
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

7 83 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family  September 25, 1873 

7 84 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family April 2, 1875 

7 85 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family  September 14, 1875 

7 86 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family September 15, 1875 

7 87 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family September 20, 1875 

7 88 Ada’s condition; news of acquaintances October 17, 1875 

7 89 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family 1875 

7 90 Recent correspondence; state of the river; Ada’s 
condition; recent activities 

August 11, 1877 

7 91 Health; recent activities; news of acquaintances February 2, 1878 

7 92 Recent activities; health; news of acquaintances August 2, 1882 

7 93 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 

7 94 Recent activities  Undated 

7 95 Health; recent activities; news of acquaintances and 
family 

Undated 

7 96 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 

7 97 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 

7 98 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 

7 99 Her depressed state and fears regarding the cause 
of her sickness 

Undated 

7 100 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 

7 101 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 

7 102 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 
 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXVIII:  Elizabeth Richards Gilbert to Ada Gilbert Carpenter 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

7 103 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family January 7, 1870 

7 104 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 
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Subseries XXIX:  Elizabeth Richards Gilbert to Warren Gilbert  
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

7 105 Written on Cincinnati Masonic Temple letterhead; 
recent activities; news of acquaintances and family 

April 22, 1866 

7 106 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 

7 107 Written on Cincinnati Woodward High School 
letterhead; recent activities; news of acquaintances 
and family 

Undated 

7 108 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXX:  Elizabeth Richards Gilbert to Eleanor Richards 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

7 109 Thoughts before journey; news of Aunt Hannah Undated 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXXI:  Elizabeth Richards Gilbert to Ellen Richards 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

7 110 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family March 11, 1856 

7 111 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 

7 112 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 
 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXXII:  Elizabeth Richards Gilbert to Giles Richards 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

7 113 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family April 18, 1846 

7 114 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family March 1864 

7 115 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family March 1864 

7 116 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family March 24, 1864 

7 117 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family, 
including upcoming baptism of Adolph and Nellie 

April 10, 1864 

7 118 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family December 10, 1864 

7 119 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 

7 120 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 

7 121 Anxious to have children at home  Undated 

7 122 Propriety of sending the children away Undated 

7 123 Recent activities Undated 
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Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXXIII: Correspondence to Joseph Gilbert Regarding the Estate of Alice Royston  
 

Box Folder Author Subject Date 

8 1 Few Ashmore & 
Hamilton 

Relation to Mrs. Royston; state of 
receipts and payments; 
arrangement of the estate; 
treatment of insane persons; 
possible poisoning of her food and 
other related matters  

November 25, 1820 

8 2 C. Few Copy of Mr. Bamfield’s report; 
identity of Mrs. Royston’s legal 
guardians 

1823 

8 3 Few Ashmore & 
Hamilton 

Mrs. Royston’s wishes about her 
removal  

September 13, 1823 

8 4 William 
Armistead 

Arrival at Liverpool; particulars of 
Mrs. Royston’s marriage 

October 27, 1823 

8 5 William 
Armistead 

Settling matter March 17, 1824 

8 6 William 
Armistead 

Family matters April 2, 1824 

8 7 Few Ashmore & 
Hamilton 

Visit with Elizabeth Royston; her 
health and financial well-being; 
estate plans 

April 3, 1827 

8 8 Few Hamilton & 
Few 

Death of Mrs. Royston; financial 
matters 

March 28, 1832 

8 9 Few Hamilton & 
Few 

Death of Mrs. Royston; financial 
matters 

April 5, 1832 

8 10 Few Hamilton & 
Few 

Financial matters  October 1, 1832 

8 11 James Earle Dead letter opened and contents 
read 

November 22, 1832 

8 12 William 
Armistead 

Instructions for the execution of 
the requisition bonds affirmation 
as to leasehold estates 

February 7, 1833 

8 13 Few Hamilton & 
Few  

Powers of attorney August 30, 1833 

8 14 William 
Armistead 

Receipt of papers; power of 
attorney and other estate matters 

November 2, 1833 

8 15 William 
Armistead 

Powers of attorney; estate matters January 17, 1834 

8 16 C. Donaldson & Termination of estate matters March 5, 1834 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

Co. 

8 17 Few Hamilton & 
Few 

Estate matters; charges for same July 19, 1834 

8 18 N. Paro Estate matters Undated 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXXIV:  Joseph Gilbert to Alfred W. Gilbert  
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

8 19 Thoughts about recent reading; recent activities; 
news of acquaintances and family 

August 22, 1845 

8 20 Sent plat as surveyed; deed for same  November 7, 1847 

8 21 News of acquaintances January 5, 1848 

8 22 Life & Trust Co. matters; news of family April 6, 1848 

8 23 Recent activities; news of family August 1, 1848 

8 24 Recent activities; news of family February 23, 1849 

8 25 News of Mr. Leonard March 13, 1849 

8 26 Advice about taking brother’s offer March 26, 1849 

8 27 Concern about him and his family May 1849 

8 28 News of family; recent activities June 19, 1849 

8 29 Advice; news of family July 2, 1849 

8 30 Advice; news of family July 4, 1849 

8 31 Advice; news of family July 9, 1849 

8 32 Advice; news of family July 18, 1849 

8 33 News of family; business advice August 4, 1849 

8 34 Advice; news of family August 8, 1849 

8 35 Advice; news of family August 25, 1849 

8 36 Advice; news of family August 1849 

8 37 News of family; recent activities September 6, 1849 

8 38 Recent activities; interest in living at his house when 
Henry comes 

March 5, 1850 

8 39 Advice; health; request for mutton chops  July 6 

8 40 Recent activities; news of acquaintances November 30 

8 41 Health; recent activities; news of acquaintances Undated 

8 42 News of acquaintances and family; business matters Undated 
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Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXXV: Miscellaneous Correspondence of Joseph Gilbert  
 

Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

8 43 C. Donaldson Joseph Gilbert Sparing Alfred 
to help him 

May 30, 1829 

8 44 Alfred W. 
Gilbert 

Joseph Gilbert Arrival in New 
Orleans; news 
of journey and 
activities there 

December 14, 1835 

8 45 Alfred W. 
Gilbert 

Joseph Gilbert  Activities in New 
Orleans 

January 14, 1836 

8 46 Alfred W. 
Gilbert 

Joseph Gilbert Description of 
journey to 
Shawneetown 

February 15, 1836 

8 47 Joseph Gilbert Daughter News of 
acquaintances; 
recent activities 

November 7, 1849 

8 48 Joseph Gilbert Charles Gilbert Death of mother December 10 
 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXXVI: Martha Holmes to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

8 49 Recent activities; news of acquaintances March 10, 1841 

8 50 Recent activities; news of acquaintances June 16, 1841 

8 51 New Church preaching; recent activities; news of 
acquaintances 

September 9, 1841 

8 52 Recent activities; news of acquaintances October 20, 1841 

8 53 Recent activities; news of acquaintances November 19, 1842 

8 54 Recent activities; news of acquaintances May 3, 1845 

8 55 Recent activities; news of acquaintances December 6, 1845 

8 56 Recent activities; news of acquaintances March 15, 1846 

8 57 Recent activities; news of acquaintances August 24, 1846 

8 58 Recent activities; news of acquaintances February 24 

8 59 Recent activities; news of acquaintances March 29 

8 60 Recent activities; news of acquaintances August 18 
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Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXXVII: Amos Adams Richards (brother) to Giles Richards 
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

8 61 Recent activities; financial matters October 4, 1839 

8 62 Recent activities; financial matters October 31, 1839 

8 63 Financial matters April 21, 1840 

8 64 News of family  May 21, 1840 

8 65 Request for news of his whereabouts  November 19, 1840 

8 66 Correspondence from Judge about funds for travel to 
New Orleans 

December 31, 1840 

8 67 Business matters with Mr. Graham March 8, 1841 

8 68 Business matters with Mr. Graham May 1841 

8 69 Business matters with Mr. Graham June 13, 1846 

8 70 Business matters April 21, 1850 

8 71 Business matters July 31, 1856 

8 72 Business matters April 21, 1841 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXXVIII:  Eleanor Richards to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

8 73 Recent activities in Rock Island, Illinois; news of 
acquaintances  

July 17, [1842] 

8 74 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family January 4, 1845 

8 75 Recent activities; news of acquaintances November 16, 1845 

8 76 Recent activities; news of acquaintances December 12, [1845] 

8 77 Extract of brother John’s will; news of acquaintances 
and family 

October 12, 1849 

8 78 Health; news of acquaintances and family July 3, 1854 

8 79 Flag for 39th Regiment; activities of regiment February 23, 1862 

8 80 Health; news of acquaintances May 1863 

8 81 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family January 20 

8 82 Health; news of family and acquaintances March 3 

8 83 Recent activities; news of family and acquaintances March 4 

8 84 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family April 22 

8 85 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family June 4 

8 86 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family July 5 

8 87 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family September 29 

8 88 Health; news of acquaintances and family October 21 

8 89 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family November 

8 90 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family Undated 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

8 91 News of acquaintances and family Undated 

8 92 Ellen’s health Undated 

8 93 Illness; recent activities; news of family Undated 

8 94 Ellen’s death Undated 

8 95 News of recent activities in New Orleans Undated 

8 96 Cape is finished; news of family Undated 

8 97 News of acquaintances and family Undated 

8 98 News of family Undated 

8 99 News of family; recent activities Undated 

8 100 Bees and mice Undated 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XXXIX:  Eleanor Richards to Giles Richards  
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

8 101 Recent activities; news of family January 1, 1840 

8 102 Recent activities; news of family and acquaintances July 16 
 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XL:  Ellen Richards to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

8 103 Dream about her; news of acquaintances and family March 30, 1846 

8 104 Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family August 2, 1860 

8 105 Recent activities; news of family Undated 

8 106 News of family Undated 
 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XLI:  George Richards to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

8 107 Thoughts about whether to get married or go to 
school 

December 17, 1865 

8 108 Recent activities; thoughts about poetry about 
farming 

March 22, 1878 

 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XLII:  George T. Richards (uncle) to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

8 109 Recent activities in Paris November 30, 1845 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

8 110 Recent activities in Paris January 28, 1846 

8 111 Recent activities in Lyon; thoughts about family October 14, 1847 

8 112 Recent activities in Paris; thoughts about family March 19, 1862 

8 113 List of casualties at Corinth and thoughts about Alfred 
Gilbert; news of family and recent activities in Paris 

November 14, 1862 

8 114 News of family October 9, 1863 
 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XLIII:  Giles Richards to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

9 1 Advanced payment of her schooling February 7, 1836 

9 2 Advice on matters of affection October 3, 1845 

9 3 Recent activities; news of family and acquaintances November 10, 1845 

9 4 Recent activities; news of family and acquaintances January 20, 1846 

9 5 Recent activities; news of family and acquaintances; 
travel plans 

May 3, 1846 

9 6 Recent activities in Indianapolis November 22, 1846 

9 7 Journey on Mississippi River near Vicksburg November 23, [1846] 

9 8 Visit to St. Patrick’s Cathedral; recent activities November 29, 1846 

9 9 Recent activities; news of family August 13, 1848 

9 10 Statement of Bank Lick Rail Road Route February 2, 1850 
 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XLIV:  Miscellaneous Correspondence from Giles Richards   
  

Box Folder Recipient Subject Date 

9 11 Alvin Fisher Description of Hamilton, 
Ohio 

November 5, 1826 

9 12 Eleanor Richards Journey to St. Louis; plans 
for next stops in travel 

June 24, 1836 

9 13 Eleanor Richards Travel to Quincy, Illinois; 
information about 
business trip 

June 29, 1836 

9 14 Amos Lawrence Recent activities; news of 
family and acquaintances 

November 8, 1836 

9 15 Amos Lawrence Business matters January 7, 1838 

9 16 J.G. Stillwell Financial matters July 20, 1840 

9 17 M. G. Williams Circular about convention 
at Cincinnati 

March 27, 1841 

9 18 John Sharp Letter of introduction for 
Alfred W. Gilbert 

August 23, 1841 
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Box Folder Recipient Subject Date 

9 19 Amos Lawrence Business matters March 15, 1846 

9 20 A.W. Gilbert Cause of his coldness and 
animosity towards him 

May 17, 1848 

9 21 J.C. DeCamp Lot of negro cloths sent 
in Fall 1847; relative lack 
of cholera in the area 

August 7, 1849 

9 22 Jenny Lind Thoughts about 
education, Swedenborg; 
invitation to visit Elland 

September 26, 1850 

9 23 Nicholas Longworth Statement for turnpike 
company 

December 7, 1850 

9 24 B. Cilley Selling half of fence 
across bottom lands 

August 28, 1851 

9 25 Rebecca Burnet Abstinence from tobacco February 7, 1853 

9 26 B. Cilley Replacing fences on 
bottom land 

February 22, 1853 

9 27 B. Cilley Lots for sale December 17, 1853 

9 28 Mary Anthony Orphan asylum of 
Cincinnati 

April 14, 1856 

9 29 George Richards Condition of the railroad December 2, 1856 

9 30 Sabin Hough Publications connected 
with the convention 

December 13, 1856 

9 31 S.R. Mollyneaux Dividends to turnpike December 22, 1862 

9 32 Burnet House What he should do with 
his second picking of 
grapes 

October 16, 1863 

9 33 Burnet House What to do with second 
picking of grapes 

October 17, 1863 

9 34 R.W. Burnet Donation for sanitary fair December 12, 1863 

9 35 Amos Lawrence Relationship of an angel 
of heaven 

November 20, 1873 

9 36 Eleanor Richards Description of events on 
journey; thoughts about 
Elizabeth 

Undated 

 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XLV:  Miscellaneous Correspondence to Giles Richards   
  

Box Folder Author Subject Date 

9 37 John Andrews Financial matters September 28, 1819 

9 38 John Andrews Financial matters November 30, 1819 

9 39 John Andrews Instructions and April 26, 1820 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

explanation of business 
matters 

9 40 John Andrews Business matters August 8, 1820 

9 41 John Andrews Business matters October 1820 

9 42 John Andrews State of affairs with 
Capron 

March 5, 1821 

9 43 John Andrews Business matters 
regarding creditors 

September 15, 1821 

9 44 John Andrews Accounting and mortgage 
matters 

April 23, 1822 

9 45 Giles Richards (father) Recent activities; news of 
family and acquaintances 

October 18, 1823 

9 46 Mary DeCharms Elland’s wine; thoughts 
about their friendship 

January 9, 1828 

9 47 Ogden Ross Invitation to marriage of 
daughter Caroline 

September 29, 1829 

9 48 J.T. Goodman & Co. Financial matters December 31, 1831 

9 49 Thomas M. Hardcastle Investment in land June 2, 1836 

9 50 Clementina Woodward Request for information 
about journey  

October 7, 1836 

9 51 Amos Lawrence News of recent activities 
in Boston; request for 
information about 
mother’s property 

October 10, 1836 

9 52 R. DeCharms Numbers of Sir Walter 
Scott’s works 

December 26, 1836 

9 53 Amos Lawrence Family matters February 8, 1837 

9 54 Amos Lawrence Political thoughts November 5, 1838 

9 55 Ogden Ross Invitation to attend 
meeting in Hamilton 

July 12, 1839 

9 56 Ogden Ross Political thoughts December 24, 1839 

9 57 J.C. Clark Prospectus for 
Madisonian circular 

February 18, 1840 

9 58 Amos Lawrence Visit to Gen. Harrison April 27, 1840 

9 59 J. Corwin Handed names to 
Madisonian 

July 24, 1840 

9 60 Isaac Fisher Business matters July 25, 1840 

9 61 James Martin News of family; thoughts 
about political situation; 
recent activities 

July 26, 1840 

9 62 A.L. McClung Business matters September 29, 1840 

9 63 William Barnett Note regarding trespass December 15, 1840 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

upon lands 

9 64 S.C. Foote Public sale of assets of 
the Ohio Insurance 
Company 

March 15, 1841 

9 65 M.M. Carll Plans to visit Hamilton March 25, 1841 

9 66 James Martin Recent activities August 22, 1841 

9 67 Unknown Recent activities January 25, 1847 

9 68 J.C. Decamp Business matters December 2, 1847 

9 69 Abby M. Marshall Copy of Mr. Adan’s will October 12, 1849 

9 70 Mary W. Ross Daughter Mary making 
her home with them for 
an indefinite period of 
time 

November 1, 1849 

9 71 Henry Simmons Recent activities; 
business matters 

January 4, 1850 

9 72 John Fulton Saw Major Decamp in 
New Orleans; can do 
nothing at present but 
will write particulars 
about sales 

January 5, 1850 

9 73 Lewis Garrard Dividend declared by 
Colerain Turnpike 
Company 

January 15, 1850 

9 74 J.H. Carter Loss of machinery by fire  February 23, 1850 

9 75 A.D. Coombs Sale of [grape] roots  March 7, 1850 

9 76 E. Morris Inquiry about Mr. 
DeCamp in New Orleans 

March 9, 1850 

9 77 A.D. Coombs Number of [grape] roots 
he wants 

March 27, 1850 

9 78 Nicholas Longworth Advice regarding growing 
grapes and making wine 

April 21, 1850 

9 79 A.D. Coombs Grape roots  May 13, 1850 

9 80 M. Smith Sending book for son’s 
use in liquor business 

May 18, 1850 

9 81 James A. Parker Financial matters June 5, 1850 

9 82 James N. Pinney Financial matters August 20, 1850 

9 83 Lewis Garrard Application to Cincinnati 
& Colerain Turnpike Co. 

September 3, 1850 

9 84 James A. Parker Financial matters September 9, 1850 

9 85 W.H. Smith Business matters 
regarding Estep 

October 2, 1850 

9 86 J.A. Parker Estep matter November 8, 1850 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

9 87 Mary W. Ross Reasons for departure November 9, 1850 

9 88 J.A. Parker Estep matter November 15, 1850 

9 89 N. Longworth Stock dividends from 
turnpike 

December 12, 1850 

9 90 H.S. Waldo Recent activities January 17, 1851 

9 91 Henry Richards Letters from Messrs. 
Burnett and Smith 

January 20, 1851 

9 92 H.S. Waldo Plan and notice regarding 
property 

March 13, 1851 

9 93 Aaron B. Crowell Sending lot of pine trees March 19, 1851 

9 94 Agnes Martin Recent activities; news of 
family 

March 30, 1851 

9 95 Josiah Lingo Examination of lower 
portion of road 

November 26, 1861 

9 96 James N. Pinney Financial matters December 5, 1851 

9 97 Aaron B. Crowell Information about trees December 18, 1851 

9 98 John R. Lewis Examination of records of 
mortgages regarding 
property of Elizabeth 
Caldwell 

December 19, 1851 

9 99 Josiah Lingo Selling ground east of the 
pike to pay claim 

December 20, 1851 

9 100 J. Dunlop Ludlow Instructions to send 
check for order 

January 29, 1852 

9 101 L. Dick Obtaining 300 fence 
posts 

February 25, 1852 

9 102 Andrew Scott Letter of 
introduction/recommend
ation for Ezekiel Turner 

March 5, 1852 

9 104 Amos Lawrence  April 20, 1863 

9 105 Amos Lawrence  November 7, 1863 

9 103 City Bank of Cincinnati Financial matter  
Request for secretary of 
Cincinnati and Colerain 
Turnpike to remit amount 
due to Susan Stagg on 
her stock for the last six 
months 

April 5, 1852 

9 104 Eliza P. Este James Poole’s application 
to the managers of the 
Cincinnati Orphan Asylum 
regarding transferring 

April 6, 1862 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

Charles Foster’s 
indentures from his 
father to himself 

9 105 V. Mitchel Finishing truck to test 
improvement  

May 17, 1852 

9 106 L. Stagg Sale of acreage May 19, 1852 

9 107 Josiah Lingo Receipt for dividends on 
certificate  

June 2, 1852 

9 108 N.S. Waldo Patent of 40 acres  January 20, 1853 

9 109 B. Cilley Selling acreage April 22, 1853 

9 110 L.D. Campbell Unable to go down for 
corn; sending bearer of 
note instead 

May 6, 1853 

9 111 R. DeCharnis Contribution to aid in 
publications for church 

August 21, 1853 

9 112 L.D. Campbell Enclosing copy of plat August 22, 1853 

9 113 [Thomas] Richards Grape harvest October 24, 1853 

9 114 L.D. Campbell Unable to examine 
Livingston paper; 
purchasing peach trees 

November 24, 1853 

9 115 G.W. Burnet Counterfeit note December 3, 1853 

9 116 B. Cilley Payment of bill December 3, 1853 

9 117 Samuel McCrary Butterfield matter March 11, 1855 

9 118 Amos Lawrence News of family; invited 
governor to dinner 

March 29, 1855 

9 119 Amos Lawrence Check to pay Mr. 
Longworth 

November 16, 1855 

9 120 Wood & Taylor Bill for Ellen Richards’ 
books 

January 18, 1856 

9 121 J.L. Wayne Money paid on Mr. 
DeCharm’s account 

February 18, 1856 

9 122 A.M. Woodward Check for Mr. Wakefield’s 
payment on receipt of 
deed 

February 24, 1856 

9 123 Wood & Taylor Payment on note  April 9, 1856 

9 124 Sr. Mary Anthony Petition of Sr. Mary 
Anthony on behalf of 
Orphan Asylum of 
Cincinnati to pass free of 
toll on the turnpike to 
and from Cincinnati 

April 11, 1856 

9 125 W.C. Gray Not attending to his April 23, 1856 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

demands regarding 
financial matters  

9 126 S.T. Lippincott Arrangement in the 
restaurant business and 
wine cellar 

April 28, 1856 

9 127 Willard G. Day Invitation to meeting of 
the General Society of 
the New Church in Ohio 
on August 29; 
acknowledgment of 
pamphlets received 

August 12, 1856 

9 128 W.I. Birckhead Testifying on issue August 30, 1856 

9 129 A.M. Woodward News of family; recent 
activities 

September 6, 1856 

9 130 T.F. Eckert Lot  from Mr. Riddle September 30, 1856 

9 131 L.S. Burnham Receipt of wine October 13, 1856 

9 132 F.G. Cary Business matters December 5, 1856 

9 133 Richard Sears Raising grapes in New 
Jersey 

December 8, 1856 

9 134 A.W. Gilbert How to dispose of 
property to go to Kansas 

December 29, 1856 

9 135 W.I. Birckhead Attorney as witness in 
Maria Gaffin case 

1856 

9 136 McCormick & Erupson  Receipt of $1; remaining 
balance due  

January 13, 1857 

9 137 H.B. Wilson Written on Civil War 
letterhead; enclosing 
certificate of enlistment 
to give to his wife; news 
of regiment’s activities 

March 12, 1862 

9 138 Amos Lawrence Newspaper accounts of 
Ohio regiments; recent 
deaths of family 
members 

March 30, 1862 

9 139 E.E. Palmer Note regarding 
assignment which has 
fallen through 

November 4, 1862 

9 140 E.E. Palmer Gave note to James Hill 
for collection 

December 11, 1862 

9 141 George G. Richards Business matters 
regarding hogs 

January 13, 1863 

9 143 DeTerisy & Robbins Purchasing bushels of January 21, 1863 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

corn 

9 144 Julia Hinman Receipt of draft January 22, 1863 

9 145 William Irwin Receipt of note; contents 
shown to Judge Hume; 
excuses him from serving 
on jury this term 

February 2, 1863 

9 146 Charles Richards News and health of 
family 

February 8, 1863 

9 147 E.E. Palmer Case of Charles Faucett February 13, 1863 

9 148 Ticknor & Fields Have not received $2.00 
which he says he sent  

March 16, 1863 

9 149 E.E. Palmer Transcript of judgment to 
send to Indiana 

March 26, 1863 

9 150 A.G. Gano Amount of corn 
purchased from him 

April 1, 1863 

10 1 E.E. Palmer Large amount of money 
has come to the deputy 
auditor 

April 6, 1863 

10 2 Amos Lawrence Thoughts about a 
recently departed female 

April 20, 1863 

10 3 Peter Zinn Farmers’ College; case of 
Cummings against several 
shareholders of the 
Cincinnati & Western 
Railroad 

May 5, 1863 

10 4 P.H. Robertson Sending tickets for 
collection of tolls 

May 19, 1863 

10 5 Agent of Contraband Keeping girl until further 
orders; grateful for 
kindness shown to the 
poor 

June 1863 

10 6 A.J. Smith Land matters August 3, 1863 

10 7 George Richards Recent activities; letter 
from Treasury 
Department Office of 
Internal Revenue about 
turnpike and receipt for 
loads of corn 

August 16, 1863 

10 8 D.W. McClung Demand for onions August 19, 1863 

10 9 A. Burley Shafts and spokes in 
wheel 

August 22, 1863 

10 10 B. DuBarry Advertisement for August 31, 1863 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

potatoes and onions in 
Cincinnati Gazette 

10 11 C.F. Thomin Taking wheat September 17, 1863 

10 12 Thomas Kellor Interest note September 20, 1863 

10 13 D. Harper & Son Will give him a dollar for 
onions 

September 25, 1863 

10 14 Leuthstrom & Russell Payment of one dollar 
per bushel for onions 

September 25, 1863 

10 15 William Leuthstrom Interest in buying onions, 
but not justified in paying 
his price 

October 24, 1863 

10 16 DeTerisy & Robbins Purchase of corn November 4, 1863 

10 17 Amos Lawrence Engagement of daughter 
Mary to Robert Amory; 
advice regarding notes of 
the Chicago & Cincinnati 
Railroad 

 

10 18 Leuthstrom & Russell Price for onions November 10, 1863 

10 19 A.J. Smith Offer of six dollars per 
acre for his 80 adjoining 
acres 

November 16, 1863 

10 20 DeTerisy & Robbins Selling 500 bushels of 
corn for $400 

November 17, 1863 

10 21 C.L. Woodward Purchase of sheep; 
sample of wool from 
same attached to letter 

November 22, 1863 

10 22 DeTerisy & Robbins Deposit of $400; request 
for extra load of corn 

November 24, 1863 

10 23 A.J. Smith Tenant offering $500 for 
his lot of land 

December 4, 1863 

10 24 Thomas Withenbury Financial matter December 9, 1863 

10 25 Harper & Brothers Increase in rates for 
Harper’s Magazine 

December 1863 

10 26 J.W. Riley Leasing a part of land December 21, 1863 

10 27 B.F. Ruble Request for money due 
him 

September 22, 1864 

10 28 DeTerissy & Robbins Intends to remove corn 
soon 

May 20, 1869 

10 29 L.S. Carpenter Giving Alfred Gilbert 
power of attorney for the 
care of his property 

February 10, 1874 

10 30 William C. Gray Changes in domestic December 17, 1886 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

affairs prevented him 
from attending to 
financial matters  

10 31 Horace N. Woodward Political situation; trip to 
Kansas City; family news; 
recent activities 

October 22 

10 32 J.R. Adan Hopes parcel has been 
received; news of family 

Undated 

10 33 W.R. Cochran Financial matters Undated 

10 34 J.S. Iglehart Request to see him for 
the amount of the note 

Undated 

10 35 Jacob Nose Instructions on leaving 
money 

Undated  

10 36 Charles Richards Invitation to dinner Undated 

10 37 Charles Richards Visit of Miss Gulick to 
Hamilton 

Undated 

10 38 Charles Richards Bill for quantity sent; 
recent activities 

Undated 

10 39 Albin Shaw Request for sending 
money 

Undated 

 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XLVI:  Correspondence to Giles Richards Regarding Great Western Sanitary Fair 
  

Box Folder Author Subject Date 

10 40 S.R. Mollyneaux Request for posts and 
bushels of corn 

January 28, 1850 

10 41 S.R. Mollyneaux Grading and opening side 
ditches east of college 
grounds 

May 21, 1852 

10 42 S.R. Mollyneaux Proposition to move 
fence 

1852 

10 43 S.R. Mollyneaux Road needs protection at 
south end of bridge over 
Collier Run by gate 

March 21, 1856 

10 44 S.R. Mollyneaux Posts for college fence September 15, 1856 

10 45 S.R. Mollyneaux Posts for college fence September 24, 1856 

10 46 S.R. Mollyneaux Fence posts December 15, 1856 

10 47 P.C. Wheelock Settlement with Mr. 
Wheelock 

January 13, 1863 

10 48 R.W. Russell Receipt of $15 for 
sanitary commission  

January 19, 1863 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

10 49 Thomas Keelor Donation to Soldiers Aid 
Society 

September 28, 1863 

10 50 John B. Heich Contribution received by 
Sanitary Commission 

October 6, 1863 

10 51 A.W. Gilbert Sending someone to 
Chattanooga to collect 
lists of memorials from 
the battlefield 

November 27, 1863 

10 52 R.W. Burnet Payment for stores at 
Prudence Exchange 

December 16, 1863 

10 53 A. Gano Receipt of miscellaneous 
articles donated to the 
Great Western Sanitary 
Fair 

December 30, 1863 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XLVII:  Correspondence to Giles Richards Regarding Cincinnati Western Railway  
  

Box Folder Author Subject Date 

10 54 Andrew Porter Examining valley of Bank 
Lick Creek to determine 
practicability of 
constructing railroad 
along it connecting with a 
branch of Mill Creek 

January 15, 1850 

10 55 E. Morris Reports of railroads in 
Indiana  

April 15, 1850 

10 56 A.W. Gilbert Official election returns 
for vote upon railroad  

October 13, 1850 

10 57 H.C. Moore Copies of estimates September 6, 1850 

10 58 H.C. Moore Copies of estimates of 
cost of surveyed line 
between College Corner 
and southwest corner of 
section 16, northwest of 
Millville 

September 7, 1850 

10 59 Caleb B. Smith Synopsis of Col. Mitchell’s 
published report giving 
distances 

September 7, 1850 

10 60 H.C. Moore Distances to College 
Corner 

September 11, 1850 

10 61 O.C. Hays Amount of loan September 17, 1850 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

10 62 Caleb B. Smith History of proceedings of 
the council 

September 23, 1850 

10 63 W.L. Johns Commencing work on 
railroad 

September 29, 1850 

10 64 Caleb B. Smith Organization of Junction 
Rail Road 

October 10, 1850 

10 65 Alfred W. Gilbert Conversation with Caleb 
B. Smith regarding 
progress of railroad 

October 17, 1850 

10 66 Caleb B. Smith Update on railroad October 19, 1850 

10 67 Alfred W. Gilbert Summary of rail route 
meeting  

October 30, 1850 

10 68 H.C. Moore Applying for a charter for 
a road from Cincinnati to 
the state line in the 
direction of Rushville 

November 11, 1850 

10 69 Alfred W. Gilbert Corresponding with 
citizens of Indiana to 
survey a route for 
proposed railway from 
Connersville  

November 12, 1850 

10 70 Caleb B. Smith Railroad route to 
Rushville 

December 6, 1850 

10 71 J. Kilbourne Opposition to rail hill  December 17, 1850 

10 72 J. Kilbourne Prospect for charter December 23, 1850 

10 73 Caleb B. Smith Update on route 
development 

December 29, 1850 

10 74 Alfred W. Gilbert Attending to charter in 
Columbus 

ca. 1850-1851 

10 75 Caleb B. Smith Provision in charter 
authorizing extension of 
road to Connersville 

January 1, 1851 

10 76 T. Martin Election of director for 
Union Company 

January 6, 1851 

10 77 Caleb B. Smith Relocation of line to 
Rushville to save a mile in 
distance 

January 14, 1851 

10 78 Caleb B. Smith Line from Connersville to 
Rushville 

January 14, 1851 

10 79 Caleb B. Smith Passage of charter with 
provision authorizing city 
to loan its bonds 

January 20, 1851 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

10 80 Alfred W. Gilbert Obtaining signatures of 
best names of city 

January 21, 1851 

10 81 T. Kirby Charter January 28, 1851 

10 82 Alfred W. Gilbert Update on meetings with 
people 

February 3, 1851 

10 83 Caleb B. Smith Cincinnati Gazette 
editorial on railroads 

February 7, 1851 

10 84 J. Kilbourne Amendment to House 
amendment  

February 10, 1851 

10 85 Alfred W. Gilbert Business matters February 1851 

10 86 Philip Mason Information on creek March 8, 1851 

10 87 S. Martin Request to attend 
meeting of Cincinnati 
Western Railroad 
Company on March 25 

March 17, 1851 

10 88 J. Kilbourne Railroad prospects March 18, 1851 

10 89 Philip Mason Getting stocks and 
organizing a board of 
directors on the Western 
Railroad 

March 30, 1851 

10 90 Philip Mason Obtaining stock for 
railroad 

April 14, 1851 

10 91 J. Kirby Relations with Western 
Railroad 

July 18, 1851 

10 92 John Woods Planting osage orange 
hedges along railroad 
track 

September 15, 1851 

10 93 Alfred W. Gilbert Railroad-related business 
matters 

December 21, 1851 

10 94 Caleb B. Smith Constructing road to the 
Miami Canal 

September 5, 1853 

10 95 Owen & Richards Warrants on treasurer of 
the Junction Railroad 
Company ; probabilities 
of payment 

October 30, 1854 

10 96 A.H. Campbell Advice on making 
crossing of road by pike 

July 31, 1856 

10 97 Oviatt Cole Dividend declared by 
Colerain Oxford & 
Brookville Turnpike 
Company 

November 13, 1856 

10 98 C. Fay Draft for dividend December 31, 1863 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

amount 

10 99 G.H. Dunn  Railroad routes Undated 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XLVIII:  Correspondence from Giles Richards Regarding Cincinnati Western Railway  
  

Box Folder Recipient Subject Date 

10 100 President, Members of 
Cincinnati City Council 

Draft of letter regarding 
preamble and resolution 
regarding the railway 

January 10, 1850 

10 101 Schiff, Linn & Bennett Resolution of City Council 
requesting members of 
General Assembly to pass 
bill incorporating the 
Cincinnati Western 
Railroad Company 

January 24, 1850 

10 102 Caleb B. Smith Completion of survey on 
west side of the Miami 
River 

September 7, 1850 

10 103 Editors Survey of route for 
railroad from Cincinnati 
to intersect routes 
already surveyed in 
Indiana from Indianapolis 
to the state line in the 
direction to Cincinnati 

September 9, 1850 

10 104 John Woods Request for deficiencies 
in practical working of 
railroad law 

November 27, 1850 

10 105 Caleb B. Smith Opposition in Columbus 
against railroad charter 

December 24, 1850 

10 106 James Iliff and Andrew 
Davison 

West St. Louis project January 11, 1851 

10 107 Hamilton Delegation Resolution of City Council 
to pass bill incorporating 
the Cincinnati Western 
Railroad 

January 24, 1851 

10 108 P. Linn Obtaining a fair charter 
for the Cincinnati 
Western Railroad 

February 3, 1851 

10 109 A.  Haynes Connection with the 
Hamilton & Dayton 

July 20, 1851 
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Box Folder Recipient Subject Date 

[Railroad] Company 

10 110 N. Worthington Draft of letter to 
incorporation of 
Cincinnati Western 
Railroad Company 

August 23, 1853 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries XLIX: Correspondence to Giles Richards Regarding Ohio Female College 
 

Box Folder Author Subject Date 

10 111 J. Covert Upcoming examination of 
class; happy to see he and 
his lady that day (written 
on Ohio Female College 
printed material) 

February 8, 1850 

10 112 S.F. Cary Financial matters December 17, 1851 

10 113 F.G. Cary Business matters December 1, 1856 

10 114 S.F. Cary Notice of meeting of 
Board of Trustees 

June 9, 1863 

10 115 Mrs. Morris Explanation of matter 
before meeting 

July 30, 1863 

10 116 S. R. Mollyneaux Assisting him with college 
books 

September 16, 
1863 

10 117 Charles E. Cheever A young lady friend’s 
interest in attending 
college  

September 3, 1863 

10 118 S.F. Cary Notice of meeting of 
Board of Trustees 

October 18, 1863 

10 119 S.F. Cary Opinion of his effort at 
Venice; results of board 
meeting 

October 29, 1863 

10 120 J. Tuckerman Balancing the college 
books 

December 19, 1863 

10 121 S.F. Cary Meeting regarding 
transferring college to the 
state  

December 28, 1863 

10 122 F.Y. Vail Arrangement to mutual 
satisfaction; upcoming 
meeting to finish up 
college matters 

June 27, 1864 

10 123 F.Y. Vail Adjustment and 
endorsement of college 

June 30, 1864 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

matters 

10 124 J. Tuckerman Report of Dr. Warder to 
Cincinnati Horticultural 
Society relative to 
establishment of state 
agricultural colleges 

November 28, 1864 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries L:  Correspondence from Giles Richards Regarding Land Holdings in Butler and 
Hamilton Counties, Ohio 
  

Box Folder Recipient Subject Date 

10 125 John Woods Delivery of locust posts November 16, 1848 

10 126 John Jacob Burnett Conveyance of Section 24; 
obtaining county road from 
turnpike  

September 16, 1851 

10 127 I. Burnet Financial matters July 1852 

10 128 I. Burnet Financial matters 1853 

10 129 R.W. Burnet Financial proposal November 10, 1853 

10 130 George W. Burnet Financial matters January 10, 1854 

10 131 T.F. Eckert Value of land on validity of 
title 

July 28, 1856 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries LI:  Correspondence to Giles Richards Regarding Land Holdings in Butler and 
Hamilton Counties, Ohio 
  

Box Folder Author Subject Date 

10 132 J. Stilwell Financial matters September 2, 1836 

10 133 Carlisle & White Ohio Insurance Company 
dividend 

June 19, 1840 

10 134 Horace Hunt Financial matters February 1, 1850 

10 135 T.S. Goodman & Co.  Bank notes February 8, 1850 

10 136 Samuel J. Thompson Financial matters February 25, 1850 

10 137 T.S. Goodman & Co.  Financial matters May 13, 1850 

10 138 J.J. Barnett  Financial matters; Mr. 
Kilborn’s election to 
legislature 

November 30, 1850 

10 139 I. Burnet Load of corn March 11, 1851 

10 140 I. Burnet Receipt of checks for 
dividend on turnpike stock 

June 16, 1851 
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Box Folder Author Subject Date 

10 141 I. Burnet Business matter September 18, 1851 

10 142 Samuel S. Wintersteen Advertisement for land in 
the daily Sun 

March 2, 1852 

10 143 G.W. Burnet Father’s receipt of letter 
and check 

July 14, 1852 

10 144 G.W. Burnet Father’s receipt of check for 
dividend of stock in 
Colerain Oxford & 
Brookville Turnpike 

December 10, 1852 

10 145 G.W. Burnet Releasing mortgage from 
section 24; support of plan 

January 4, 1853 

10 146 G.W. Burnet Father’s receipt of check February 19, 1853 

10 147 V. Worthington Distribution of assets of 
Judge Bennet’s estate 

July 30, 1853  

10 148 V. Worthington Transferred note on 
distribution to Judge 
Bennett’s legatees 

August 23, 1853 

10 149 G.W. Burnet Request for funds October 31, 1853 

10 150 G.W. Burnet Advance of funds from note November 8, 1853 

11 1 G.W. Burnet Financial matters January 19, 1854 

11 2 John Sullivan Advertisement in city 
papers requesting people 
competent to fill offices of 
toll collector on the 
Colerain and Oxford 
Turnpike 

January 31, 1856 

11 3 C. Wright Smith Settlement of lots in 
subdivision 

February 9, 1856 

11 4 William Smith Who owns lot of land  March 21, 1856 

11 5 W.L. Groesbeck Financial matter with Mr. 
McLean  

May 23, 1856 

11 6 J.D. Bishop Receipt from Ohio Life 
Insurance and Trust 
Company 

May 30, 1856 

11 7 T.F. Eckert Proposition to sell land  July 20, 1856 

11 8 T.F. Eckert Purchase of Riddle lot September 13, 1856 

11 9 T.F. Eckert Purchase of Riddle lot September 23, 1856 

11 10 A. Gould Receipt for taxes June 11, 1863 

11 11 S.F. Cary & Co. Description of land December 12, 1863 

11 12 N.G. Oglesby Payment of taxes December 17, 1863 

11 13 Albin Shaw Getting clothes for his son 
in Hamilton 

August 12, 1864 
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Series: Correspondence  
Subseries LII: Correspondence Regarding Colerain-Oxford-Brookville Turnpike Company and 
Venice Bridge Company 
 

Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

11 14 Giles Richards Nehemiah 
Wade 

Unkind treatment 
regarding obtaining 
state subscription 

November 18, 1838 

11 15 John N. 
Barnett 

Giles Richards Sending dividends 
of Colerain and 
Venice Bridge tolls 

May 11, 1840 

11 16 John N. 
Barnett 

Giles Richards Sending dividends 
of bridge tolls 

January 2, 1841 

11 17 Giles Richards Bellamy Stover Financial matters March 13, 1845 

11 17 T. Kirby Giles Richards Offer for frame 
building 

May 13, 1847 

11 18 Giles Richards B. Cilley Note to Colerain & 
Venice Bridge Co. 

December 4, 1849 

11 19 T.I. Thompson Giles Richards Legal matter 
regarding turnpike 
company and claim 
against workers 

January 4, 1850 

11 20 I. Thompson Giles Richards Fee against 
company for case 
against Asa H. Cove 

January 23, 1850 

11 21 J. Struble Giles Richards Condemnation of 
road 

March 3, 1851 

11 22 A.B. Crowell Giles Richards Trees July 18, 1851 

11 23 J. Lingo Giles Richards Recording of deed December 27, 1851 

11 24 Susan Stagg Giles Richards Dividend for stock 
in Cincinnati & 
Colerain Turnpike 
Company 

January 8, 1852 

11 25 Pugh & 
Pendleton 

Giles Richards Names  February 13, 1852 

11 26 J. Dunlop 
Ludlow 

Giles Richards Father’s papers 
regarding stock in 
Colerain, Oxford & 
Brookville Turnpike 

February 21, 1852 

11 27 J.L. Enyant Giles Richards Interviews with 
county 
commissioners 

March 6, 1852 
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Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

regarding condition 
of road from 
Liberty Streets to 
Brighton House 

11 28 O.C. Hays Giles Richards Knowledge about 
suit brought 
against turnpike 
company 

June 12, 1852 

11 29 E.B. Smith Giles Richards Selling shares March 30, 1852 

11 30 J.D. Ludlow Giles Richards Having three 
directors appointed 
for turnpike 

January 21, 1856 

11 31 S.R. 
Mollyneaux 

Giles Richards Orders for 
dividends 

January 25, 1856 

11 32 William Hale Giles Richards Thanks for 
obtaining situation 
of collector for him 
at Gate No. 1 

February 4, 1856 

11 33 L.L. Brasher Giles Richards Receipt of letter 
announcing 
election to office of 
collector at Gate 
No. 1 

February 5, 1856 

11 34 Nathaniel 
Johnson 

Giles Richards Accounts related to 
toll collection 

March 10, 1856 

11 35 Henry C. Willet Giles Richards Information on 
accounts 

March 11, 1856 

11 36 George 
Graham 

Giles Richards Power of attorney 
for turnpike stock 

April 17, 1856 

11 37 Griffin Taylor Giles Richards Stock shares May 20, 1856 

11 38 Isaac Graham Giles Richards Check for stock 
dividend 

June 5, 1856 

11 39 James B. 
Milliken 

Giles Richards Sending dividend of 
Colerain turnpike 

June 10, 1856 

11 40 Giles Richards J.F. Stuckey Stock and dividend 
matters 

June 15, 1856 

11 41 A. McGill Giles Richards Meeting A.H. 
Campbell at 
railroad crossing  

June 24, 1856 

11 42 L.L. Brasher Giles Richards Request for tickets June 30, 1856 

11 43 H.M. Bates Giles Richards Omnibuses running 
on pike 

August 1, 1856 
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Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

11 44 E. Lane Giles Richards Payment of stock 
dividend 

December 3, 1856 

11 45 Isaac Graham Giles Richards Payment of 
dividend for 
turnpike stock 

December 6, 1856 

11 46 N.G. Oglesby Giles Richards Statement of 
December taxes 

December 16, 1862 

11 47 S.R. 
Mollyneaux 

Giles Richards Bill for collection February 3, 1863 

11 48 H.H. 
Whitworth 

Giles Richards Order to send 
turnpike stock 
dividend 

February 17, 1863 

11 49 J.B. Frost Giles Richards William Frost’s 
injury preventing 
him from taking 
gate 

March 4, 1863 

11 50 J.B. Frost N. Wade William Frost’s 
injury 

March 4, 1863 

11 51 S.B. McLean Giles Richards Dividend for 
turnpike stock 

July 27, 1863 

11 52 Charles 
Munroe 

Giles Richards Checks for stock 
dividends 

July 27, 1863 

11 53 John Kugler Giles Richards Copy of charter & 
bylaws for turnpike 
company 

October 4, 1863 

11 54 E.H. Johnson Giles Richards Preamble and 
resolution  

October 19, 1865 

11 55 E.W. Odell A.W. Gilbert Toll bill October 30, 1897 

11 56 J.W. Adams Giles Richards Request for tickets Undated 

 
Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries LIII:  Henry Richards to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

11 56A Recent activities at Elland; news of acquaintances October 19, 1845 

11 56B Recent activities; news of acquaintances and family March 1, 1846 

11 56C Recent activities at Elland; news of acquaintances and 
family 

April 1, 1846 

11 57 Regiment’s recent activities at Murfreesboro; 
possibility of promotion 

March 27, 1863 

11 58 Regiment’s recent activities in camp near Tullahoma, 
Tennessee 

August 7, 1863 



Gilbert-Richards Papers 
Page 111 

 

Box Folder Subject Date 

11 59 Regiment’s recent activities near Chattanooga September 26, 1863 

11 60 Regiment’s recent activities near Kelly’s Ford December 10, 1863 

11 61 Regiment’s recent activities near Chattanooga February 5, 1864 

11 62 Regiment’s recent activities near Chattanooga February 19, 1864 

11 63 Regiment’s recent activities near Chattanooga February 24, 1864 

11 64 Regiment’s recent activities near Knoxville March 8, 1864 

11 65 Regiment’s recent activities in camp July 14, 1864 

11 66 Regiment’s recent activities near Big Shanty October 10, 1864 

11 67 Regiment’s recent activities near Lookout Mountain October 20, 1864 

11 68 Regiment’s recent activities in officers hospital near 
Lookout Mountain 

November 1, 1864 

 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries LIV:  Henry Richards to Giles Richards  
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

11 69 Regiment’s recent activities in camp April 13, 1862 

11 70 Regiment’s recent activities in camp  September 4, 1862 

11 71 Regiment’s recent activities in crab orchard October 16, 1862 

11 72 Regiment’s recent activities near Lebanon, Kentucky October 22, 1862 

11 73 Regiment’s recent activities near Nashville November 9, 1862 

11 74 Regiment’s recent activities on the battlefield near 
Nashville 

January 4, 1863 

11 75 Regiment’s recent activities near Camp Drake June 8, 1863 

11 76 Photograph of Corps Commander of the Army of the 
Cumberland at Murfreesboro and Gen. Rosecrans 

June 14, 1863 

11 77 Leaving Camp Drake; possibility of promotion June 23, 1863 

11 78 Regiment’s recent activities near Camp Read July 21, 1863 

11 79 Recent letters from mother and others August 8, 1863 

11 80 Regiment’s recent activities from camp near 
Bellponte, Alabama 

August 29, 1863 

11 81 Encampment in valley west of Lookout Mountain September 5, 1863 

11 82 Recent events near Chattanooga/Lookout Mountain September 22, 1863 

11 83 Regiment’s recent events near Chattanooga September 28, 1863 

11 84 Regiment’s recent activities  October 29, 1863 

11 85 Regiment’s recent activities  October 29, 1863 

11 86 Regiment’s recent activities near Knoxville February 11, 1864 

11 87 Regiment’s recent activities near Knoxville March 7, 1864 

11 88 Regiment’s recent activities near Newmarket March 11, 1864 

11 89 Regiment’s recent activities in camp May 3, 1864 

11 90 Regiment’s recent activities near Cassville, Georgia  May 20, 1864 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

11 91 Regiment’s recent activities from battle line near 
Dallas, Georgia 

June 3, 1864 

11 92 Rebels left front; examined ground of recent fight June 6, 1864 

11 93 Regiment’s recent activities from camp near Acworth, 
Georgia 

June 8, 1864 

11 94 Regiment’s recent activities from line of battle near 
Marietta, Georgia 

June 16, 1864 

11 95 Regiment’s recent activities near Marietta, Georgia June 21, 1864 

11 96 Regiment’s recent activities near Marietta, Georgia June 22, 1864 

11 97 Regiment’s recent activities near Marietta, Georgia June 28, 1864 

11 98 Regiment’s recent activities near Marietta, Georgia July 3, 1864 

11 99 Regiment’s recent activities on the Chattahoochie 
River 

July 11, 1864 

11 100 Regiment’s recent activities near Atlanta, Georgia July 24, 1864 

11 101 Regiment’s recent activities near Atlanta, Georgia August 13, 1864 

11 102 Regiment’s recent activities near Atlanta, Georgia August 25, 1864 

11 103 Regiment’s recent activities near Atlanta, Georgia September 25, 1864 

11 104 Regiment’s recent activities in Dekalb County, 
Alabama, near the Georgia line 

September 4, 1865 

 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries LV:  L.E. Richards (aunt) to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

11 105 News of family and acquaintances May 14, 1863 

11 106 News of family and acquaintances June 5, 1864 

11 107 News of family and acquaintances; recent activities in 
Paris 

June 28, 1867 

11 108 News of family and acquaintances January 28, 1868 

11 109 News of family and acquaintances June 15, 1873 

11 110 News of family and acquaintances; recent activities in 
Paris 

April 28, 1876 

11 111 News of family and acquaintances; recent activities in 
Versailles 

June 13, 1878 

11 112 News of family and acquaintances; recent activities 
near Paris 

August 8, 1880 

11 113 News of family and acquaintances; recent activities in 
Paris 

November 13 
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Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries LVI:  Fannie Ross (cousin) to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

11 114 News of recent activities and acquaintances July 26, 1850 

11 115 Thoughts about the Civil War August 23, 1861 

11 116 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances July 27 

11 117 News of recent activities Undated 

11 118 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances Undated 

11 119 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances Undated 

11 120 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances Undated 
 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries LVII:  Mary Ross Waldo (cousin) to Elizabeth Richards Gilbert 
  

Box Folder Subject Date 

11 121 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances May 25, 1841 

11 122 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances March 15, 1846 

11 123 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances January 11, 1847 

11 124 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances May 23, 1847 

11 125 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances August 16, 1847 

11 126 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances September 24, 1847 

11 127 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances March 1849 

11 128 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances August 18, 1867 

11 129 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances Undated 

11 130 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances Undated 

11 131 News of recent activities, family and acquaintances Undated 
 

Series I: Correspondence  
Subseries LVIII: Miscellaneous Correspondence  
 

Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

12 1 S. Ferrell Robert 
Gilbert 

News of family; recent 
activities 

August 8, 1799 

12 2 Mary 
Speakman 

Mary 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances 

October 10, 1799 

12 3 Thomas 
Wood  

Peter 
Bedford 

Claim on the next of kin of 
Alice Royston 

December 19, 1822 

12 4 Mrs. 
Richards 

Mary E. 
Richards 

Recent activities; news of 
family and acquaintances 

March 20, 1827 

12 5 Mary E. 
Richards 

Charles 
Richards 

Introduction letter for 
Giles Richards 

February 20, 1835 



Gilbert-Richards Papers 
Page 114 

 

Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

12 6 Henry 
Emerson 

N. Ranney Recent activities; news of 
family and acquaintances 

June 16, 1836 

12 7 Sarah Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
family and acquaintances 

November 5, 1838 

12 8 Lydia T. 
Ross 

Eleanor 
Richards 

Recent activities in Paris; 
news of family and 
acquaintances 

March 13, 1839 

12 9 George T. 
Richards 

Amos 
Laurence 

Recent activities; news of 
family and acquaintances 

March 7, 1840 

12 10 Mary 
Hinman 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances 

March 12, 1841 

12 11 George 
Graham 

Giles 
Richards 

Receipt of letter from H.H. 
Richards about cotton mill 
business 

June 14, 1841 

12 12 George T. 
Richards 

Giles 
Richards 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances 

September 16, 
1841 

12 13 Mary 
Hinman 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances 

November 8, 1842 

12 14 Mary 
Hinman 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances 

March 19, 1843 

12 15 Eliza Ellen 
Van Doren 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

December 6, 1843 

12 16 Eliza Ellen 
Van Doren 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances 

[1843] 

12 17 Mary 
Hinman 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances 

February 9, 1845 

12 18 Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Charlotte 
Richards 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances 

November 25, 1845 

12 19 Charles 
Richards 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances  

January 11, 1846 

12 20 John 
Bamford 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; health; 
thoughts of friendship 

January 1, 1847 
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Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

12 21 L.J.C. Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Receipt of books and note; 
recent activities 

March 17, 1847 

12 22 Emily Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances 

May 23, 1847 

12 23 J.R. Adan Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Thoughts about her 
account of Mr. Gilbert; 
advice regarding same; 
recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

December 16, 1847 

12 24 J.R. Adan Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Thanks for book of 
thoughts and messages; 
recent activities; health; 
her upcoming marriage 

February 11, 1848 

12 25 J.R. Adan Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Encouraging words about 
her “hour of trial”; recent 
activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

May 1, 1848 

12 26 J.R. Adan Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

September 3, 1848 

12 27 N.S. Waldo Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Brother John’s leaving her 
$500 in his will 

September 24, 
1849 

12 28 Lizzie 
Vernon 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

January 24, 1850 

12 29 Gonynnez & 
Sheffield 

Amos A. 
Richards 

Order for wine casks February 3, 1850 

12 30 James H. 
Willey 

Eleanor 
Richards 

Acknowledgment of 
invitation to visit 

September 6, 1850 

12 31 Unknown Unknown Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

Circa July 1851 

12 32 J.D. Evans Eleanor 
Richards 

George’s troubling 
conduct 

October 14, 1851 

12 33 Uncle 
Laurence 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Multiple copies of Uncle 
Tom’s Cabin for 
distribution 

May 4, 1852 

12 34 Owen 
Richards 

Unknown Unable to advise on 
warranty of rail line 

November 15, 1854 

12 35 Susie Elizabeth Recent activities; news of March 18, 1855 
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Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

Waldon Richards 
Gilbert 

acquaintances and family 

12 36 Abner N. 
Woodward 

Henry 
Richards 

Quit claim and deed January 23, 1856 

12 37 Unknown J.C. Meinert Religious opinious 1856 

12 38 W. Stewart Unknown Financial matter September 10, 
1857 

12 39 Unknown  Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Receipt of picture; recent 
activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

November 24, 1861 

12 40 N.M. Gulick Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

February 5, 1863 

12 41 Dan F. 
Farrand 

Ellen 
Richards 

Letter of inquiry for Susan 
Malone 

March 19, 1863 

12 42 Mary C. 
Bedinger 

Eleanor 
Richards 

Plans to  visit; marriage of 
Hattie and Frank 

May 20, 1863 

12 43 Francis 
Malone 

Susan 
Malone 

Death of little sister 
Francis 

May 27, 1863 

12 44 Henry 
Richards 

Eleanor 
Richards 

Regiment’s recent 
activities from Camp 
Drake 

June 3, 1863 

12 45 Henry 
Richards 

Eleanor 
Richards 

Regiment’s recent 
activities from Tullahoma 

July 4, 1863 

12 46 Henry 
Richards 

George 
Richards 

Regiment’s recent 
activities from 
Chattanooga 

October 14, 1863 

12 47 Henry 
Richards 

Adolph 
Gilbert 

Regiment’s recent 
activities from camp in the 
woods near Morriston 

March 13, 1864 

12 48 Warren 
Gilbert 

Adolph 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

March 14, 1866 

12 49 Rachel Warrie 
Richards 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

March 27, 1866 

12 50 Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

George 
Richards 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

April 15, 1866 

12 51 Adolph 
Gilbert 

Warrie 
Gilbert 

Meteorological records for 
the week ending April 29, 
1869; recent activities at 
school 

April 29, 1866 

12 52 Mary Eleanor Recent activities; news of May 12, 1866 
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Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

Hinman Richards acquaintances and family 

12 53 R. Spear Sister Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

July 15, 1867 

12 54 J.F.E. 
Krample 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Description of Ft. Harker September 19, 
1867 

12 55 Cousin 
Libbie 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

December 29, 1867 

12 56 Unknown Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities near 
Kansas City 

February 2, 1868 

12 57 Unknown Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

December 28, 1868 

12 58 L. Carpenter Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

May 28, 1873 

12 59 Sallie 
Hinman 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

July 18, 1873 

12 60 Clemma W. 
List 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

January 20, 1876 

12 61 Clemma W. 
List 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

December 14, 1877 

12 62 Nellie B. Friend Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

October 17, 1878 

12 63 J.R. Burch Brother and 
sister 

Financial matters April 24, 1893 

12 64 Harriet R. 
Andrew 

Adan 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

December 12, 1898 

12 65 Sallie 
Hinman 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
family and friends 

January 27 

12 66 Unknown Sister Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

February 25 

12 67 A.S. 
McClung 
and 
Clementina 

Mortimer A. 
Woodward 

Arrangement for a 
possible contingency, if 
stay should be used by Mr. 
Storms as a plea for 

July 22 
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Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

abusive language or 
employment of another 
person; advice regarding 
same 

12 68 Marian S. 
Livermore 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

August 17 

12 69 Martha 
Fiddlestick 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

August 23 

12 70 Charles 
Merrell 

Aunt Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

September 3 

12 71 Rachel Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities September 13 

12 72 N.M. Gulick Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

Undated 

12 73 John 
Bamford 

Elizabeth 
Richards 
Gilbert 

Thoughts of admiration Undated 

12 74 Mary 
Gilbert 

J. Coates Thoughts about family Undated 

12 75 Mary 
Richards 

Aunt Unable to accept 
invitation 

Undated 

12 76 C.H. 
Woodward 

George 
Richards 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

Undated 

12 77 Henry 
Richards 

Unknown Recent activities of 
regiment 

Undated 

12 78 Henry 
Richards 

Unknown Recent activities of 
regiment 

Undated 

12 79 H.E. 
Spencer 

Committee Asking Grade Committee 
for a re-advertisement for 
proposal for grading street 

Undated 

12 80 J.B. Wilson Unknown Father’s illness and 
increased duties; approval 
of draft and drawings 

Undated 

12 81 M. Mitchel S.P. Chase Request for man to work n 
Mt. Adams 

Undated 

12 82 Clem Cousin Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

Undated 

12 83 Maria L.H. Elizabeth Recent activities; news of Undated 
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Box Folder Author Recipient Subject Date 

Richards 
Gilbert 

acquaintances and family 

12 84 Clemma [Elizabeth 
Richards] 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

Undated 

12 85 Clemma [Elizabeth 
Richards] 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

Undated 

12 86 M. Gilbert William 
Crowe 

Recent activities; news of 
acquaintances and family 

Undated 

 

Series II: Manuscripts 
Subseries I: Colerain, Oxford and Brookville Turnpike 
 

Box Folder Title  Date 

12 87 Annual report of the Colerain, Oxford and Brookville 
Turnpike 

November 26, 1855 

12 88 Receipt for dividend of stock in the Colerain, Oxford 
Brookville Turnpike from James C. Ludlow and 
Josephine C. Ludlow 

January 27, 1852 

  
Series II: Manuscripts  
Subseries II: Giles Richards’ Papers Regarding Farmers’ College 
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

12 89 Subscription of Dayton Convention letter September 11, 
1840 

12 90 An Act to Establish Professorships in the Farmer’s 
College, Hamilton County, Ohio 

1846 

12 91 Invitation to Giles Richards to attend the quarterly 
meeting of directors of Farmers’ College on April 13, 
1850 

April 8, 1850 

12 92 Invitation to Giles Richards to attend meeting of the 
Board of Directors of Farmers’ College on June 20, 1856 

June 12, 1856 

12 93 Invitation to Giles Richards to attend meeting of the 
Board of Directors of Farmers’ College on August 23, 
1856 regarding filling vacancy after the resignation of 
President Allen 

August 13, 1856 

12 94 Invitation to Giles Richards to attend the inauguration 
of the Halls of Science at the Farmers’ College, October 
21, 1856 

October 13, 1856 

12 95 Invitation to Giles Richards to attend meeting of the 
Board of Directors of Farmers’ College on December 24, 
1856 

December 15, 1856 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

12 96 Notice of Farmers’ College Board of Directors meeting, 
January 14, 1863 

January 1863 

12 97 Notice placing Farmers’ College under the control of 
the legislature 

January 19, 1863 

12 98 Notice of Farmers’ College Board of Directors meeting 
on April 8, 1863 

April 1863 

12 99 Invitation to Giles Richards to attend Farmers’ College 
commencement and Board of Directors meeting on 
June 17, 1863 

June 10, 1863 

12 100 Notice of Farmers’ College Board of Directors meeting, 
October 14, [1863] 

Undated 

12 101 Report of committee on instruction at the Farmers 
College of Hamilton County 

Undated 

 
Series II: Manuscripts 
Subseries III: Cincinnati Western Railway 
 

Box Folder Title  Date 

12 102 Opinion in regard to a deed made by David Stone and 
Josiah Bellows to Timothy Goodman and Giles Richards 

August 9, 1821 

12 103 Rough draft of charter 1850 

12 104 Yeas and nays in council 1850 

12 105 Report and estimates of the Cincinnati Western 
Railroad via College Corner 

September 19, 
1850 

12 106 Petitions of citizens of Hamilton, Ohio for an act to 
incorporate the Western Railroad 

November 13, 1850 

12 107 Petition to legislature 1851 

12 108 Certificates of stock ownership in the Cincinnati 
Western Railroad Company 

June 10, 1853 

12 109 Notice for Giles Richards to appear at Common Pleas 
Court regarding survey and location of railroad from 
Cincinnati to College Corner 

November 14, 1864 

12 110 Cincinnati, Mount Airy, Venice & Liberty Railroad 
Company subscription 

Undated 

12 111 Memorandum to City Council Undated 

12 112 Proposed amendment to charter of Cincinnati & 
Western Railroad Company instead of last section 

Undated 

12 113 Amendment for Belpre Railroad Undated 

12 114 Western Railroad Company Undated 

12 115 Charter incorporating Cincinnati Western Railroad 
Company 

Undated 

12 116 Yeas and nays legislation  Undated 
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Box Folder Title  Date 

12 117 Mail lines Undated 

12 118 Supplementary act to charter Undated 

12 119 Draft of charter to incorporate the Cincinnati Western 
Railroad Company 

Undated 

12 120 Address to citizens of Cincinnati regarding Cincinnati 
Western Railway 

Undated 

12 121 Draft of section of charter regarding Cincinnati Western 
Railway 

Undated 

 
Series II: Manuscripts 
Subseries IV: Estate of Giles and Eleanor Richards 
  

Box Folder Title  Date 

12 122 Donations, Gifts &c. 1870-1874 

12 123 Memorandum of railroad bonds, stocks, notes 
receivable & when interest on same is due 

1874 

12 124 Power of Attorney February 11, 1874 

12 125 Schedule of property belonging to estate March 1876 

12 126 Account of A.W. Gilbert 1885 

12 127 Giles Richards’ last will and testament Undated 

12 128 Elmont plat map Undated 

12 129 Legacies under the will to be paid in currency Undated 

 
Series II: Manuscripts  
Subseries V: Colerain Cotton Mill  
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

12 130 Letter from Giles Thomson to Giles Richards regarding 
throttles 

May 19, 1836 

12 131 Account of yarn spun by W. Mitchell July 14, 1837 

12 132 Letter from Charles Richards to A.L. Whitesides 
regarding account 

November 13, 1838 

12 133 Agreement between Alexander McCrary and Charles 
Richards 

June 18, 1840 

12 134 Letter from Colerain Cotton Mill Co. to Commissioners 
of Hamilton County regarding damages to buildings 

August 7, 1840 

12 135 Letter from Charles Richards to Giles Richards regarding 
funds for fixing machines 

January 26, 1842 

12 136 Letter from Noon & Cropper to Giles Richards regarding 
offer of factory for sale 

February 6, 1856 

12 137 Letter from Charles Richards to Giles Richards regarding Undated 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

purchasing a napping machine 

12 138 Letter from J. Pinney to Giles Richards regarding 
settlement proposition 

Undated 

12 139 Sundry Persons to Carding Undated 

12 140 Miscellaneous figures Undated 

12 141 “Scrap Book Brings Memories of Old Cockefair Woolen 
Mill”  

Undated 

12 142 Figures for carding and fulling Undated 

12 143 Estimated cost of machinery sufficient to turn off 100 
yards of sattinett per day 

Undated 

12 144 Johnson carding at old mill Undated 

12 145 Massilon machinery prices Undated 

 
Series II: Manuscripts  
Subseries VI: Alfred W. Gilbert’s Documents Regarding Cincinnati Civil Engineers Office  
 

Box Folder Subject Date 

13 1 List of members of city council 1848-1849 

13 2 Certificate of election as City Surveyor February 22, 1849 

13 3 Articles of agreement for Covington and Lexington 
Railroad 

Ca. 1850-1859 

13 4 Yeas & Nays council resolution January 8, 1851 

13 5 Certificate of election as City Civil Engineer November 5, 1851 

13 6 Estimates for canal bridge February 1852 

13 7 Specifications for Everett St. Bridge February 1852 

13 8 Report of examination of N. Longworth’s culvert April 12, 1852 

13 9 Right of way through lands of James Findlay’s estate February 2, 1853 

13 10 Certificate of election of City Civil Engineer  April 7, 1853 

13 11 Payment to R.C. Phillips from city of Cincinnati November 9, 1853 

13 12 Transmittal of questions to City Civil Engineer December 10, 1853 

13 13 Request for estimate needed for department for 
January 1854 

December 21, 1853 

13 14 Request for estimate needed for department for 
February 1854 

January 19, 1854 

13 15 Estimate of Yost’s bid on Congress Street bridge April 12, 1854 

13 16 Charges of Yost & Gebhardt for stonework on Congress 
Street bridge 

October 9, 1854 

13 17 Specifications for regarding and McAdamizing portion 
of Cincinnati and Warsaw Turnpike Road 

Ca. 1856-1857 

13 18 Certificate and affirmation before mayor of election to 
office of City Civil Engineer 

April 1859 
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Box Folder Subject Date 

13 19 Specification and proposal to build sewers and drains Ca. 1860-1869 

13 20 Certificate and appearance before mayor of election to 
office of City Civil Engineer 

April 13, 1863 

13 21 Certificate of election as City Civil Engineer April 25, 1865 

13 22 Certificate and appearance before mayor of election to 
office of Engineer of Sewers 

June 1, 1870 

13 23 Stewarts survey Undated 

13 24 List of corrected levels erroneously taken by R.C. 
Phillips 

Undated 

13 25 Notes to Burgoyne tract – Clinton Undated 

13 26 Water works calculations Undated 

13 27 Estimate for stone work on Congress St. bridge Undated 

13 28 Sketch of Cincinnati and surrounding areas Undated 

13 29 Yeas & Nays Undated 

13 30 Notes on velocities Undated 

13 31 Patterns for brick for culverts Undated 

13 32 Specifications for lake tunnel Undated 

13 33 Calculation of masonry in Congress Street bridge put up 
by Yost & Gebhardt 

Undated 

13 34 Final estimate of work done by Yost & Gebhardt on 
repairs to Congress Street bridge 

Undated 

13 35 Contract prices for work on Congress Street bridge Undated 

13 36 Bill to provide for sewerage and drainage in cities of the 
first class having a population exceeding 100,000 

Undated 

13 37 Findlay Market House plan drawings Undated 

 
Series II: Manuscripts 
Subseries VII: Miscellaneous Documents 
 

Box Folder Title  Date 

13 38 “A Remarkable Passage” March 5, [1766] 

13 39 Testimony for meeting regarding Sarah Grubb February 13, 1791 

13 40 Receipt from John Andrews for Messrs. Bosson, 
Cowden & Co. 

September 1819 

13 41 Contract between Alice Royston and William East December 20, 1819 

13 42 Account with Dr. & Mrs. Royston and Few Ashmore & 
Hamilton 

1819-1822 

13 43 Joseph Gilbert’s diary of his travels in England 1823 

13 44 Appraisal of real estate belonging to Giles Richards February 19, 1824 

13 45 Diary entries of Mary Gilbert ca. 1830 

13 46 Receipt for John Woods’ payment to John McGonigle 1830 
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Box Folder Title  Date 

13 47 Account of Wallace Reform Mills 1831 

13 48 Notice of Joseph Gilbert’s appearance before a 
Kentucky magistrate 

1833 

13 49 Giles Richards’ receipt for shipping ten bushels of dried 
apples on the steamboat Superior 

June 15, 1836 

13 50 Mortgage from Joseph Gilbert to Marvin B. Street October 22, 1838 

13 51 Note from Joseph Gilbert to pay Marvin B. Street October 22, 1838 

13 52 Receipts for Marvin B. Street 1839-1842 

13 53 Charles Richards’ bill for McMillan & Partridge July 26, 1839 

13 54 Distribution of bank stock in the Ohio Insurance 
Company 

February 4, 1840 

13 55 Written at the Polls October 16, 1840 

13 56 Alfred W. Gilbert’s writing at Home Farm December 24, 1840 

13 57 Political Thoughts 1840 

13 58 Giles Richards’ receipt for payment to N.R. Morris March 3, 1841 

13 59 Alfred W. Gilbert’s essay on New Church ministers 1842-1843 

13 60 Act to amend act for regulation of turnpike companies March 11, 1843 

13 61 A.W. Gilbert’s thoughts about the past year December 24, 1843 

13 62 Certificate for share in Cincinnati Astronomical Society August 12, 1847 

13 63 Prospectus for publishing a map of Hamilton County, 
Ohio 

November 1847 

13 64 Ordinance creating office of City Civil Engineer March 17, 1848 

13 65 Agreement between Giles Richards and Samuel Dick for 
half of lot in Fairfield Township 

January 22, 1849 

13 66 Recommendation for A.W. Gilbert February 2, 1849 

13 67 Deed from Samuel Dick to Giles Richards February 12, 1849 

13 68 Copy of Joseph Gilbert’s Last Will and Testament October 17, 1850 

13 69 A.W. Gilbert’s receipts and bills 1851-1899 

13 70 Hungarian Fund certificate February 2, 1852 

13 71 Agreement between Alfred W. Gilbert and Joseph 
Gilbert (brother) regarding Joseph Gilbert’s will  

February 21, 1852 

13 72 Appraisal of Joseph Gilbert’s farm  March 24, 1852 

13 73 Letter from Giles Richards to Colerain Township 
trustees regarding tax on opening and grading a new 
road  

April 3, 1852 

13 74 Stock share certificate for the Grass Valley Gold Mining 
Company, Centreville, California 

August 20, 1852 

13 75 Certificate from Farmers’ College for one five-year’s 
scholarship 

October 26, 1852 

13 76 Agreement between Alfred W. Gilbert and Thomas 
Gilbert regarding Joseph Gilbert’s will 

November 1852 
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Box Folder Title  Date 

13 77 Abstract of prices for work on Findlay Market House February 1854 

13 78 Statement of settlement of accounts between Alfred 
W. Gilbert and Charles Gilbert regarding Joseph 
Gilbert’s will 

July 28, 1855 

13 79 Toll Gate No. 4 March 8, 1856 

13 80 Mortgage from Henry Richards to Giles Richards April 3, 1856 

13 81 Loan of Henry Gilbert’s share of Joseph Gilbert’s estate June 30, 1859 

13 82 Resolution of thanks to A.W. Gilbert on addition to City 
Hall and fitting of Council champber 

December 13, 1860 

13 83 Inventory of effects of City Civil Engineer’s Office April 8, 1861 

13 84 Elland I Know June-July 1861 

13 85 Alfred W. Gilbert’s appointment as Colonel of the 39th 
Ohio Volunteer Infantry 

July 11, 1862 

13 86 Alfred W. Gilbert’s receipt for ordnance, 39th Ohio 
Volunteer Infantry 

July 26, 1862 

13 87 Inventory of books and instruments in City Civil 
Engineer’s Office 

April 7, 1863 

13 88 Notice to negroes living on Thomas Burns’ farm September 2, 1863 

13 89 Magnolia Insurance Co. notice of policy expiration 1863 

13 90 Tax receipts for property in Colerain Township 1863-1864 

13 91 List of grapes consigned by Giles Richards 1864 

13 92 A. Benzing’s bill to Giles Richards March 5, 1864 

13 93 Estimate of probable quantities of material in the main 
sewer to be built in Eggleston Avenue 

May 10, 1864 

13 94 Receipt for investment in Ohio Female College June 1864 

13 95 Giles Richards’ receipt from the Aetna Insurance 
Company 

June 3, 1864 

13 96 Giles Richards’ receipt from R.M. Bishop & Co., grocers June 14, 1864 

13 97 Sales of notes for Giles Richards June 15, 1864 

13 98 Giles Richards’ receipt for payment to G. Frederick 
Schneider 

June 18, 1864 

13 99 Giles Richards’ receipt of cow from Mrs Jesse M. 
Sullivan  

August 29, 1864 

13 100 Giles Richards’ receipt from the New Jerusalem 
Messenger 

September 1864 

13 101 Diary of unknown person September 18, 
1864-October 2, 
1867 

13 102 Giles Richards’ receipt for payment to Henry C. 
Bevington 

October 6, 1864 

13 103 Giles Richards’ receipt for barley and oats October 28, 1864 
and November 30, 
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Box Folder Title  Date 

1864 

13 104 Giles Richards’ receipt from A.M. Cleaster November 1864 

13 105 Giles Richards’ receipt from Catharine Parker November 3, 1864 

13 106 Miscellaneous documents regarding real property 1864, undated 

13 107 Miscellaneous receipts, bills and accounts for A.W. 
Gilbert 

1864-1889 

13 108 Alfred W. Gilbert’s appointment as Lieutenant Colonel 
of the 39th Ohio Volunteer Infantry 

August 28, 1865 

13 109 Check for cash from Lafayette Bank to Alfred W. Gilbert October 17, 1865 

13 110 Elland For Sale description January 7, 1866 

13 111 George Richards’ certificate of membership in the 
Farmers’ Lodge 

April 3, 1880 

13 112 Receipts for Colerain-Oxford-Brookville Turnpike Co. 1880-1883 

13 113 Receipts for Anson & Son, Millcreek Coal Yard 1881 

13 114 Statement of Albert Stubert in account with Alfred W. 
Gilbert 

September 3, 1883 

13 115 Loans February-August 
1887 

13 116 Loan of Henry Gilbert’s share of Joseph Gilbert’s estate July 1887 

13 117 Bond between John Gilbert and Alfred W. Gilbert for 
$500 

August 17, 1887 

13 118 Statement of Series C January 31, 1893 

13 119 Typescript of “Travel Pay In Case of an Officer 
Wounded in Battle After Tendering His Resignation” 

December 2, 1897 

13 120 Ophia Smith’s notes on Gilbert and Richards family 
history 

1936-1937, 
undated 

13 121 “Kentucky in the Years 1775 + 1776” Undated 

13 122 Miscellaneous manuscript fragments Undated 

13 123 “A Letter from a Quaker to a Watchmaker” Undated 

13 124 Description of deed from J. Williams to Giles Richards Undated 

14 1 Notes regarding bonds issued by city Undated 

14 2 Note regarding Sally’s baggage Undated 

14 3 Knitting instructions Undated 

14 4 Resolution of board to establish military education Undated 

14 5 Notes regarding college business affairs Undated 

14 6 Poetry fragments  Undated 

14 7 Receipt of payment for bushels  Undated 

14 8 “The New Church,” an essay written for the Licking 
Valley Register 

Undated 

14 9 Address to citizens of Colerain Township regarding next 
presidential election 

Undated 
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Box Folder Title  Date 

14 10 Certification of Colerain Mills Co. to pay Hiram Ogden 
for spinning woolen yarn 

Undated 

14 11 Estimated cost of machinery and building, sufficient to 
turn off 100 yards sattinett per day 

Undated 

14 12 Account as guardianship for Benjamin Bridge, Butler 
County Probate Court 

Undated 

14 13 Motion to strike out Undated 

14 14 Draft of charter Undated 

14 15 Miscellaneous fragments of A.W. Gilbert’s 
correspondence 

Undated 

14 16 Essays on religion Undated 

14 17 Notes by Adolph Gilbert on Richards and Gilbert family 
history 

Undated 

14 18 Abstracts of Hamilton County land titles Undated 

14 19 Miscellaneous essays and poetry/prose copied by A.W. 
Gilbert 

Undated 

14 20 Meeting in Venice Undated 

14 21 Description of Joseph Gilbert’s trip to Iowa in 1841 Undated 

14 22 Miscellaneous inventories for Joseph Gilbert’s estate Undated 

14 23 Various Civil War reminiscences of A.W. Gilbert Undated 

14 24 A.W. Gilbert’s draft of his obituary Undated 

14 25 Remarks about the Sulphur Spring House Undated 

14 26 Description of deed from J. Williams to Giles Richards Undated 

14 27 Amounts for lots Undated 

14 28 List of Company F Undated 

14 29 Financial information regarding C. L. Woodward Undated 

 
Series II: Manuscripts 
Subseries VIII: Drawings of Land Plats   
 

Box Folder Title  Date 

14 30 Plat of a subdivision of lands situated on the west side 
of Ohio Avenue south of McMillan Street belonging to 
the estate of John Smith deceased, made by R.C. 
Phillips, surveyor 

December 2, 1863 

14 31 Plat map for Elmont, situated in the northern part of 
Cincinnati 

Undated 

14 32 Plat map for unidentified area Undated 

14 33 Plat of survey in sections 13 & 14 T.I.R. 2 between 
Miami Rivers 

Undated 

14 34 Plat of land near Cheviot, about five miles from Undated 
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Box Folder Title  Date 

Cincinnati, on the Harrison Turnpike, for sale by Chase 
& Ball 

 
Series II: Manuscripts 
Subseries IX: Drawings and Photographs   
 

Box Folder Title  Date 

14 35 Survey report for Cooper farm June 5, 1845 

14 36 Parlor at Elland June 6, 1886 

14 37 Drawing titled “Hunter” Undated 

14 38 Miscellaneous photographs Undated 

14 39 Alfred W. Gilbert’s sketches of 39th Ohio Volunteer 
Infantry encampments 

Undated 

14 40 Sketch of Elland fence improvements Undated 

 
Series II: Manuscripts  
Subseries X: Diaries of Alfred W. Gilbert 
 

Box Folder Title  Date 

14 41 Lecture on the genius and writings of Shakespeare June 1844 

14 42 Alfred W. Gilbert’s Diary July 30, 1860-June 
6, 1868 

14 43 Diary of Events at Elland Farm from June 8, 1868 to 
January 8, 1871 

June 8, 1868-
January 8, 1871 

14 44 Writings of Alfred W. Gilbert including his memoirs 
from 1835 to 1870 

1870 

15 1 Copies of letters sent 1878-1900 

15 2 Diary of Events at Elland 1888 October 30, 1888-
December 19, 1889 

15 3 Alfred W. Gilbert’s Diary January 1, 1890-
July 16, 1891 

15 4 Alfred W. Gilbert’s Diary November 17, 
1890-October 4, 
1891 

15 5 Alfred W. Gilbert’s Diary October 5, 1891-
October 31, 1892 

15 6 Alfred W. Gilbert’s Diary November 1, 1892-
January 31, 1894 

15 7 Alfred W. Gilbert’s Diary February 1, 1894-
October 7, 1894 

15 8 Alfred W. Gilbert’s Diary October 8, 1894-
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Box Folder Title  Date 

October 14, 1895 

15 9 Alfred W. Gilbert’s Diary October 18, 1895-
April 1, 1897 

15 10 Alfred W. Gilbert’s Diary April 1, 1897-
February 28, 1899 

 
Series II: Manuscripts  
Subseries XI: Account Books 
 

Box Folder Title  Date 

15 11 Sales record book 1820-1831 

15 12 Colerain Cotton Mill account book 1827-1835 

15 13 Elland Farm expense journal 1829-1832 

15 14 Account of tolls collected on the Colerain, Oxford and 
Brookville Turnpike 

1832-1842 

15 15 Account of tolls collected on the Colerain, Oxford and 
Brookville Turnpike 

1840-1850 

15 16 Great Miami Turnpike Company receipt book 1842 

15 17 Great Miami Turnpike Company receipt book November 30, 
1843-May 31, 1846 

16 1 Great Miami Turnpike Company ledger 1843-1849 

16 2 Turnpike construction estimates 1846-1867 

16 3 Cash book 1850-1865 

16 4 Account book 1862-1863 

16 5 Account book 1871-1872 

16 6 Ledger 1872-1879 

16 7 Ledger 1872-1881 

16 8 Ledger 1872-1885 

16 9 Ledger 1874-1900 

16 10 Cash book 1879-1885 

16 11 Elland Farm expense journal 1886-1896 

16 12 Accounts of a Cincinnati merchant Undated 

 
Series III: Printed Material    
 

Box Folder Title  Date 

16 13 Fifth Annual Catalogue of the Pleasant Hill Academy, 
Hamilton County, Ohio, February 1839 (Cincinnati: R.P. 
Brooks, 1839) 

1839 

16 14 Circular providing notification of May 1841 convention 
of  The Receivers of the New Jerusalem Doctrines 

March 1841 
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Box Folder Title  Date 

16 15 Scrapbook 1845 

16 16 Boynton, Charles B. Dignity of Labor: An Address, 
Delivered Before the Philomathian Society of Farmers’ 
College, Hamilton County, Ohio, March 24, 1847 
(Cincinnati: William H. Moore & Co., 1847)  

1847 

16 17 “Circular of the American Swedenborg Printing and 
Publishing Society to the Members and Friends of the 
New Jerusalem Church throughout the United States” 

Ca. 1850 

16 18 Richards, Giles.  A Plea for the Farmers’ College of 
Hamilton County, Ohio, and for Reformation in 
Collegiate Instruction; Being a Report to That 
Institution, Made July 17, 1850 (Cincinnati: Ben Franklin 
Printing House, 1850) 

1850 

16 19 “Schedule and Specifications, showing the amount of 
work, and the manner in which it is to be done, upon 
each Section on the Delhi, Industry, and Miami 
Turnpike Road” 

June 1850 

16 20 “To the People of Cincinnati,” regarding the Western 
Railroad 

September 18, 
1850 

16 21 Appeal Made to the Citizens of Cincinnati by the Board 
of Directors of the Four Mile Valley Railroad Company 

October 2, 1851 

16 22 Artists’ Union of Cincinnati November 1851 

16 23 American Art-Union circular January 2, 1852 

16 24 Third Annual Catalogue of the Officers and Students of 
the Ohio Female College, College Hill, Hamilton Co., O. 
for the Academic Year Ending July 15, 1852 (Cincinnati: 
Ben Franklin Book and Job Office, 1852) 

1852 

16 25 Fourth Annual Catalogue of the Officers and Students 
of the Ohio Female College, College Hill, Hamilton Co., 
O. for the Academic Year Ending June 16, 1853 
(Cincinnati: Ben Franklin Book and Job Office, 1853) 

1853 

16 26 Allen, Isaac J.  Inaugural Address Delivered at Farmers’ 
College, Commencement Day, June 7th, 1854. 
Cincinnati: Ben Franklin Mammoth Steam Printing 
Establishment, 1854. 

1854 

16 27 Fifth Annual Catalogue of the Officers and Students of 
the Ohio Female College, College Hill, Hamilton Co., O. 
for the Academic Year Ending June 15, 1854 (Cincinnati: 
Ben Franklin Book and Job Office, 1854) 

1854 

16 28 Catalogue of the Officers and Students of Farmers’ 
College: 1853-4 (Cincinnati: Ben Franklin Book and Job 
Office, 1854) 

1854 



Gilbert-Richards Papers 
Page 131 

 

Box Folder Title  Date 

16 29 First Annual Catalogue of the American Female College, 
Glendale, Hamilton Co., O., for the Academic Year, 
Ending June 28, 1855 (Cincinnati: Ben Franklin Book & 
Job Office, 1855) 

1855 

16 30 “Circular to All Persons Interested in the Writings of 
Swedenborg” 

February 5, 1855 

16 31 Prospectus for adoption of preamble and resolution at 
the session of the General Convention of the New 
Jerusalem Church in June 1853 

May 1, 1855 

16 32 Circular titled “A Few Words to the Friends of the 
Herald” 

October 12, 1855 

16 33 Circular from Sabin Hough and George Bush regarding 
urgency of applications for extra aid to patrons of a 
periodical 

November 13, 1856 

16 34 Program from the Glendale Female College 
commencement exercises, June 25, 1857 

1857 

16 35 The Twelfth Annual Catalogue and Prospectus of the 
Ohio Female College at College Hill, Hamilton Co., Ohio, 
1861 (Cincinnati: Franklin Type and Stereotype 
Foundry, 1861) 

1861 

16 36 Notice to subscribers to the Atlantic Monthly December 1, 1862 

16 37 Circular titled “To the Stockholders of the Little Miami 
and Columbus & Xenia Railroad Companies” 

October 1863 

16 38 Circular regarding the “Merchandise and Donation 
Committee” being ready to receive contributions of 
articles for sale at the Great Western Sanitary Fair for 
the benefit of the Cincinnati Branch of the U.S. Sanitary 
Commission 

November 27, 1863 

16 39 Circular titled “Great Western Sanitary Fair 
Refreshment Hall” 

December 15, 1863 

16 40 Circular titled “Great Western Sanitary Fair Committee 
Room of Art Union, Gallery of Paintings, Music and 
Decorations” 

December 1863 

16 41 Circular titled “Great Western Sanitary Fair Circular of 
the Committee on War Memorials, Relics and 
Curiosities” 

December 1863 

16 42 Advertisement for pens manufactured by George F. 
Hawkes 

January 1864 

16 43 Circular titled “To the Water Supply Commission of 
Cincinnati” 

November 3, 1864 

16 44 Advertisement for pens manufactured by E.S. Johnson 1864 

16 45 Notice of sale of Alfred W. Gilbert’s Ohio Avenue May 19, 1869 
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property  

16 46 Circular titled “Christmas Exercises of the Congregation 
and Sunday School in New Church Temple, Wednesday, 
December 25th, 1872” 

1872 

16 47 Twenty-Third Catalogue of the Officers and Students of 
Farmers’ College for 1877 (Cincinnati: A.H. Pounsford & 
Co., 1877) 

1877 

16 48 Twenty-Fourth Catalogue of the Officers and Students 
of Farmers’ College for 1878 (Cincinnati: Elm Street 
Printing Company, 1878) 

1878 

16 49 Richards, Henry.  Letters of Captain Henry Richards of 
the Ninety-Third Ohio Infantry.  Cincinnati, Ohio: Press 
of Wrightson & Company, 1883 

1883 

16 50 The El Dorado Gas & Electric Light Company Prospectus ca. 1892-1899 

16 51 Tax Rates for 1893 December 1893 

16 52 Invitation to marriage of Nellie C. Davis and John C. 
Short, July 8, 1897 

1897 

16 53 “The Hamilton Garden Club,” by Alta Harvey Heiser, 
Hamilton Daily News, May 25, 1935 

1935 

16 54 Prospectus from George Bush, editor of the “New 
Church Repository,” for publishing a volume of 
miscellanies  

Undated 

16 55 Circular titled “Subscriptions to the U.S. 5-20 Year 
Bonds, and Money Contributions to the Great Western 
Sanitary Fair” 

Undated 

16 56 Printed copies of poem titled “Their Mother” Undated 

16 57 Miscellaneous newspaper clippings Undated 

16 58 American New Church Tract and Missionary Society 
Constitution 

Undated 

 
 
 


